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were built before the rezon-
ing. The variance being
requested by the Rands at
this ZBA meeting is a result
of the couple wanting to
build a new house on that
property.

Kevin Coyle represented
the Rands for their variance
request to the Zoning Board
for their considerations. Mr.
Rand was also present to
support Coyle to outline the
specifics of their Zoning
Board request. 

Coyle started by provid-
ing the board with an
overview of the Rand’s vari-
ance request application.

For a variance to be
granted, a requester must
support 5 conditions out-
lined in the Town’s variance
application; (1) the value of
the surrounding properties
will not be adversely affect-

ed, (2) the granting of a vari-
ance would be in the public
interest and provide a bene-
fit to the community, (3) a
hardship must exist which is
inherent in the property/land
in question, (4) an applicant
must prove that by granting
the variance, substantial jus-
tice will be done and any
loss to the individual that is
not outweighed by a gain to
the general public is an
injustice, and finally (5) the
use of the variance must not
be contrary to the spirit and
intent of the zoning ordi-
nance. Derry’s Zoning ordi-
nance was established to
promote the “health, safety,
and general welfare of the
community.”

Coyle outline the appli-
cation answers for the 5
points and then pointed out

Zoning Approves Variance
for Chester Road Property

MACK LEATHURBY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

The Rand Family has
lived in Derry for 80 years
and on a property located on
Chester Road for 66 years.
Richard and Doris Rand
have recently put together
new plans for building on
the lot that would require a
variance from the Zoning
Board of Authority (ZBA).

In the 1990s this proper-
ty was subdivided into mul-
tiple lots, though the Rands
decided to keep a 2.25-acre
portion of the lot at that
time, which included their
current home. However,
after that date, the area was
rezoned for homes of a
three-acre lot zoning size,
despite that many of the sur-
rounding properties are also
less than three acres, as they

continued on page 3

out that with the Public Arts
Committee now a part of the
GDAC organization, the
committee can proactively
raise funds by seeking dona-
tions and grants. Gendron
says, “We’re extremely
excited that Public Arts
Committee is now a part of
GDAC and they are able to
take advantage of our non-
profit status.”

The GDAC manages the
Derry Opera House and has
focused attention primarily
on performing arts, and as
Gendron points out, “The
Public Arts Committee can
be instrumental in providing
new and exciting avenues of
artistic expression.”

Donovan says, “We want
to promote a variety of cul-
tural events and creative arts

in Derry to help connect dif-
ferent kinds of arts and we
believe that will help stimu-
late the Town’s economy.
Supporting the creative
experience in Derry is also
an exciting way to help us
differentiate the community
and connect creative talent
in the Greater Derry Area.
Public arts are a great way to
help vitalize our Town.”

Over this past year, the
committee has put together
multiple projects, including
the new historically themed
mural located on the wall at
Cask and Vine on Broad-
way.  They also organized a
Pop Up Artist Show, at a
vacant commercial space at
Hood Commons, where
local artists displayed work.

Arts Council Gaining Grants,
Add Artistic Vitality to Derry

MACK LEATHURBY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

Earlier this year, the
Public Arts Committee in
Derry was integrated into
the Greater Derry Arts
Council (GDAC). Beverly
Donovan has a spearhead for
this public arts group since
it’s start in 2018, as an ad
hoc get-together to assess
interest in public arts proj-
ects in the area. Donovan is
well suited for this role, as
she is also Derry’s Econom-
ic Development Director, so
she is connecting creative
arts and cultural events in
ways that can also attract
appropriate economic evolu-
tion for Derry.

Mike Gendron, Presi-
dent of GDAC has pointed

each and the event is hap-
pening at Sabatino’s North
in downtown Derry, N.H.

Fragile X Syndrome is
not something that is famil-
iar to many people. Howev-
er, it is the most common
known genetic cause of
intellectual impairment and
autism. The gene that causes

this syndrome was only just
discovered in 1991.

Darlene Donovan, of
Derry, N.H., along with her
husband, Pat Donovan, are
the organizers of this special
event. Donovan said that,
“On Nov. 20, 2013, her first
and only grandchild was

Fragile X Awareness Jam
Will Be on Monday, July 22

MARTHA SMITH
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

On July 22 from 4 - 8
p.m. come out and enjoy a
summer evening of fun, din-
ner, music, raffles and a
silent auction all to benefit
finding a cure for Fragile X
syndrome. Tickets are $20

Sea Science Alyson DeMerchant of the Seacoast Science Center
shows Jake and Olivia Hamilton a lobster during her visit to Don Ball Park last week.
The event was part of the Derry Parks and Recreation Summer Events at the
Humphrey Road Park. Kids got to see a variety of undersea creatures that afternoon.
See more photos on page 8. Photo by Chris Paul
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24 Hour Quotes at www.whittemoreins.com
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6
• 8’x12’ kitchen 
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• Crown molding
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• Delivery & Installation 
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Complete veterinary services for dogs, 
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Derry, NH

432-1404

New Clients Welcome!
Visit us at handelwithcarevet.com for

special offers

VETERINARY HOSPITAL. LLC

MACK LEATHURBY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

Derry has accelerated a
friendly arts environment
including the creation of a
new cultural district this
year. There have been quite
a few visual and perform-
ing arts projects worth
checking out and Derry has
some of the best venues in
N.H. for performing arts
with the Derry Opera
House, the Stockbridge
Theatre at Pinkerton, and
the Tupelo Music Hall.

The Greater Derry Arts
Council and Public Arts
Committee have stepped
up to provide support for
historic mural paintings,
the Nutfield 300th Gala
and musicals, including
this week’s Jekyll and
Hyde, as well as, the
upcoming Kids Coop The-
atre production of Foot-
loose, which will be staged
at the Derry Opera House.
We even have the Derry
Homegrown Farm and
Artisan Market that Yankee
Magazine calls the best in
N.H.

So, in celebration of
Greater Derry arts, we are
spotlighting community
artists to recognize them
for their talents and sup-
port of the arts in Derry.
Our first spotlight is on
Wendy Wetherbee, who is
also one of the Derry
Homegrown organizers.

Wendy Wetherbee is an

Nature themes run
through many of Wether-
bee’s pieces - feathers,
ravens, owls, fish, turtles,
coyotes, and dragonflies.
She often works in themes
she personally observes
and photographs - while
hiking beautiful spots here
in Derry. She shoots photos
almost daily, and the
images captured are often a
reference for her media
and metal work; her photo-
graphs capture her view of
the world and stand alone
as art works, as well. From
her photography work one
can appreciate she is a keen
life observer with her own
artistic view. 

“We have so much
wildlife here in Derry.
Within a 3-mile radius of
my home, I have seen
eagles, osprey, gray fox,

Derry Artist Ties Craftsmanship and Community Together to Make Art Accessible

red fox, coyote, several
species of owls, at least 50
species of songbirds,
waterfowl, raccoons, por-
cupines, fishers, deer, otter,
the list goes on. You don’t
need to go far to see natural
beauty, you just need to
tune into it.”

Last year, one of her
photographs was published
in National Wildlife Maga-
zine, a publication that she
has read since childhood.
The photo chosen was pho-
tographed in her Derry
backyard.

Wendy comes by her
talent and love of nature
genuinely, as she was born
into a family peppered with
artists (mother), musicians
(sister and son), entrepre-
neurs and even farmers,
many of which had a
strong connection to the

natural world.
“No matter what medi-

um I work in, wildlife and
special places of New
Hampshire, are featured in
my work, because it’s my
own personal habitat, and a
large part of who I am. My
time outdoors, is what
charges my batteries and
keeps me whole. Making
art is my way of giving
back for the peace I get
from that time. My hope is
that my connection to the
earth comes through in my
art and inspires others to
feel their own connection
to the natural world around
them.”

Wendy is also founder
of Wetherbee Creative,
located in Derry. Along
with her husband Neil,
they provide design and
marketing services to
clients near and far. And as
Board members of Derry
Homegrown, the team
works on a Pro Bono basis
creating the marketing
materials, signage and

advertising needed to keep
the farmers’ market going
each season. The Wether-
bees also use Derry Home-
grown as platform to inject
the arts into the community
by ensuring the market has
live music and a visual
artist demonstration every
week. 

“It is so important peo-
ple know artists are alive
and well here in Derry.
There are so many amazing
things here right now, as
people are doing great
things to make art accessi-
ble here to everyone, and I
am very dedicated to mak-
ing sure I am part of mak-
ing that happen.”

Wendy’s work can be
found in these League gal-
leries: Hanover, Meredith,
Nashua, North Conway,
and: Exeter Fine Crafts,
Plumb Gallery, Ashland,
NH and SEH Studios,
Dover, NH. Contact her at
wendy@wetherbeecreative
.com or at www.puredi-
chotomy.com

artist and designer who
lives and works in Derry.
She’s a Tufts graduate and
a graduate of the School of
the Museum of Fine Arts in
Boston, where her focus of
study included photogra-
phy.  Today she works as a
painter, photographer and a
metalsmith. Her metal-
smith work has brought her
statewide recognition
aligning her with the pres-
tigious League of NH
Craftsmen. Wetherbee
juried in as a full member
of the League in the area of
Jewelry metals on her first
try last October. 

Wetherbee said, “Being
a member of the League
was a goal so precious to
me that I almost never said
it out loud. I used to attend
the Sunapee Craftsman
Fair with my grandparents
as a child. My grandfather
was a metalsmith and as a
kid I watched him solder as
well as craft giant copper
flowers for my grandmoth-
er and that’s what started
my fascination working
with metal. They instilled
in me a reverence for fine
craft. It took my husband
and fellow League artist,
Mike Gibbons, of Nutfield
Pottery of Derry, years to
finally push me hard
enough to make the
appointment to jury. When
I was accepted, I was
shocked, and it took me
weeks to stop pinching
myself.”

Derry’s Wendy Wetherbee has been recognized by the N.H. League of Craftsmen for her Jewelry metals above
is an example of her work titled ‘Change is Beautiful Butterfly Medallion.’ Courtesy photos
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35 Manchester Road, Derry

ROMANO’S PIZZA
OF DERRY
434-6500

Check Us Out Online!
www.romanospizzaderry.com

NOW HIRING!
Cooks, Delivery Drivers 

& Counter Help

DUROCHER FARM

OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK FROM 7AM - 2PM
TUES. AND THURS. EVENINGS 5 - 7:30PM

PICK YOUR OWN
BLUEBERRIES

157 Charles Bancroft Hwy
(Rte 3A) Litchfield, NH • 494-8364

www.pickyourownberries.com

rable experience. The proj-
ect will also likely add his-
torical sign markers that fit
within in the scenic trail area
related to Derry history or
town facts.

This concept is a bit like
an updated experience that
highway drivers had years
ago from the Burma Shave
Company. That company
put small signage along U.S.
highways with interesting
poetic messages instead of
hard advertising. Burma
Shave messages were enjoy-
able to read as America’s
highway system grew. The
company posted 5 or 6 signs
with simple poetic and high-
way safety messages such as
a parody of Longfellow’s
Paul Revere’s Ride - “Hard-
ly a driver / Is now alive /
Who passed / On hills / At
75 / Burma-Shave”.

Since the Public Arts
Committee is part of the
nonprofit GDAC, they can
take advantage of NHCDFA
grants (N.H. Community
Development Finance
Authority). NHCDFA has
played a role in financing
important, recognizable
projects in New Hampshire
including the Capitol Center

for the Arts, Canterbury
Shaker Village center,
Strawberry Banke center,
the Keene Downtown Revi-
talization project and more.

Last year NHCDFA
awarded more than $4 mil-
lion in tax credits to nonprof-
its throughout New Hamp-
shire. Funds from NHCDFA
have impact on initiatives
that advance local communi-
ty economic development
goals, the New Hampshire
nonprofit ecosystem and
provide technical assistance
for economic development
across the state.

The Public Arts Com-
mittee can also leverage
sponsorships within
501(c)(3) guidelines. There
are distinct provisions,
unique to Section 501(c)(3)
organizations, as compared
with other tax-exempt enti-
ties. For example, there can
be deductions used by
donors who make contribu-
tions to 501(c)(3) organiza-
tions for federal income tax

Arts
continued from page 1

The event attracted about
200 people. 

Recently Donovan and
the Public Arts Committee
team began working on a
project for the town that has
Donovan developing addi-
tional grant funding propos-
als. Donovan had an idea -
which she has further devel-
oped with committee mem-
bers — to have poetry word-
ing imprinted artistically
and clearly across the pave-
ments of the rail trail. As fit-
ting for our town, this proj-
ect will likely include poetry
from Derry’s most famous
poet, Robert Frost.

The idea is to provide a
rolling pavement poetry
experience for rail trail
users, where they can read
several poetry lines at a
time, as they walk or bike
through the rail trail and
move on to find more of the
poem. Donovan points out
that the project concept is to
combine sports, healthy
activities, fitness, outdoors,
and the natural scenery of
the rail trail into a memo-

purposes.
The Public Arts Com-

mittee is also helping devel-
op a professional video
about the Town. This video
has been recently recorded
at over 60 different sites
around Greater Derry.
Donovan and Public Arts
committee members -
including Derry TV Leader,
Owen Provencher, have
developed messaging to
highlight unique characteris-
tics of Derry. While this
video project is a work in
progress, the committee will
soon see drafts for feedback.
Donovan says the video con-
tent themes will primarily
center on Derry’s recreation-
al sites and actions, business
and employment opportuni-
ties and historical/cultural
attractions.

“Arts and culture is the
heartbeat of any communi-
ty,” Committee member
Provencher said. And we
have a strong heartbeat
developing in Derry.

MACK LEATHURBY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

Now’s a good time to
sharpen your creative abili-
ties, as the dates are fast
approaching for Greater
Derry’s Got Talent. The
main competition will take
place on Sept. 15 and the
audition dates are fast
approaching.

The Greater Derry Arts
Council is looking for tal-
ented performers, including
musicians, dancers, singers,
poets, baton twirlers, jug-
glers, magicians, contortion-
ists, circus performers,

comedians, multimedia-the-
atrical artists and more to be
recognized at this year’s
competition.

This talent event has got-
ten bigger and better than
ever - with exciting new
changes this year. The finals
will now be held one day
only, Sunday Sept.15 at 1
p.m. There is no longer a
residency restriction, so any-
one from anywhere can now
perform! And for this year,
there will be no duplicate
songs performed in the audi-
tions or main event.

First and second place
winners will be selected in 2

categories by a panel of
judges. The “Adult” catego-
ry is for 16 years old and
over, and the “Youth” cate-
gory is 15 years old and
under. An additional winner
will also be selected by
audience votes!

All winners earn cash
prizes and will be invited to
perform at Derryfest on Sat-
urday Sept. 21 at MacGre-
gor Park in Derry, N.H. right
on the main stage! This is
your shot to gain fame for
showing off your creative
side - so, if you are talented
or think you are talented,
this event is a time to

express yourself or to put on
a show.

If you are interested in
performing, the starting
point is to register for an
audition. Requests for audi-
tions are on a first come,
first served basis. Acts no
longer may perform the
same songs as other acts, so
register early and choose
your material wisely. Since
the competition can only
accept a limited number of
acts, it also makes sense to
sign up early and submit the
entry fee to get your pre-
ferred song selection and
audition time locked in as

soon as possible.
Auditions for the main

event that will be held on
two dates:

Tuesday - Aug. 27, from
6 - 8 p.m.

Wednesday - Aug. 28,
from 6 - 8 p.m.

Auditions will be sched-
uled every 10 minutes from
6 - 8 p.m. Please arrive early
for your audition time to
keep things on schedule. If
you are going to be late for
your audition time slot, let
the organizers know asap by
sending an email via the
website email setup. These
auditions will be held at
Dance Progressions, 109
Hillside Ave., Londonderry.

A non-refundable entry
fee of $20 per person is
required to get in the game.
This fee is per performer,
not per act - though the fee is
capped at $60 per act, so if
you have more than 3 per-
formers in a single act, you
will not have to pay the
entry fee for the additional
members. The entry fee will
be returned if for some rea-
son you are not selected to
perform in the preliminary
round. Once you are granted
a spot in the competition,
there will be no refund.

If you have further ques-
tions you can contact the
Greater Derry’s Got Talent
organizers at (603) 437-
0505 or by email at the
address found on the contest
information link page at the
end of this article. Be pre-
pared to provide your name,
contact information and the
best time, when you can be

Time to Get Your Act to Together for Greater Derry’s Got Talent
contacted, so the organizers
can get back to you.

Since competitors are not
allowed to perform songs
that duplicate songs used by
others, you will want to
secure the song you want to
use by submitting your audi-
tion application as soon as
possible. Your song selection
is not guaranteed until the
organizers receive your entry
fee. If you do request a song
already been chosen, the
organizers will notify you -
so make sure your correct
contact information is prop-
erly registered.

While all previous First-
Place Greater Derry’s Got
Talent winners are not eligi-
ble to compete, they are wel-
comed as guest performers
at Greater Derry’s Got Tal-
ent. Let the organizers know
if you are available, as they
would love to see you per-
form again!

Greater Derry’s Got Tal-
ent (GDGT) and Derryfest
are productions of the
Greater Derry Arts Council.
Proceeds from GDGT and
Derryfest benefit the Greater
Derry Arts Council’s efforts
to support the arts in our
communities, as well as the
Derry Opera House.

If you want to show off
your stuff, why not sign up
today to audition? Auditions
are by appointment only so
visit the Derryarts.org web-
site to sign up: www.der-
ryarts.org/greater-derrys-
got-talent/

Come join the fun and
help support the arts at the
same time.
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How many of us find ourselves irri-
tated or offended by comments on Face-
book or other social media sites? It’s
important to be in the know about big
traffic jams on I-93, sightings of multi-
ple emergency vehicles, school buses
stopped on the side of the road, and icy
road conditions during the winter. How-
ever, this information is often followed
by rumors, half-truths, and anonymous
comments. Sometimes the facts are
there, but the material we read is often
based on personal opinion and specula-
tion.  Depending where you click, you
might get the story. Or, you might be
treated to somebody’s idea of the story,
which lacks facts all together.

Although there has been talk about
the Internet being the death of the news-
paper, we don’t buy it. We know now
that this will only be the case with the
“big papers” and their weeklies that
only pretend to be local newspapers.
Privately owned community based local
weeklies will soon be the only reliable
source of information. 

Social media postings can catch and
keep our attention by providing real-
time content, but they create rumors,
suspicions, and conspiracy theories,
making it difficult to tell truth from fic-
tion. This is not the case in community
newspapers, which are based on facts,
people, and places we all know. What
you read in print may not be as exciting
as the latest social media posting, but it’s
factual, and if we make a mistake, we

correct it in the next edition. 
The purpose of a community news-

paper is to report the facts rather than to
speculate or start rumors. While
reporters are asked to investigate
rumors, readers will never see stories
containing information that has not been
fact checked and proven to be true. We
do not create news. We cover upcoming
events and events of public interest that
have already taken place. 

While sites like Facebook don’t have
word count limitations, they cater to the
short attention spans that have devel-
oped since the advent of the Internet. If
you want to find out what really hap-
pened, pick up a community newspaper.
You may not like what an article says,
but it’s based on the facts. 

We also tend to forget about the per-
sonal aspect of community newspapers.
Nutfield Publishing’s three publications
are committed to reporting and photo-
graphing what happens in their respec-
tive towns. Our reporters, photogra-
phers, and owners live in the area and
are familiar faces as they attend and sup-
port community endeavors. We aren’t
anonymous and you know how to find
us. When you support us, you support a
local business. 

So, go ahead and check out social
media. We all do it. We even have Face-
book pages for our three newspapers.
But, if you want to read about what real-
ly happens in your community, you
can’t beat a community newspaper.

Getting the Full Story

Correction: It was brought to our attention that the editorial that ran last week
which was provided to us by a teacher in CA  was missing the writers credit. We
would like to give recognition to the writer, Jesse Gomez from the Los Medanos
College Experience — who's editorial content ran in September 13, 2017.

MACK LEATHURBY
OP ED

——◆—–––
Looking at what has

happened this year, so far,
concerning bills before the
New Hampshire State legis-
lature. Governor, Chris
Sununu, has vetoed 23 bills,
some of which have impact
on property taxes, education
districts, insurance and ener-
gy costs.

School districts across
the state, including Derry,
have been stressed for sever-
al years now — where a
small decline in school
enrollment might trigger
school closings or districts
will have to request higher
property taxes from the
community.

Derry School district
officials and residents who
are mindful of the school
stabilization support bills
passed by N.H. lawmakers
have been hopeful that
school funding would be
stabilized adequately this
year by the state to keep the
school system healthy.

Gov. Sununu has recent-
ly vetoed a two-year state
budget, passed by the N.H.
legislature, that includes
school stabilization relief
and other educational fund-
ing — saying that the budget
plan threatens New Hamp-
shire’s economic growth and
is essentially a tax increase.

The Derry Cooperative
School District is stressed in
the face of further budget
cuts. 

The bill vetoed by
Sununu would have provid-
ed significant new funding
of about $138 million across
the state and would have
provided help to Derry.

The vetoed bill was
directed towards communi-
ties where schools and prop-
erty taxpayers have been
pushed to the brink of
school downsizing and pro-
gram cuts by repeated state

the Governor - has provided
multiple business tax cuts
over the past two years that
have hit school funding.

The math appears simple
- take money away from
school funding support and
add it to profits for big busi-
ness, multinational and
national corporations like
Standex, Comcast and Wal-
mart. In using his veto here,
Gov. Sununu has prioritized
multiple tax cuts for busi-
ness over educational oppor-
tunities for N.H. children, as
well as put more property-
tax burdens upon homeown-
ers and local small busi-
ness/property owners.

New Hampshire’s chil-
dren and communities
deserve a Public education
investment to help them
secure a solid future. Gov.
Sununu’s veto of a budget
with school stabilization and
other educational funding is
an indication that it will be
property owners and chil-
dren who will pay the price
while adding more profit for
corporations.

This budget veto will
shrink state aid to schools,
and local property owners
will once again have to
make up the difference or
schools will be set up for
hardships.

Here’s the deal - the
Governor’s message is clear.
He supports school funding
to be less than only a few
years ago… and there will
be no tax relief coming for
property owners.

Is the Governor not con-
cerned about schools, prop-
erty tax burdens, the N.H.
Supreme Court decision or
for all of N.H. kids to have
equal opportunities in the
future? If so, the Governor
should consider solutions to
properly set up our schools
for quality education with
adequate funding and also
help communities lower
their property tax burdens.

Tax Rate Relief, School Funding
Impacted by Governor Vetoes

aid reductions over the past
several years.

Towns such as Derry have
strong property tax burdens
already, so they’ve faced a
double burden –  they must
tax property owners at even
higher rates to maintain
school funding, or they will
not be unable to spend as
much as needed to keep the
schools open or support
needed programs.

Per-pupil spending in the
state varies immensely.
Derry schools - though its
spending per pupil was
down to $14,469.32 in 2017,
while districts such as
Waterville Valley come in at
$42,810 per pupil. 

Overall, N.H. ranks dead
last in educational spending
across the U.S. (as per U.S.
Dept. of Education).

The Governor’s veto has
also come at a time when the
2019 legislative session
made a commitment to pro-
vide proper school support
after several years of state
school funding cuts.

Sununu vetoed budget
funding that was also on a
path toward full compliance
with the N.H. Supreme
Court’s Claremont case
order made 25 years ago. At
that time, the N.H. Supreme
Court ordered the state to
fully fund a constitutionally
adequate education for
every N.H. child and pay for
it with taxes assessed at the
same rate throughout the
state. In addition, the pro-
posed budget would have
sent $40 million to cities and
towns as municipal aid, to
be used as they saw fit which
could have also helped lower
property tax burdens for
some communities.

The Governor says this
budget with school funding
support would be a tax
increase - though that argu-
ment should be further
examined. The issue is that
N.H. - with the support of
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PENNY WILLIAMS
NUTFIELD NEWS
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The Robert Frost Farm’s
Hyla Brook Reading Series
featured award-winning
poet Rachel Hadas, along
with Hyla Brook Poet Ellie
O’Leary, on Thursday, July
11. 

The series is held at the
historic Robert Frost Farm
located at 122 Rockingham
Road (Route 28), and is free
and open to the public. An
Open Mic follows the read-
ings and all audience mem-
bers are invited to share their
work. 

Hadas is the author of
many books of poetry,
essays, and translations. Her
most recent collection is
‘Poems for Camilla,’ and
was published in 2018; in
the same year her verse
translations of Euripides’
two Iphigenia plays were
published. 

She is the recipient of a
number of awards including

a Guggenheim Fellowship
in Poetry and the O.B. Har-
rison Prize from the Folger
Shakespeare Library.

Also appearing that day
was Hyla Brook Poet Ellie
O’Leary. O’Leary often
writes about growing up in
the village of Freedom,
Maine. 

She hosted Writers
Forum on WERU-FM, won
the Martin Dibner Memorial
Fellowship in poetry, and
taught writing at the Pyra-
mid Life Center in the
Adirondacks and at Belfast
(Maine) Senior College. She
has an MFA from the
Stonecoast program. Her
memoir Up Home Again
and her poetry manuscript
Breathe Here are forthcom-
ing with North Country
Press.

The Hyla Brook Reading
Series season will also fea-
ture appearances by Rodger
Martin on Aug. 8, and
Patrick Donnelly on Sept.
12. 

This summer, through
September, the Hyla Brook
Poets’ monthly writing
workshop meets on the third
Saturday of the month at 10
a.m. at its summer home at
the Frost Farm, before mov-
ing to the Derry Public
Library. 

Under the leadership of
Robert W. Crawford, Derry
Poet Laureate, Frost Farm
Poetry’s mission is to sup-
port the writing and teaching
of metrical poetry. 

The Hyla Brook Poets
started in 2008 as a monthly
poetry workshop. 

In March 2009, the
monthly Hyla Brook Read-
ing Series launched with
readings by emerging poets
as well as luminaries such as
Maxine Kumin, Sharon
Olds and Richard Blanco.
From there, the Frost Farm
Poetry Prize for metrical
poetry was introduced in
2010, with the Frost Farm
Conference beginning in
2015. 

Hyla Brook Reading Series
Continues at Robert Frost Farm

MACK LEATHURBY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

The Kids Coop Theatre
will be presenting the teen
production of Musical Foot-
loose. Performances for this
musical will be presented at
the Derry Opera House on
Friday, July 26 at 7 p.m. and
Saturday, July 27 at 1 p.m.
and 7 p.m.

Footloose was a Broad-
way hit developed in 1998,
that was based on the 1984
film of the same name. The
music is by Tom Snow
(among others), with lyrics by
Dean Pitchford and additional
lyrics by Kenny Loggins.

Footloose celebrates the
wisdom of listening to young
people by adults with a warm
heart and an open mind.

When Teenager Ren and
his mother move from
Chicago to a town in the
middle of nowhere, Ren is
prepared for the inevitable
adjustment at his new high

Kids Coop Theatre is
producing Footloose and
this theatre organization was
established in1997 as a
501(c)3 educational charity.
The goal of the organization
is to provide children with
an opportunity to build self-
esteem and learn valuable
life skills, such as leader-
ship, teamwork, and disci-
pline, in a fun, non-competi-
tive environment.

Tickets for Footloose are
$15, including fees, for
reserved seating. Tickets
will also be available for
purchase at the door subject
to availability. Lobby doors
for the box office at the
Derry Opera House open
one hour prior to perform-
ance and theater doors open
30 minutes prior to perform-
ance. Tickets are available
online from the Derry Opera
house web site and the going
to the events page www.der-
ryoperahouse.com

Musical Footloose “Rocks Out” at the
Derry Opera House on July 26, 27

school. What he isn’t pre-
pared for is that there is a
ban on dancing, instituted by
the local preacher, deter-
mined to control the town’s
youth. The heartfelt story
that emerges is about a
father longing for the son he
lost, and of a young man
aching for his father, who
walked out on him.

The music rocks to the
dancing rhythm of a Top 40
musical score - with some of
the most famous rock songs
from the 1980s including the
title song, Footloose by
Kenny Loggins.

Footloose was nominat-
ed for both a movie Oscar
and Broadway musical
Tony. The soundtrack album
from the movie reached
number one on the Billboard
charts and has sold over 15
million copies since it was
released. The music score
has been augmented with
dynamic new songs for the
stage musical. 
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Zoning
continued from page 1

that the Rand’s idea is to
build a home more fitting for
their age than their current
home on this property. The
new home would be sized at
1300 square feet and be
more handicap accessible,
with single level living and
set up for two bedrooms.
Coyle noted that the size of
the property is more than
normally allowed, though
still a reasonable size for an
older couple. The lot itself

has access to water from the
street, but would require a
new septic system to be
added.

Neighbors living in the
surrounding area of the
Rands, came forward at the
public hearing time to ask
questions about the new
building development. Sev-
eral of the abutters had
recently learned of the
development and upon fur-
ther plan analysis, they
decided they would be OK
with the new home being
built. One abutter was not so

happy about the additional
building, as his property
joins the current building lot
closely and he felt that his
privacy would be further
affected by the new home
building.

After the public hearing,
there was a significant Zon-
ing Board deliberative about
how building the new home
would further stretch multi-
ple zoning issues. ZBA
Chairman Perkins felt that
the additional building
would be out of alignment to
the zoning ordinances now,

for both the older and the
new home. Perkins was also
concerned that the applica-
tion request did not meet the
all five conditions including
the hardship requirement.

In the end, the board
voted with a split decision -
3 board members voted yes
and 2 board members,
including the Chair, voted
no. This voting meant that
the request was approved.
Any one who objects to this
variance grant has 30 days to
file a request for a rehearing.

1 ROCKINGHAM ROAD
RT. 28, LONDONDERRY, NH 03053

TEL: 603-432-5245 • FAX: 603-432-0191
WWW.BROTHERSAUTOBODYNH.COM
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“Darlene Donovan holding Proclamation she received
from Governor Sununu declaring July 22, 2019 Fragile
X Awareness Day”. Courtesy photo

was diagnosed with Fragile
X Syndrome.” This set her
on a journey to discover
what needed to be done to
find a cure. In 2014 the
Donovan’s began their

extensive fundraising work
toward supporting research
to find a cure for this syn-
drome, which affects many
more children and adults
than you might realize.
Many people are carriers of
this gene and may be totally
unaware that they could pass
the syndrome on to an
unborn child. Currently, as
far as is known, there are
more than 100 families in
N.H. alone affected by Frag-
ile X Syndrome.

In 2014 the Donovan’s
organized the first 5K Walk
to support awareness and
raise funds for the National
Fragile X Foundation.  This
Foundation is amazing in its
efforts for advocacy and
awareness of Fragile X Syn-
drome. Since this first 5K
Fragile X Walk (along the
rail trail in Derry, N.H.)

Fragile X
continued from page 1

born and she subsequently
learned that her grandson

many events have been
organized to support the
cause, however, this event
scheduled for July 22 will
donate all of the proceeds
received from the event
directly to the Fraxa
Research Foundation.  This
organizations primary focus
is on finding a CURE for
Fragile X Syndrome.  Dono-
van says, “This is the direc-
tion they want to devote
their energies to now.”

Donovan, actually filed a
request for a proclamation
with Gov. Sununu, which
was approved by the Gover-
nor.  The proclamation states
that July 22, 2019 shall be
observed as Fragile X
Awareness Day in New
Hampshire. She says, “ I
have already filed for the
same proclamation for July
22, 2020 and will continue

to request that Fragile X
Awareness Day to observed
on this day each year in the
future.

The next 5K Fragile X
Awareness Walk is set for
Sept. 8, 2019. This will be
the fifth annual walk in sup-
port of the National Fragile
X Foundation. Those who
want to participate gather
outside Sabatino’s North in
downtown Derry.  The walk
proceeds from that spot
down the Derry Rail Trail.

Donovan says, “I am so
appreciative of the support
that Sabatino’s North and all
of the local business that
have provided support
toward the Fragile X Syn-
drome cause. The restaurant
has always allowed me to
use the outside patio as a
platform for the 5K Walks
and for the event on July 22

they are also supplying  the
food and staff, as their dona-
tion to the Fraxa Research
Foundation. Other local
businesses have generously
donated items for the raffles
and silent auction. I am so
very grateful for all these
contributions toward Fragile
X awareness and finding a
cure.”

This is guaranteed to be
a fun event and for a very
good cause. Please come out
and enjoy a summer evening
at Sabatino’s North Restau-
rant in downtown Derry,
N.H., July 22, from 4 – 8
p.m. Tickets are $20 each
and can be purchased at
Sabatino’s North Restaurant
or you can contact Darlene
Donovan for tickets and
more information at: dar-
lenejdonovan@gmail.com

and get thrown into a night
of mystery, intrigue, and
murder you will never forget. 

A $75 donation includes
a cocktail hour with character
interaction, three-course
meal provided by Common
Man Windham, professional
actor entertainment and a
photo keepsake. There will
also be limited VIP “Golden
Circle” seating available for a

$90 donation and inclusion
in the show. Cash bar avail-
able.

Tickets can only be pur-
chased through caregivers-
murdermystery.eventbrite.co
m. Only 80 tickets will be
sold. Questions can be
directed to (603) 432-0877
ext. 4. Awards will be given
for best dressed, best actor,
best actress, detectives of the

Caregivers Present a Murder Mystery 
Community Caregivers

of Greater Derry will be
bringing the Murder Mys-
tery Co. to Windham for one
night only. On Saturday,
Aug. 3, from 6 to 9 p.m. at
Searles Chapel and School,
3 Chapel Road, Windham.

Residents are invited to
come to the quintessential
whodunnit thriller at the
estate of Sir Warren Peace

night and dead last place.
All proceeds will benefit

Community Caregivers of
Greater Derry. The organi-
zation’s mission is to enrich
lives and support individuals
to remain independent
through a compassionate
volunteer community. 

Caregivers also operates
the free Loaner’s Closet for
Durable Medical Equipment. 
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affects adults. 
JIA actually includes

several different types, or
subsets of arthritis, which
include a variety of symp-
toms, ranging from muscle
and soft tissue tightening to
bone erosion, joint misalign-
ment to changes in growth
patterns. Not all symptoms
are shared by all children
with JIA, and they can
change from day to day. 

Some common subsets
of JIA, according to Kids
Get Arthritis Too, include
Oligoarthritis, Polyarthritis,
Systemic arthritis, Enthesi-
tis-related arthritis, and
Juvenile Psoriatic arthritis.  

Oligoarthritis, formerly
known as Pauciarticular
arthritis, is a form of arthritis
involving four or fewer
joints. Girls are more likely
than boys to be diagnosed
with oligoarthritis, and to
experience uveitis, or
inflammation of the eye.
This type of arthritis typical-
ly develops by age 6, and
most commonly affects one
joint in the leg, such as the
knee or ankle. 

Polyarthritis is a subset
of arthritis that affects five or
more joints within six
months of symptom onset.
Roughly 25 percent of chil-
dren with JIA have this type
of arthritis. As is the case
with Oligoarthritis, girls are
more commonly affected by
this subset. However, unlike
the aforementioned, onset
can occur at any time during
childhood. Both large and
small joints may be
involved, and children may
experience symptoms in the
neck or jaw, often making it
difficult for them to eat. 

Systemic arthritis
involves about 10 percent of
JIA cases, and it affects the
entire body, beyond just the
joints. Girls and boys are

equally affected by this sub-
set, and symptoms general-
ly emerge by or in the ele-
mentary school years. 

The first symptom of
Systemic arthritis may be a
stubborn fever, sometimes
appearing weeks or months
before a child complains of
discomfort or mobility
issues. This fever can
appear once or twice daily
and can be quite high before
returning to normal, and
may be accompanied by a
faint rash. 

Systemic arthritis can
affect the internal organ sys-
tem, causing inflammation
of the spleen and irritation
of the membranes surround-
ing the lungs or heart. 

Enthesitis-related arthri-
tis involves inflammation of
the entheses, or sites where
tendons attach to the bone.
Boys are more commonly
affected by this subset than
girls. 

Symptoms of Juvenile
Psoriatic arthritis may be
preceded or followed by
psoriasis, sometimes even
by a number of years. This
rash may appear scaly and
red, emerging behind the
ears or on the eye lids,
elbows, knees, or scalp. 

To diagnose a child with
JIA and any of its subsets, a
doctor will conduct a physi-
cal exam and lab tests. In
addition to watching for
symptoms for at least six
weeks, the child’s doctor
will wait to see how symp-
toms unfold during the first
six months after onset. The
number of joints affected
during those first six
months will determine diag-
nosis. 

Once a diagnosis is
determined, a child will
often be referred to a pedi-
atric rheumatologist, or an
adult rheumatologist trained

July is National Juvenile Arthritis Awareness Month
MELISSA BETH RUIZ
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

It is often assumed that
arthritis is a condition that
exclusively affects the elder-
ly. Aching and popping
joints often seem to accom-
pany old age in one form or
another, so many assume it
is an affliction that comes
with time.

However, what many do
not realize is that not only
does arthritis affect younger
adults, but tragically, the
debilitating and painful dis-
ease affects children, as
well. 

Juvenile Idiopathic
Arthritis (JIA) is considered
the most common form of
arthritis, according to Kids
Get Arthritis Too, a branch
of the Arthritis Foundation.
In fact, the Arthritis Founda-
tion states that almost
300,000 babies and children
have arthritis or some other
type of rheumatic condition. 

The pain and discomfort
involved with arthritis often
holds children back from
participating in daily activi-
ties, so they rely on the help
of parents and doctors to
develop a treatment plan to
help increase quality of life. 

July is national Juvenile
Arthritis Awareness month,
an effort to inform the public
of the symptoms and treat-
ment of the debilitating dis-
ease, and to work toward
finding a cure, to help these
children be children again. 

In the past, JIA was
referred to as Juvenile
Rheumatoid Arthritis, under
the assumption that it was
the same condition adults
experienced. However,
research in recent years has
shown that only about 10
percent of children have a
disease that closely mirrors
the rheumatoid arthritis that

in treating children. The
same medications are often
used to treat children, but in
doses relative to their size. 

Generally, treatment reg-
imens are very similar for
children as adults, if not just
a little bit more intense. 

“No residual inflamma-
tion is allowed,” said Sandra
E. Pagnussat, MD, of South-

west Medical Associates.
“In children we treat very
aggressively and early to
prevent joint damage.”

As with anything, early
detection is key to getting
the best possible treatment
for a child with arthritis.
That is why Kids Get Arthri-
tis Too and the Arthritis
Foundation seek the support

of the public this month and
every month to help them in
their mission for better care
and a cure. 

For more information
and resources on Juvenile
Arthritis, or to find out how
to support research and
more, visit www.kidsge-
tarthritistoo.org.

CAILEN BAILEY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—––

It is the time for our gen-
eration to step up and make
a change beyond our social
media accounts. We all must
modify the way we con-
tribute to improving the con-
dition of our Earth, instead
of solely making #savethe-
seaturtles a trending hashtag
on Twitter. The dangerous
and deadly circumstances
many wildlife species are
currently facing are in rela-
tion to the overwhelming
amounts of litter and care-
lessness of humans. This
major crisis certainly does
not fade by the reposts of
‘supporting’ videos and pho-
tos on Instagram. Reducing
your carbon footprint only
begins at using stainless
steel and/or paper straws but
should not stop at that.

Do not confuse your pas-
sion to change the world
with your craving to gain the
satisfaction of your follow-
ers. The Earth is in danger
and needs everyone to care
about our planet. Under-
stand you don’t need to wear
a cape or possess a crazy
superpower to save our plan-
et. A major change can
begin if we all reduce our
carbon footprint and treat

our earth a little more gently.
Today we change our town,
and tomorrow we will
change our world.

Derry residents can
begin reducing their carbon
footprint first by limiting
how many plastic products
they use. Purchasing your
own metal straw or using
paper straws is one way to
reduce your carbon foot-
print, but plastic is a com-
mon contender we all rely
on in many cases. Consider
purchasing a stainless steel
or plastic reusable coffee
cup, instead of getting a new
plastic cup with each coffee
purchase. Here in Derry, it is
apparent many of us are big
coffee drinkers, and with
that, a lot of plastic is being
used and then discarded.
Sometimes these straws and
cups end up harming our
environment. Recycle your
plastic grocery bags, or bet-
ter yet use reusable bags.
Most plastic waste ends up
littering the streets, oceans,
and ultimately hurting our
wildlife. Stores including
Aldi and BJ’s limit use of
one-use plastic items like
grocery bags, which greatly
helps reduce the carbon
footprint. There are so many
amazing alternatives to sin-
gle-use items available

today, it is important to take
advantage. It is our job to
protect our Earth since we
only get one planet.

Next time you exit a
room, be sure to turn off the
lights. Simple actions such
as unplugging a hair
straightener or charging
cord when not in use can
lessen the effects of climate
change. Reducing your car-
bon footprint can be as sim-
ple as switching to compact
fluorescent lights in your
home or bundling up in the
winter to avoid raising the
thermostat. How amazing is
it that changing the great big
world can begin in your very
own home?

There is no limit to
reducing your carbon foot-
print, but the most important
and easiest way is by using
your voice. Your voice is the
strongest tool you have and
if you use it right and share
the word, you could poten-
tially make an impact. Post-
ing your concerns and fears
on social media accounts
can be effective, just remem-
ber to always practice exact-
ly what you preach within
the community. Our genera-
tion is strong and powerful,
and it is time to use that
power towards a real
change.

Reducing Your Carbon Footprint 
and Creating a Better Planet
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Kids See What’s Under the Sea During Recreation Program

Alyson DeMerchant of the Seacoast Science Center visited with children at Don Ball Park last
week and shared with them a number of sea creatures from the coast. The event was part of the
Derry Parks and Recreation Summer Events at the Humphrey Road Park. Groups got to see and
touch a variety of undersea creatures that DeMerchant had brought with her from lobsters, sea-
weed to star fish and crabs. Photo by Chris Paul
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new two-year, one-way con-
tract with his team, the NHL
champions St. Louis Blues
last Tuesday, July 8.

Sanford was one of four
Blues players who filed for
salary arbitration, but fol-
lowing that he and the team
quickly found a way to con-
tinue together and he will be
paid $3 million for the next

two years, under his new
contract. So far, in every
season of his NHL career
Sanford received $875,000,
the league’s base salary, on a
two-way deal, so this is a
significant upgrade for him.

The 24-year-old San-
ford, who started his profes-
sional career with the
Washington Capitals in

Zach Sanford Agrees to Two-Year Contract With the Blues
IDAN VINITSKY

NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

Only four days after
using his right and as a
restricted free agent, filling
for salary arbitration along
39 other National Hockey
League players, former
Pinkerton Academy star,
Zach Sanford, agreed to a

in three games prior to the
Stanley Cup Finals, where
his team faced the local
Boston Bruins.

In game three of that
series Sanford entered the

line and assisted for one of
the goals in the 7-2 Blues
defeat. He kept playing
throughout the seriesand
helped St. Louis win in
seven games. 

2016, participated in 60
games with the Blues during
the 2018-19 regular season
and had eight goals and 12
assists. During the Blues’
playoff run, he only played

administrator for Massachu-
setts and New Hampshire
Little League Baseball for six
decades. 

The winners of this new
award were Preston Libby,
who plays in the Diamond’s
Majors division and Gabby
McSweeney, from the 12U
division. The award was pre-
sented to the winners by Jane
Kirkland, the wife of the late
Donald Kirkland.

In addition, at the end of
the season baseball tourna-
ments, Team Hutchinson beat
Team Libby 13-7 for the
AAA championship and
Team Welch won the Majors
title after a 6-3 victory over
Team Terrenzio. The 12U
team has been playing over
the summer in a tournament
against other New Hampshire
District I Little League team.

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

The Derry Diamond
Athletic Association Little
League program announced
its winners of the Donald N.
Kirkland II Sportsmanship
Award. 

The award is given to one
baseball player, that has
played for either the AAA or
the Majors teams, and one
softball player, playing for the
10U or the 12U teams, are
chosen every year as recipi-
ents of the new award. These
players must show good
sportsmanship throughout the
league, as well as good grades
and give back to the commu-
nity. 

Kirkland, who passed
away last October, was very
involved as an umpire and

Little League Announces Sportsmanship Award Winners
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Or Make Your Service Appointment Online For An Additional $5 Discount
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$27.96
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trucks only. Pricing could vary for some makes and
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Preston Libby, of the Diamond’s Majors was presented
the Donald N. Kirkland II Sportsmanship Award by Jane
Kirkland, the wife of the late Donald Kirkland.

Courtesy photos

Gabby McSweeney, center, from the 12U Softball divi-
sion was awarded the Donald N. Kirkland II
Sportsmanship Award by coaches Kristie Kyzer and
Emily Walsh.
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following day. 
On Saturday, June 29,

the Derry team got its sec-
ond win in a row, a close 2-
1 victory over Mt. Monad-
nock. 

The Derry squad then
dropped a game to the
Goffstown contigent, 5-1,
on Monday, July 8, after the
holiday break. That was
enough to qualify for the
top 4, where on Saturday,
July 13, Goffstown proved
to be too strong for Derry
once more, winning 15-0
and qualifying for the next
round, where they will be

facing Bedford. 
The Derry team then

moved to the consolation
game and will try to beat
Salem in that contest. 

If the Derry squad suc-
ceeds in beating Salem,
they will have a game
against the loser of the
Goffstown vs. Bedford
game to try and get a sec-
ond chance in reaching the
finals. 

The consolation game
was scheduled to be played
on Tuesday afternoon, after
the Nutfield News went to
print.

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

For the first time in 16
years, the Derry Diamond
Athletic Association 12U
Summer Baseball team has
advanced to the next round
on the New Hampshire
District I Tournament. 

The Derry 12U boys
played four games in the
opening round of that tour-
nament. They started with a
tough 8-4 loss to Salem on
Wednesday, June 26, but
recovered with a dramatic
4-3 win over Bedford the

Derry 12U Baseball Team Makes Summer Semis For First Time In 16 Years
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Derry 12U Summer Baseball team has advanced to the next round on the New
Hampshire District I Tournament. Courtesy photo
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rain postponements that led
to makeup dates. 

Derry, with their 6-6
record traveled to the
Phillips Exeter Academy
last Tuesday, July 9, and was
swept in the doubleheader
against the home team. 

The first game ended
with a tough 4-3 loss. Exeter
scored two early runs and
added one in the second to
make it a 3-0 game. 

Derry scored its first run
of the game in the third

inning, but Exeter quickly
answered with a run of its
own. Derry made things
interesting with two sixth-
inning runs, but could not
find the tying run, despite a
good performance on the
mound from Derek Hiscox
and three hits by Jagger
Bell, who committed to
Bridgewater State
University this week.

In the second game, a 7-
3 loss, Liam Doyle, Alex
Barbuto and Mike Rollick

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

A three-loss, one-win
week was a step back for the
Derry Post 9 Senior team in
the American Legion
Baseball league, as the regu-
lar season is about to end. 

Derry entered the final
week of the season in the
fourth spot, but plenty could
still change, since the team
would be playing five times
this week due to a number of

Post 9 team won the first,
wild game, 13-9. Connor
Jenkins and Marique each
had two hits in the game, as
Derry scored four times in
the third inning, three more
in the fourth, once in each of
the next two innings and
completed the job with a
four run seventh-inning,
despite allowing many runs. 

The second game ended
with a 4-1 loss. This time
the bats were very quiet for
the visitors, who only had
two hits in the entire game,
by Jenkins and Kameron
Levesque, who drove in the

single run in the sixth
inning, with Portsmouth
already leading by four runs. 

Derry’s final week will
be a busy one. They were
scheduled to begin on
Wednesday, after the
Nutfield News went to print,
with a doubleheader in
Dover. The team will then
play in Londonderry on
Thursday, July 18, stating at
5:30 p.m. and in Nashua the
next day, 5:30 p.m., before
wrapping up the regular sea-
son with another game
against Nashua, on Sunday
(Jul. 21, 10 a.m.).

pitched for the Post 9 team
that played as the host of this
game and batted in the bot-
tom of the innings. Exeter
took a 6-0 lead in the top of
the sixth inning and Derry
managed to cut that lead in
half in the bottom of the
inning thanks to back-to-
back doubles by Bell and
Richard Marique, but this
was as close as they got. 

On Monday, in
Portsmouth (7-8), Derry
split the doubleheader
against a team that is fight-
ing also fighting for the third
place in the standings. The

Post 9 Team Still Vying For Third Place Entering Final Week
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order to earn this distinction,
O’Reilly had to demonstrate
the highest level of knowl-
edge and expertise in the
field of interscholastic ath-
letic administration. The
voluntary certification
process included a thorough
evaluation of O’Reilly’s
educational background,
experience and professional
contributions, as well as a
rigorous, comprehensive
writer examination.

O’Reilly is now part of

an elite group of inter-
scholastic athletic adminis-
trators nationwide to attain
this level of professionalism.
The NIAAA is a national
professional organization,
consisting of all 50 state ath-
letic administrator associa-
tions and more the 12,000
individual members. Its goal
is to promote the profession-
al growth of high school ath-
letic administrators and pre-
serve the educational nature
of interscholastic athletics

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

Last week, the National
Interscholastic Athletic Ad-
ministrators Association
(NIAAA) announced that
Pinkerton Academy’s long-
time Athletic Director Brian
O’Reilly has been recog-
nized by the association as a
Certified Athletic Admin-
istrator.

According to the organi-
zation’s press release, in

and the place of these pro-
grams in secondary school
curriculum.

O’Reilly recently led
Pinkerton Academy’s Var-
sity Boys Lacrosse team to
its 12th state championship,
after beating Bishop Guertin
in the final. As Head Coach
of the football team, he has
won 11 state championships
and led his team to the state
finals in 12 of the last 15
years.

O’Reilly Honored By National Athletic Administrators Association

Meet, at the end of the
spring season.

She told the Nutfield
News that she has passed the
Level 1 stage with the
national Track and Field
organization eight years ago.
In order to apply for a Level
2 Certification, you have to
wait and gain experience for
at least three years after fin-
ishing Level 1. Unlike other
coaches who entered the
Level 2 program with her,

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

The Longtime Pinkerton
Academy Track and Field
coach, Carol Quarles, fin-
ished her USATF Level 2
certification last week.

Quarles, who has been
part of the Track and Field
coaching staff for the Astros
since 2013, led the boys’
outdoor team to a second
place finish in the last State

different units, including
biomechanics, physiology,
training theory and more. 

Once she was able to
pass all of the eight units’
tests, where a certain pass-
ing score is needed to move
forward, she went on to take
the actual class, at the St.
John’s University in New
York. That class was four
days long and Quarles had
many classes, a group pres-
entation and eventually, a

test.
She says that after com-

pleting the Level 2
Certification she now has
much better understanding
of the science that is behind
sports and of the things she
teaches and the right way to
teach them. The Level 2
Certification is recognized
by many major institutions
across the nation and could
maybe open the door to a
college position one day.

Quarles says that she was
not asked to bring recom-
mendation letter. “I have
been around for long
enough.”

It took her eight weeks to
finish the online Sports
Science class, the first part
of the Level 2 Certification
process, since she had to
find time for it in her busy
schedule that includes run-
ning the summer camp. The
online part consists of eight

Pinkerton Track Coach Quarles Receives Level Two Certification 

Carol Quarles

Athletic Director Brian O’Reilly speaking at the new
Field announcement this spring.
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Summer 
Photo ContestPhoto Contest
Summer 
Photo Contest

Send us your “Best Summer Fun with
Water” Photo to be entered into a Contest to
Win 4 Tickets to Canobie Lake as well as
have YOUR Picture Run in the Paper!   

Send your 
Picture to 

dpaul@nutpub.net 
with your Name, 

Town, & a Caption 
to Win!

All winning pictures will be
placed in our paper and 
posted to our facebook page.

Your photo must be in by July 25th in
order to enter. One entry per person 
and your name and town must be listed.

University Stadium, after
each of the young bowlers
had two days of practice at
each of the eight bowling
centers that are hosting the
tournament. Practices con-
sisted of open bowling for
40 minutes.

The competitions began
on Monday and will contin-
ue the week through the
weekend. The qualifying
rounds wrapping up on
Thursday and the Finals
will be played on Friday
and Saturday. 

The competition has
four different divisions,
Under-12, Under-15,
Under-17 and Under 20 and
every division has four
qualifying rounds, and
Advancers Round, a Final
Advancers Round and a
Match-Play Bracket. Local
competitor Nourse, is play-
ing in the Under-17 catego-
ry, while Lemieux and
Michaud are in the Under-
15.

The qualifying rounds
will see every bowler play

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

Local bowlers Bryant
Nourse, Lance Lemieux
and Harry Michaud are rep-
resenting Pinkerton
Academy this week at the
annual Junior Gold
Bowling Championship,
which is being held in
Detroit, Mich.

The Opening Ceremony
for the event took place on
Sunday evening, July 14, at
the Eastern Michigan

be decided by total the pin-
fall. The two finalists in the
Match-Play bracket will
face each other for the first
and second seed spots in
the three-player stepladder
final. The winner of the
Elimination Bracket will be
the third seed in the tele-
vised finals. The stepladder
finals will be one-game
matches. The second and
third seed will play in the
opening match and the win-
ner will play the first seed
for the title.

The Junior Gold
Championship is the pre-
mier event for the country’s
best young bowling players
and winners can also earn
spots on the Junior Team
USA and scholarships. In
total, this year there are
over 4,700 players in the
different divisions and com-
petitions, a new record for
the Junior Gold
Championship. CBS Sports
Network will be televising
the stepladder finals of each
division.

16 games, four every day,
before the first cut of the
field is made. The remain-
ing bowlers will then have
five more games, in order to
make the second cut and
those who are still in con-
tention will play an addi-
tional five games, to deter-
mine the top-16 bowlers for
the Match-Play round. 

Match-Play for each
division will be a double-
elimination bracket and
each match will consist of
two games. The winner will

Three PA Bowlers Competing in National Championship

Year winner Tom Dixon, a
40-foot bonfire and over 15
breweries from the region,
offering samples from over
50 styles of beer.

There will also be three
charity benefiting from this
year’s event, The
Londonderry Lions Club,
the Londonderry Athletics
Booster Club and Veterans
Count, a philanthropic arm
of Easterseals New
Hampshire Military &
Veterans Services that pro-
vides critical and timely
financial assistance and
servicers to veterans, serv-

ice members and the fami-
lies. 

Millennium Running
says that, to date, it has
donated over $600,000
over the years to local char-
ities and organizations.

The run will start
Saturday night during Old
Home Day, at 6:30 p.m. at
the Londonderry Athletic
Fields Association (LAFA)
complex on Sargent Road.
The race route will have
runners heading north on
Mammoth Road, then turn-
ing onto Otterson Road for
an out and back loop to fin-

IDAN VINITSKY
NUTFIELD NEWS
——◆—–––

The Millennium
Running Series’ announced
recently that the Aug. 17
Boot Scootin’ Boogie 5K
race has been selected as a
2019 New Hampshire
Grand Prix event. The run
will also be part of the
annual Old Home Day cel-
ebrations in Londonderry
this summer.

The event will also
include, other than the 5K
run, live country music fea-
turing Country Act of the

adults, who do not wish to
participate in the 5K run,
are $25 until Aug. 16 and
$30 on race day.
Registration also includes a
custom designed trucker
hat to the first 1,200 regis-
trants, a personalized bib,
race photos and a finish
line video.

For youth (12-20 years-
old), the price for the 5K
and concert festival
(Excluding of course the
brewfest) is $25 before
Aug. 17 and $30 on race
day. Additional concert fes-
tival tickets for youth and

designated drivers are $20
($25 on race day). Kids (11
and younger) will pay $10
for the 5K run and the con-
cert festival tickets and
there is also an option to
purchase a VIP Parking
spot for $15. This parking
spot are adjacent to the
Start/Finish line of the 5K
race at the Londonderry
Athletic Fields complex.
General parking, for free,
will be available across the
road, at the Londonderry
High School, Matthew
Thornton Elementary
School, Londonderry
Middle School and the
Londonderry Town Offices. 

Tasting glasses will be
distributed to the 5K run-
ners as they cross the finish
line. The brewfest tickets
purchasers will receive
their glasses when they
pick up their tickets and
wristbands and the ticket
tent. 

The race results will be
displayed live at the
Millennium Running timing
trailer, adjacent to the finish
line. Live online results will
be published on the
Millennium Running web-
site (MillenniumRu-
nning.com).

ish at the LAFA complex.
The Brewfest and Taste
Nashville Festival will
open 15 minutes after the
run begins, at 6:45 p.m. and
will continue for almost
three hours, until 9:30 p.m.

Registration for adults
(21+) is $35 until the day
before the race, Aug. 16, at
11:59 p.m. and includes the
5K run, as well as the
entrance to the concert fes-
tival and Brewfest. On race
day, the cost will be $40
and is based on availability.
Additional concert festival
and Brewfest tickets for

5K Race Selected as New Hampshire Grand Prix Event
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◆ ◆

SERVICE DIRECTORY
◆ ◆

Call us for more details at  (603) 537-2760 • ads@nutpub.net

ADVERTISE YOUR BUSINESS HERE

Place your Business Card in the
Tri -Town Times, Londonderry Times

and Nutfield News & Reach Over
28,350 Households Every Week!

AS LOW AS
$3000

A WEEK*
for 52 weeks

*Price refers to a full size box
(2.5x1.5")

(603) 216-2268 www.svencon.net

EXPERIENCE THE DIFFERENCE

GENERAL CONTRACTING LLC

ADDITIONS • DECKS • WINDOWS • SIDING
FINISHED BASEMENTS • KITCHENS • BATHS

Leaf Relief

Cleaning &
Maintenance

Free Estimates

Commercial/Residential

Soffit/Facia Repairs
Jim Peck
603-434-5300

www.jimpeckco.com

Go
Seamless

PLUMBING
• HEATING  •  AIR CONDITIONING

NH LIC
#3853 437-7039

Paul the Plumber
Service with a Smile

FULLY INSURED • FREE ESTIMATES

SPECIALIZING IN SMALL TO MIDSIZE JOBS

David Kwiatkowski 
Home Improvements

603-486-1310

www.dkhomeimprovements.com

HANDYMAN AND 
HOME IMPROVEMENT

DRYWALL • PAINTING • SMALL JOBS
KITCHENS, BATHROOM & BASEMENTS

FREE ESTIMATES 
FULLY INSURED

603-965-5208
jcdugan55@gmail.com

PROFESSIONAL INTERIOR PAINTING SINCE 1974
FULLY INSURED • FREE ESTIMATES

603-432-3354

• Interior Painting 
• Toilets & Vanities
• Sheetrock Repair  
• Sinks & Faucets

• Moldings 
• Laminate Flooring
• Deck Repair
• And Much More...

We Fix: No Water, 
Low Water Pressure, 
Water Softeners 

––– 603-437-9114 –––

PLUMBING AND HEATING CO. LLC

SCOTT LAVOIE CONSTRUCTION LLC
ROOFING • SIDING • MASONRY
ROOF SNOW & ICE REMOVAL

FULLY INSURED
FREE ESTIMATES

1-603-434-8910
1-603-571-8688

ScottLavoieConstructionLLC.com

SCOTT LAVOIE

888-894-9794
northmarkcontracting@gmail.com
www.northmarkcontracting.com

From Concept to Completion

Kitchens · Bathrooms · Decks
Porches · Additions · Basements

We Work All Year!
Snow Removal Offered

www.snhqualityroofing.com
603-818-4075

God Bless

Defrancesco’s
Southern New Hampshire

––– QUALITY –––
ROOFING, SIDING & CONTRACTING

Asphalt, Metal & Rubber Roofing 
Siding • Windows • Doors • Additions

Senior
Citizen & 
Veteran

Discount

603-216-2593
www.ethicalhomepro.com 

Servicing your Heating, Air Conditioning & Water
Heater needs the right way, The Ethical Way

Experience The Grand Difference

(603) 552-7152
Locally Owned & Operated 

www.NHGrandRoofs.com

Your Local Junk
Removal Specialists!

CALL 458-7888 FOR A FREE ESTIMATE
SHOW ME YOUR JUNK!

Junk Removal 
Estate Clean-Outs

Storage Units • Yard Waste
Construction Debris • Appliances

JUNK CARS • SCRAP METAL
“If It’s Metal, We’ll Take It”

For more details call:

S&S Metals Recycling Inc.
603-537-1000 or       877-537-1007
196 Rockingham Rd., Londonderry, NH

TOLL
FREE

PICK UP SERVICE AVAILABLE

Wagner Electric
Complete Electrical Service
Residential/Commercial  
Fully Insured/Free Estimates
Please Call: 603-421-2922
www.wagner-electric.net
Established 1999

603-432-8649

EXTERIOR IMAGES

Since 1992 

HOUSE PAINTING
• Powerwashing 
• Carpentry
• Free Estimates

Veteran Owned

Derry
ROOFING

Roofing Installation
& Repair; 

Gutter Work
ALL TYPES OF ROOFING!

Shingle • Solar • Copper • Wooden Shakes 
Rubber Roof • PVC • Tar & Gravel • Snow Removal

603-479-8862
www.DerryRoofingLLC.com

Siding • Windows • Doors • Roofing & More!
Hampstead, NH
603-260-3531

www.GNEexteriors.com

Full House of
Windows Installed 
$3,000

Restrictions may apply. 
Call for details. Expires 7/31/19EXTERIORS

GREATER
New England up to 10 

windows

Hoehn Carpentry 
General Home repairs and 

remodeling. Oak stairs, cabinets,
trim repairs and more.

www.ronhoehn.com
603-893-6610

                                                          



Page 14 Nutfield News • July 18, 2019  

◆ ◆

Classified Advertising 
◆ ◆
READERS ARE CAUTIONED that we occasionally run ads that require an initial investment or money in advance. We urge our
readers to “do their homework” before responding to any ad, check out the advertiser thoroughly and verify their claims to your
total satisfaction. Only then should you proceed at your own risk. We try to screen ads that require you to send money before
receiving a product or service. But these efforts are no substitute for your own investigation, and we don’t endorse or guarantee
any claims made in any of the ads we publish. If you want more information about claims made in ads on subjects such as work
at home opportunities, travel or vacation specials, purchasing land or vehicles from government surplus or below wholesale,
loans or other credit opportunities (including credit repair), or weight loss and other health products and services, we urge you
to contact the Office of Attorney General, Consumer Protection Bureau, 33 Capitol Street, Concord, NH 03301 (603-271-3641) or
the Better Business Bureau at 603-224-1991. Publisher is not responsible for any loss of business if an ad does not run,
and we reserve the right to revoke any ad if deemed necessary. No refunds will be given for prepaid ads.

CLASSIFIED ADS
$100 PER WORD

Ad will run in Three Newspapers and Reach
Homes in Londonderry, Derry, Chester, 

Hampstead, and Sandown!

Deadline for placing ads is Monday at 3 p.m. 
for that week’s publication. 
ALL ADS MUST BE PRE-PAID 

$15 MINIMUM CHARGE
Minimum charge does not include bold type.

e-mail text to:
classifieds@nutpub.net

Call: 
537-2760 

Reach Over 1 Million Readers Across New England!

Buy New England Classifieds
Start at JUST $170 a WEEK

CLASSIFIED SPECIALS
• BUY 4 Weeks, GET 1 FREE 

• BUY 10 Weeks, GET 3 FREE  

Call 537-2760

◆ ◆

Local Classifieds
LOCAL LISTINGS FOR LOCAL READERS

◆ ◆

National/Regional Listings
Find Ads From Around New England and Across the Country

◆ ◆

National/Regional Listings
Find Ads From Around New England and Across the Country

PainKillers or other Drugs?
There is hope! Call Today to
speak with someone who cares.
Call Now 1-855-866-0913.

MISCELLANEOUS
A Place For Mom. The nation’s
largest senior living referral
service. Contact our trusted,
local experts today! Our service
is Free/no obligation. Call 1-844-

722-7993.

Earthlink High Speed Internet.
As Low As $14.95/month (for
the first 3 months.) Reliable
High Speed Fiber Optic
Technology. Stream Videos,
Music and More! Call Earthlink
Today 1-855-520-7938.

Applying for Social Security
Disability or Appealing a Denied

Claim?  Call Bill Gordon &
Assoc., Social Security Disability
Attorneys, 1-855-498-6323!
Free Consultations. Local
Attorneys Nationwide [Mail:
2420 N St NW, Washington DC.
Office: Broward Co. FL (TX/NM
Bar.)]

Become a Published Author. We
want to Read Your Book!
Dorrance Publishing-Trusted by
Authors Since 1920 Book manu-
script submissions currently
being reviewed. Comprehensive
Services: Consultation,
Production, Promotion and
Distribution Call for Your Free
Author’s Guide 1-877-626-2213.

$$Old Guitars & Amps
Wanted$$ Gibson • Fender •
Martin. All Brands. Top Dollar
Paid. Call Toll Free 1-866-433-
8277.

Lung Cancer? Asbestos expo-
sure in industrial, construction,
manufacturing jobs, or military
may be the cause. Family in the
home were also exposed. Call 1-
866-795-3684 or email can-
cer@breakinginjurynews.com.
$30 billion is set aside for
asbestos victims with cancer.
Valuable settlement monies may
not require filing a lawsuit.

Portable Oxygen Concentrator
May Be Covered by Medicare!
Reclaim independence and
mobility with the compact
design and long-lasting battery

of Inogen One. Free information
kit! Call 888-609-2189.

Get a Smartphone for $0
DOWN* with AT&T Next® and
AT&T Next Every Year;  $250 Gift
Card for Switching to AT&T!
(*Requires well-qualified credit.
Limits & restrictions apply.) 1-
888-545-5093.

Denied Social Security
Disability? Appeal! If you’re 50+,
filed for SSD and denied, our
attorneys can help get you
approved! No money out of
pockets! Call 1-866-376-3163.

Diagnosed With Lung Cancer?
You may qualify for a substantial
cash award. NO obligation, NO
risk! We’ve recovered millions.
Let us help you!! Call 24/7, 855-
845-8269.

Use RoundUp Weedkiller? Non-
Hodgkin’s Lymphoma, Multiple
Myeloma, and Leukemia may
result from RoundUp exposure.
A recent $2 billion judgment was
awarded in a RoundUp injury
case. Call 1-619-493-4791 or
email RoundUp@breakingin-
jurynews.com and let us begin
work on your RoundUp case
today. 

Dental Insurance from
Physicians Mutual Insurance
Company. Not just a discount
plan, Real coverage for [350 ]
procedures. Call 1-877-308-
2834 for details.

www.dental50plus.com/cadnet
6118-0219.

Generic Viagra and Cialis! 100
Pills $99.00 Free Shipping!
100% guaranteed. 24/7 Call
Now! 888-889-5515.

Hear Again! Try our hearing aid
for just $75 down and $50 per
month! Call 800-426-4212 and
mention 88272 for a risk free
trial! Free Shipping!

Cross Country Moving, Long
distance Moving Company, out
of state move $799 Long
Distance Movers. Get Free quote
on your Long distance move 1-
800-511-2181.

Call Empire Today® to schedule
a Free in-home estimate on
Carpeting & Flooring. Call
Today! 1-800-508-2824.

Spectrum Triple Play! TV,
Internet & Voice for $99.97/mo.
Fastest Internet. 100 MB per
second speed. Free Primetime
on Demand. Unlimited Voice. No
Contracts. Call 1-855-652-9304
or visit http://triplepl-
aytoday.com/national

Get DIRECTV! Only $35/month!
155 Channels & 1000s of
Shows/Movies On Demand
(w/Select All Included Package.)
Plus Stream on Up to Five
Screens Simultaneously at No
Addt l Cost. Call DIRECTV 1-
855-781-1565.

DISH Network $59.99 For 190
Channels! Add High Speed
Internet for Only $14.95/month.
Best Technology. Best Value.
Smart HD DVR Included. Free
Installation. Some restrictions
apply. Call  1-855-837-9146.

WANTED TO BUY
Wants to purchase minerals and
other oil and gas interests. Send
details to P.O. Box 13557
Denver, Co. 80201.

AUTOS WANTED
Cars/Trucks Wanted!!! All
Makes/Models 2002-2018! Any
Condition. Running or Not. Top
$$$ Paid! Free Towing! We’re
Nationwide! Call Now: 1-888-
985-1806.

HEALTH & FITNESS
Suffering from an Addiction to
Alcohol, Opiates, Prescription

ELECTRICIAN
ELECTRICAL WIRING. Insured
Master Electrician. Fair prices, Fast
response, and Free estimates.
BBBA+, Dana at 759-9876.

FIREWOOD
DRY K/D FIREWOOD, 16” cut and
split, 1/8 cord $299, free local deliv-
ery and stacking, Firewoodguy at
603-437-0940

ADVANCED HANDYMAN SERVICES.
Bathroom remodeling, carpentry, rot
repair, & painting. Low rates. Call
(603)490-4673. www.advanced-
handymanservices.org

HANDYMAN SERVICE
Home Repairs / Painting No Job Too
Small Call or text 508-223-7015
John Free Estimates

MASONRY
Michael’s Masonry- Specializing in
repair work. Steps, basements,
pointing, walkways, stone work.
Free Estimates.  603-421-0686.

Philip Boni & Son Masonry.
Specializing in step & chinning
repairs also installation of stainless
steal liners. BBA+ ratting 50 years
of experience call 490-0177
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COMMUNITY EVENTS
This section is meant to be used to announce free events to the communities. If your group or non-profit is
receiving money for what they are publicizing, there will be a charge of $40.00/week per paper. All Around
Town/Calendar Items will be held to 100 words maximum; anything over will incur a charge of
$40.00/week for up to another 50 words. All free announcements in the Around Town/Calendar section can
run a maximum of 3 weeks. Additionally: We will run the full versions of any calendar items online free
of charge at www.nutpub.net. Please send submissions to nutfieldnews@nutpub.net.

at 5:30 p.m., at the Tupelo
Music Hall, Derry. Don't miss
our highly anticipated cruise-
themed charity event of the
year! Bid on dozens of silent
and live auction items, includ-
ing gift baskets, travel pack-
ages and fun experiences.
Dinner is included. Tickets are
on sale now at
TupeloMusicHall.com

Garden Club

Derry Garden Club's
monthly meeting will be Aug.
2 with a picnic and a nature
walk. We are always looking
for new members who love to
garden or just enjoy what gar-
dens have to offer. Please visit
our website at www.derrygar-
denclub.org or call 603-396-
0053 and leave a message. 

YGallien's Town Beach 

Gallien's Town Beach will
be open throughout the summer
from 10 a.m. - 7 p.m. (weather
permitting) beginning now. This
facility is for Derry residents
only and proof of residency is
required at each visit. Passes are
typically only available for pur-
chase at the Recreation Office.
To register for a beach pass you
will need: Proof of residency for
each pass recipient is required
to enter and/or to receive a
beach pass (including minors).
A completed adult and/or
minor, a waiver per person for
each person requesting a pass.
Payment in the form of Check
or Cash (exact change appreci-
ated). For more information go
to Gallien's Town Beach includ-
ing park hours, admission fees,
and lost pass policies www.der-
rynh.org/parks-recreation/pa-
ges/galliens-town-beach. 

Free Meals

Please join us for free, fam-
ily-friendly meals, served in a
relaxed atmosphere.  Meals are
generally held as posted below,
but may be rescheduled for
holidays.  Please call the facili-
ty to check on holiday times.
Dinner on July 20 at St. Luke's
United Methodist Church, 63
East Broadway, Derry, from 5 -
6:30 p.m. For more informa-
tion call 434-4767. Dinner on
July 21 at Etz Hayim

Synagogue, 1 1/2 Hood Rd.,
Derry, from 5 - 6:15 p.m. For
more information call 432-
0004. Dinner on July 26 at First
Parish Congregational Church,
47 East Derry Rd., East Derry,
from 5 - 6:30 p.m. For more
information call 434-0628.
Lunch on July 28 at St. Jude
Parish Community, 435
Mammoth Rd., Londonderry,
from 1:30 - 2:30 p.m. For more
information call 432-3333. The
Salvation Army will have a
Summer Lunch Program  from
July 9 - Aug. 22. The Sonshine
Soup Kitchen is serving free
hot meals 5 days a week.

Derry Fun Night

Seacoast Division of the
National Model Railroad
Association is running their
Derry Fun Night program. The
program is held the second
Friday night of each month, 7 -
9 p.m., at the Marion Garish
Community Center, 39 West
Broadway, Derry. We will set
up a swap table so bring any-
thing that you would want to
give away, sell or swap.
Remember, one man's junk is
another man's treasure. If you
are interested in model trains
and would like to join other
like-minded hobbyists from
beginner to expert for a fun
evening program come to
Derry Fun Night the second
Friday of each month. For
additional information go to
the Division's website at sea-
coastnmra.org/calendar.

Teddy Bear Sleepover

Bring your teddy bear, wear
P.J.'s and come to the Taylor
library for an evening of stories
and a craft on July 25 at 6:30
p.m. A snack will be served.
Then put your teddy bear to bed
at the library and say goodbye.
We will take pictures of your
teddy bear having fun
overnight. You will pick up
your bear the next day. Pre-reg-
ister needed, as space is limited. 

Marshmallow Roast

Join us for a
Marshmallow Roast with Mr.
Ray from Derry Public on
Aug. 1, at 6:30 p.m. Go to the
field in back of the Taylor
library for a story hour and
marshmallow roast. We will
have a campfire and all the
fixings for s'mores. 

Story Hours

The Taylor Library Story
Hours for 2-5 year olds are
Mondays & Wednesdays at 10
a.m, Stories and with a theme

every Thursday night, 6:30 p.m.
- 7:30 p.m., at The Upper
Room, 36 Tsienneto Road,
Derry. Meet other parents expe-
riencing the same situations.
No pre-registration is required.
There is no fee, and all topics
can be discussed. Call 603-437-
8477 with any questions.  

Walking Together 

A support group for wid-
ows and widowers meets every
1st and 3rd Tuesday of the
month at 7 p.m., at the Manse
at Londonderry Presbyterian
Church, 128 Pillsbury Road,
Londonderry. When we meet,
we walk together our journey
of grief. No need to do it alone.
If you have any questions,
please call 781-866-9976.

Lamplighters

A womans group with the
goal of helping less fortunate
woman and people in N.H.
meets every fourth Thursday of
the month 7 p.m. at Lon-
donderry Presbyterian Church
at 128 Pillsbury Road, London-
derry. If you have any ques-
tions please call 781-866-9976.

Evolve! 

A group for young woman
ages 13 to 18 to talk about
today's challenges meets every
Wednesday from 5:30 - 6:30
p.m. at the Upper Room, 36
Tsienneto, Rd. Derry. This is a
free weekly group. To register,
Call 437-8477 to register ext. 16.

Story Hour with a Craft

A story hour with a themed
craft is available for children
ages 2 - 5 years old on
Wednesdays and Sundays at 1
p.m. at the Taylor Public
Library. Space is limited so
called the library at 432-7186
to register or with questions.

UR Parents

A weekly Resource group
for parents, grandparents and
caregivers raising teens meets
every Thursday, from 6:30 -
7:30 p.m. at the Upper Room,
36 Tsienneto, Rd. Derry. This
is a free weekly group. Drop
ins welcome.

Greater Manchester Lyme
Disease Support Group

Hosted by David Hunter
this group meets on the third
Wednesday of every month at
6:30 p.m. at the: Bedford
Presbyterian Church 4 Church
Road Bedford. For more
information call 660-3425 or
email dhunter31@gmail.com

Active Parenting

The Upper Room will hold
an Active Parenting program
on July 22 and 29 from 6 - 8
p.m. at 36 Tsienneto Rd.,
Derry. This will provide par-
ents raising teens with guid-
ance, including respectful dis-
cipline, clear communication
and strategies to prevent risky
behavior.

PlaneFest

Join us Saturday, Aug. 17
from 10 a.m. - 2 p.m. for vin-
tage aircraft, Young Eagles
flights, seminars, events, and a
geography bee. There's some-
thing for everyone at this annu-
al event, you'll be able to
inspect a wide array of home-
built and vintage planes and
speak to the owners who lov-
ingly restore and maintain
them. If you're age 8 to 17, you
can enjoy a FREE flight with a
local pilot via the Young Eagles
program. (Come early as it's
first come, first served and
capacity is limited.) We also
have aviation seminars and
workshops, a drone workshop
where participants will take
their own picture from above,
great food trucks, info about
the Londonderry Rail Trail due
to run right to our front door in
2021, and so much more.  And
new this year: middle school
students can compete in the
Aviation Museum's first-ever
Airline Geography Bee, using
our collection of vintage air
sickness bags from around the
globe to demonstrate their
knowledge.  The Aviation
Museum of NH is located at 27
Navigator Road, Londonderry.
For more information call
(603) 669-4820, email avmuse-
um@nhahs.org, or visit the
museum's website, www.avia-
tionmuseumofnh.org. 

Crossroads Co-parenting, 

Parenting after a divorce or
separation? This program cov-
ers how to protect your child's
well-being by keeping them
out of the middle and allowing
them to love both parents, how
to open lines of communica-
tion and recover from a
divorce/separation. It will be

based craft each week. A snack
will be provided. Call to regis-
ter and save your space. 

Story Hour at Don Ball Park

On Tuesdays at 10:30 a.m.,
Aug. 6. Come visit with Miss
Fran and Miss Linda for sto-
ries at the park. Then you can
go enjoy the splash pad and
cool off after the program. 

Lego Club

Come enjoy the air condi-
tioning at the Taylor library
and create your favorite space
crafts, cars, buildings, etc. with
our Lego Club on Tuesdays at
1 p.m. (July 23 & 30). A snack
will be provided. Pre-register
for this event. 

Craft Class 

Crafts will be done each
week to go along with the
summer theme at the Taylor
Library (ages 4 and up) on
Wednesdays 3 p.m. (July 24
& 31, Aug. 7). A snack will
be provided. Call the library
to reserve your space. 

Closing Party

On Aug 8 at 6:30 p.m., the
Taylor Library will announce
the winner of the Jelly Bean
contest, raffle basket and all
day tickets to Canobie Lake.
Each child who turns in a read-
ing chart by Aug. 1 will have a
chance at these prizes and will
receive a certificate for reading
for us this summer.
Refreshments will be served at
the end of the evening.    

Tiny Tot Story Hour

This Taylor Library story
hour is for the little ones-6
months to 2 years old and will
be held on Fridays at 10 a.m.
(July 19, & 26, Aug. 2) There
will be stories, rhymes, pup-
pets and music each week.
Please register for this event. 

Tiny Tots

A storytime for ages 6
months - 2 years meets Mon-
days at 10 a.m. at the Taylor
Public Library. Space is limited
so called the library at 432-7186
to register or with questions.

Parents Support Group

Are you frustrated with
your teenager or in need of sup-
port regarding your teenager?
Does parenting your teenager
mean you have new concerns
about anger, defiance, motiva-
tion and trust? If so, you are not
alone. Welcome to the club!
Meet up with other parents at
our Parents Support Group

held at the Upper Room on
July 22 and 29 from 6 - 8 p.m.
at 36 Tsienneto Rd., Derry.

Raising a Teenager? 

This free weekly resource
group for parents, grandparents
and caregivers rising teens, dis-
cuss concerns, learn strategies
and get support at the Upper
Room on Thursdays from 6 - 7
p.m. at 36 Tsienneto Rd.,
Derry. Drop-ins welcome.

Transitions Support

The Upper Room offers
Transitions support for young
adults ages 18-25. Learn how to
manage the "overwhelming" in
a healthy way for you. We offer
workshops, and 1:1 support,
groups. For an appointment,
call (603) 437-8477 ext. 24.

IPS 

The Upper Room offers
Teen Information for Parenting
Success for young parents ages
13-23, Wednesdays 5 - 7 p.m.
A weekly support program for
young parents to talk, listen,
learn and be accepted.
Childcare available. To regis-
ter, call (603) 437-8477 ext. 12.

Prevention Training

The Upper Room offers a
Prevention Training program
for Young Adults on July 23
from 8 a.m. - 5 p.m., at 36
Tsienneto Rd., Derry. This one-
day training will help young
adults to better understand the
warning signs for suicide, sub-
stance misuse and mental
health concerns so that they
can help others find treatment
and recovery options. To regis-
ter, call (603) 437-8477 ext. 24.

Ice Cream Social

The Upper Room will have
an Ice Cream Social and Open
House on Aug. 14 from 3 - 6
p.m. at 36 Tsienneto Rd.,
Derry. Join us for a family fun
event right in our own back-
yard. Ice cream with all the
topping, Bounce Houses, Face
Painting, Music, and family
fun Outdoor games.

18th Annual Auction

The Upper Room holds its
18th Annual Auction on Nov. 1

                                                                   



 

ENTER TO WIN A VACATION  
FOR TWO TO CANCUN
NAME:  _____________________________________________
ADDRESS:  _________________________________________
CITY/STATE/ZIP:  __________________________________
PHONE:  ____________________________________________
EMAIL:  _____________________________________________

Drop entry at Derry LaCarreta between Friday, May 1st to 
Tuesday, May 5, 2015. See restaurant for contest rules.

 

 

JOIN US ON
AT LA CARRETA MEXICAN NEW ENGLAND FOR
EXCLUSIVE COUPONS,SPECIALS & EVENTS!

Trivia Night!
Every Wednesday

in Derry from 8 p.m. - 10 p.m.

PRIZES EVERY ROUND

MARGARITA
MONDAY

35 MANCHESTER RD., DERRY, NH
603-421-0091

44 Nashua Rd., Londonderry, NH
603-965-3477

Gift Certificates Available
We Deliver Party Platters!

Function Room
Available for Parties

and Events

House 16oz
Lime Rocks
Margaritas 

$499
DINE IN • TAKE OUT 
www.lacarretamex.com
HOURS: Sun.-Thurs.11-10 p.m.

Fri.-Sat.11-11 p.m.

KIDS
EAT FREE!
Mon. &Tues. 

2-7 p.m. 
Two Kids Per Adult Entree, Dine in only,

does not include drink or dessert. 
From Kids Menu

All Day 
Drink
Specials
Tues. & Wed.

––––– Weekly Specials –––––

Derry & Londonderry
Locations

(Bud Light & Shock Top)

23oz
Beers

$4
16oz
House

Margarita 

$6
Derry & Londonderry  

Locations

                     


