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Tis’ the Season A huge Jack-o’-Lantern was set up
along Mammoth Road near the Mack’s Apples Farmstand over the week-
end to attract some of the hundreds of visitors coming to town during
apple and pumpkin picking season. Photo by Chris Paul 

continued on page 7

ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

At the two most
recent Town Coun-
cil meetings, Town

Councilor, Ron Dunn,
who also serves as a
State Representative, dis-
cussed the potential of
forming a committee to
tackle different issues in
Londonderry and in the
area.

“The concerns in
Londonderry regarding
growth traffic, planning,
and land use are factors
we are all dealing with
everyday,” Dunn said.

He said he was look-
ing to form a committee
to tackle some of the
issues

“I’m looking at form-
ing a committee with
Rockingham County. This

committee would look at
best practices among
communities in Rocking-
ham County. We could
learn from other towns
that deal with similar
issues, how they deal
with the issues different-
ly, similarly, or maybe
how maybe they have a
more productive way
that they deal with their

Dunn Hopes to Form Committee
For Rockingham County Area

continued on page 6

continued on page 7

PAUL CONYERS
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

On Oct. 2, the Lon-
donderry Plan-
ning Board heard

a presentation on the
traffic impact of the Vil-
lage at Technology Hill
Planned Use Develop-
ment. Engineer, Nick
Golan, of TFMoran and
TFMoran President, Bob
Duval, attended the
meeting to give an
overview of what
changes to local traffic
Technology Hill could
have on the town. 

“There’s a manufac-
turing component on
the east, a daycare cen-
ter, a small office, and a

small shopping plaza.
That all together makes
up the project, the Vil-
lage on Technology Hill,”
Duval explained. “Basi-
cally, the whole site is at
the east end of the air-
port on the north part of
town.”

He went on to say
that every component of
the project had its own
impact on surrounding
traffic patterns and
added that the sur-
rounding roads gave the
area multiple entry
points to distribute the
traffic on work days. The
development has two
primary entrances near
Akira Way and Kitty

Hawk Landing. 
“Signage will be a key

element to make sure
that we have folks trav-
eling where they’re sup-
posed to,” said Golan. 

Trip generation mea-
surements estimated
around 490 morning and
540 evening trips from
the completed develop-

◆ ◆

Study Reveals Traffic Impact 
of Technology Hill Project Plan

second obligation is to
protect the people that
provide that service to
the community that
expect that service,”
Butler said. 

Butler explained that
“because the way my
budget is trending right
now, given circum-
stances that are outside
of my control, I’m flying
through those monies
appropriated by the tax-
payers so I’ve come to
an inflection point. I
have a decision to make.
The decision is to cut
services from 13, 12,
down to 11 although the
community told me they
want 13, or not execute
what I have to do as a
fire chief because of my
budget obligations.” 

“There are things
worth fighting for still in
this country for sure
that I believe in with all
my heart and all my soul
which allows me the
execute the way I’m
going to execute in this
instance,” Butler said. 

Instead of making
cuts to staffing, Butler
decided to tender his
resignation. 

“It’s not that I can’t
give the order to drop
services, but I won’t give
the order because I love
these people, because I
know their families, and
their wives, and their
husbands, and their chil-
dren intimately. We are
involved with each oth-
ers lives, which is hard

Budget Restraints Sparks
Resignation of Fire Chief 
ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

In what became a very
emotional night at the
Town Council meeting

on Monday, Fire Chief,
Bo Butler, offered his
resignation. 

The decision Butler
said ultimately came
down to his requirement
to balance the budget,
conflicting with what he
thought was right, which
was to have 13 firefight-
ers per shift, after a war-
rant article passed in
March with 70% of the
vote, called for the
staffing levels. 

“As fire chief I have
two obligations. The
first obligation is to bal-
ance the budget the tax-
payers provide me. The
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Chief to remain a full-
time member of LFD in
some capacity.”

He added, “The Chief
shared his love and sup-
port for us, and we did
the same for him. I made
no attempt to discour-
age the Chief from say-
ing his piece last night in
a way that was true to
himself, as I have always
done with all town
employees.”

In reference to the
allogations made at the
meeting Malaguti said,
“The picture presented
last night by the multiple
speakers following the
Chief’s departure is yet
the latest, inaccurate
portrayal of what is
going on in the town
departments, this time
featuring a new low: the

discussion of a town
employee’s personnel
material at a Town
Council meeting record-
ed and broadcast across
town. Since I appointed
him just over a year ago,
I have provided the
Chief with the highest
level of guidance, direc-
tion, coaching, and sup-
port, and have mar-
shalled other resources
to support him. It is
noteworthy the Chief
did not say otherwise.

The two budgets I
have proposed to the
Town Council since I
became Town Manager
include significant in-
creases for LFD, includ-
ing doubling the train-
ing budget which had
not been increased since
2017, adding $66,000 for

Town Manager Responds to Resignation of Fire Chief
CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

In response to the res-
ignation of London-
derry Fire Chief, Bo

Butler, during the Mon-
day night Oct. 7, Town
Council meeting, Town
Manager, Mike Malaguti,
released the following
retort.

Malaguti said, “Chad
Franz and I learned of
the Fire Chief’s intention
to resign entirely from
the fire service ten
hours before last night’s
Town Council meeting.
While the details of that
conversation are pri-
vate, it is important to
note that we asked the
Chief to reconsider, and
for more time. When he
indicated his mind was
made up, I asked the

vehicle maintenance,
$18,000 for station main-
tenance, $12,000 for the
safety program, and
$126,497 for overtime. In
my first three years in
office, I have proposed
and the Town Council
has approved $524,798
in budgetary increases
for LFD, an increase of
6.5%. When this year’s
Article #15 proposing
$495,000 to hire addi-
tional firefighters is
included, the budgetary
increases the Town Coun-
cil and I have supported
rises to $1,019,798, or 12.7%.

I am also proud that
over the past three
years, the Town Council
and I have supported
other significant LFD
requests, including:

• $709,969 in con-
tract increases, which
were ratified by the vot-
ers in 2022; 

• $495,000 in funding
(year 1 expense) for
additional firefighters to
staff each battalion at
13, which the voters
approved in March; 

• $120,000 in funding
to equip each riding
position with an infrared
camera; 

• $146,135 in funding
to purchase 4 mechani-
cal lifts to move patients
in and out of ambu-
lances; 

• $44,360 in funding
to purchase an addition-
al command car in order
to ensure there is a
backup when one is out
of service; 

• The addition of a
second deputy fire chief; 

• The creation of the
assistant fire chief posi-
tion; 

• $2,255,928 in fund-

ing to purchase 2 new
fire trucks; 

• Funding firefighters
to obtain paramedic
schooling and creden-
tials; 

• $173,293.88 in fund-
ing to equip each vehicle
with a “minimum load
out” of gear and equip-
ment; and 

• $275,000 in funding
for the fire equipment
and vehicle purchase
capital reserve accounts.

In sum, the residents
of Londonderry should
know that contrary to
what was portrayed last
night, the Town Council
and I have supported
more than $5 million in
new funding for the Fire
Department since I took
office in February 2022-
an average of $163,734
per month.

My staff and I have
also worked closely with
the Fire Chief to fill
staffing vacancies. In the
three years I have
served as Town Manag-
er, we have hired 22 fire-
fighters. It took six years
and two months to hire
the 22 firefighters before
that, meaning we have
more than doubled the
pace of hiring since I
took office. While LFD
has been plagued by
unfilled positions for
years, the Town Council
and I have supported fill-
ing each vacancy and we
have retained these new
employees. Our support
for LFD does not end
with funding decisions.
The Town Council, my
staff, and I have been
proud to attend fire
academy graduations,
pinning and promotion
ceremonies, retirements,

and other important
events that recognize
the exceptional men and
women of the London-
derry Fire Department.

The Town Council
and I will remain com-
mitted to supporting our
Fire Chief, command
staff, and the members
of 3160, and I will contin-
ue to do my job manag-
ing the Fire Chief and his
town department. To
clear up two inaccura-
cies that were posted by
Local 3160 on social
media, and alluded to
last night, neither the
Finance Director nor I
have “mandated that
Chief Butler reduce staff
from 13 to 11 members
per shift.” Instead, we
informed the Chief that
his overtime budget is
trending $200,000 over
budget just one quarter
into the fiscal year, and
we answered the Chief’s
questions about possi-
ble strategies to address
this trend. Similarly, the
Chief was not “threat-
ened ... with disciplinary
action if he does not
comply.” This assertion
is entirely made up.

We will continue to
support LFD as careful
stewards of the taxpay-
ers’ money that has
been entrusted to our
care, as we balance
LFD’s needs against the
needs of our other vital
first responders, the
Police Department and
DPW Department,
whose work is equally
important, so that Police
and DPW spending and
hiring do not need to be
frozen for the second
year in a row because of
an LFD overtime deficit.”  
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son, it’s important to
recognize that every-
thing has gone up in
cost.

“As we go into the
budget season, what I
want to call to the gov-
ernment bodies is that
we need to be careful.
We need to take this into
consideration. We can’t
keep pushing and push-
ing more dollars out
onto people,” Farrell
said.

Farrell explained that
he thinks the Council
and other government

bodies “have to look at
what is really needed to
continue to support this
aging community that
we live in and what’s
necessarily for that.”

Also during the
meeting, one of the
agenda items was in
regards to authorizing
funds to be spent on the
Master Plan.

In a resolution it
explained that a 2008
warrant article was
approved by voters to
establish the Master
Plan Capital Reserve

Town Council OK Master Plan Funds, Warn Spending
ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

At the Sept. 30 Lon-
donderry Town
Council meeting,

during public comment,
Town Councilor, John
Farrell, explained that he
experienced something
he has only experienced
a few times recently
which he called the
“Market Basket Miracle.”

“I went to Market
Basket today and spent
less than $100,” he said.

He explained that as
they go into budget sea-

Fund.
The proposal was to

withdraw $6,235.90 for
the bills that they had to
pay so far.

Town Manager, Mike
Malaguti, explained that
there is about $69,000 in
the Fund right now.

“It is for the assis-
tance of the regional
planner in liaising with
staff with staff attending
various community
events,” Malaguti said
about the initial cost.

He said that the
$6,200 would be for the

first month and a half or
two months worth of
work.

The Town Council
unanimously approved
the withdrawal request.

The Town Council
was also presented with
a request to accept
unanticipated revenue.

The unanticipated
funds was from a High-
way Safety Grant by the
NH Office of Highway
Safety and National
Highway Traffic Safety
Administration for the
amount of $14,400.

It was explained by
Malaguti, that the grant
funding is for traffic
enforcement saying
specifically it’s for extra
patrols.

“Some traffic enforce-
ment work that this
money will fund and
facilitate,” Malguti told
the Town Council.

The unanticipated
revenue request was
unanimously approved.

The Town Council is
set to meet again on Oct.
21 beginning at 7 p.m.

historical buildings. 
Depending on what

the structural engineer
concludes, from there
the Committee envi-
sions the need to go out
for different quotes
including for renova-
tion, water diversion,
and for the structure if
needed. 

D'Anna explained
that they are looking at
two different potential
options to present to
the voters, one being
turning it into a rental
hall open to the public
without a kitchen. 

Some of the benefits
pointed out includes it
being the lowest cost
option for renovation,
and allows another
affordable rental option
in town. 

Some of the issues
noted include the town

potentially having to
cover all maintenance
and utility costs if there
aren't enough rental
use, and also that it
may take away from
rentals at the Historical
Society barn and the
hall at the Senior Cen-
ter. 

It was noted that
they would take the
kitchen out, and it
would instead be able
to be used for different
catered events. 

Another option
would be to have it as a
rental use for the public
with a kitchen still. 

It was noted that if
they went with that
option they would have
another rental space in
town, and that it would
be the best way “to
keep and preserve the
town's history.” 

◆ ◆

Reverend Morrison Meetinghouse Committee Discuss Findings
ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

The Town Council
received an update
from the Reverend

Morrison Meetinghouse
Study Committee during
its most recent meeting. 

Derek D'Anna, Vice
Chair of the Committee,
said the first steps of
their process was to
“understand what is
needed to meet town
codes,” including under-
standing the overall sta-
bility of the building,
the costs of renovating,
the cost of water diver-
sion, and to understand
the needs of a general
manager for the project. 

At this point, D'Anna
explained that they are
looking to be able to
hire a structural engi-
neer who is well versed
on post and beam, and

Some of the poten-
tial drawbacks, however,
with that potential
option include a higher
cost, along with the
town potentially being
on the hook for mainte-
nance costs. 

While the Committee
hasn't sought any con-
crete estimates, D'Anna
said some of the rough
estimates would be
between $800,000 and

$1.2 million for Option
A, and $950,000 and
$1.65 million for option
B. 

The Town Council
gave its consensus to
see how much it would
cost to hire a structural
engineer to get an
assessment done in
order to see what they
would need to get esti-
mates for as part of
phase 2. 

Once that phase is
completed, the Commit-
tee said the next step
would then be to pres-
ent to the Town Council
for any possible action. 

Town Manager, Mike
Malaguti, also noted
that they should consid-
er how they want the
Committee to operate
moving forward, if at all,
once its initial charge is
completed. 
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Editorial

This editorial is courtesy of the
National Fire Protection Association 

Oct. 6-12 is Fire Prevention Week
this years’ theme is “Smoke alarms:
Make them work for you”

The latest “Smoke Alarms in the
US.” report, said working smoke
alarms reduce the risk of dying in a
home fire by 60%, while the majority of
civilian home fire deaths continues to
occur in homes with no smoke alarms
or no working alarms, according to the
US Consumer Product Safety Commis-
sion (CPSC) survey. 

“Smoke alarms can make a life-sav-
ing difference in a home fire, but they
have to be working in order to protect
people,” said Lorraine Carli, vice presi-
dent of Outreach and Advocacy at
NFPA. “This year’s Fire Prevention
Week campaign drives home just how
important it is to install, test, and main-
tain smoke alarms to ensure they’re
working properly.”

The survey also showed that many
households have inaccurate percep-
tions about the age, functionality, and
maintenance requirements of their
smoke alarms. Nearly one in five
households believed all alarms would
be working but had at least one func-
tionality issue when tested, including
dead batteries. Additionally, only half
of households were always accurate
about the age of their alarms.

“People tend to be overconfident
about their risk to fire, which often
leads to a sense of complacency that
compromises safety,” said Carli. “This

year’s Fire Prevention Week campaign
works to better educate people about
their true risk to fire and the steps
needed to make sure they’re adequate-
ly protected in the event of one.”

Essential fire safety messages for
this year’s Fire Prevention Week
theme, “Smoke alarms: Make them
work for you!” include the following:

• Install smoke alarms in every bed-
room, outside each separate sleeping
area (like a hallway), and on each level
(including the basement) of the home.

• Make sure smoke alarms meet the
needs of all family members, including
those with sensory or physical disabil-
ities.

• Test smoke alarms at least once a
month by pushing the test button.

• Replace all smoke alarms when
they are 10 years old or don’t respond
when tested. To learn more about Fire
Prevention Week and this year’s theme,
visit fpw.org. Additional Fire Prevention
Week resources for children, caregivers,
and educators can be found at
sparky.org and sparkyschoolhouse.org.

For more than 100 years, Fire Pre-
vention Week, the longest-running US
public health observance on record,
has worked to educate people about
the risk of home fires and ways to min-
imize them. Local fire departments,
schools, and community organizations
play a key role in bringing Fire Preven-
tion Week to life in their communities
each year and spreading basic but crit-
ical fire safety messages.

Take the time to check your alarms
to be safe.

“Smoke Alarms: Make them 
Work for You”
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Letters
Double Standard by

Town Council

To the editor,
Our most recent

council meeting on Mon-
day, Oct. 7, left many in
our community feeling
shocked and deeply dis-
mayed. The unexpected
resignation of Fire Chief
Bo Butler has resonated
powerfully, especially
given Chief Butler’s
heartfelt words about
his love for our commu-
nity and his dedication
to his principles.

When a respected
and devoted leader like
Fire Chief Bo Butler
steps down, the impact
is profound. His depar-
ture creates a sense of
loss anduncertainty, as
he was a trusted figure
of safety, service, and
stability. His resignation
prompts reflection on
the dedication he bro-
ught to his role and the
integrity he stood for,
values the community
will undoubtedly want to
uphold.

During the meeting,
Councilor John Farrell
expressed visible frus-
tration and surprise,
only learning of the situa-
tion five hours before the
meeting, leaving him, as
he said, without time to
“fix it.” Former council-
man Jim Butler also
spoke during public com-
ments, referring to the
“Laura Gandia situation”
and asking if the council
was aware of personnel
concerns involving the
town’s department man-
agers, to which council
members replied they
were not.

Reflecting on Jan. 23,
2023, the “Laura Gandia

vering support of Mr.
Malaguti raises the ques-
tion: Is this the kind of
leadership Londonderry
wants?

Amanda Longo
Londonderry
––––––––––––––

Words Of Thanks

To the editor,
The Londonderry Child

Passenger Safety Pro-
gram would like to take
this opportunity to
thank the many folks
that made our National
Seat Check Saturday Car
Seat Inspection Event a
big success. Certified
Car Seat technicians,
from many parts of the
state, came together to
inspect the car seat
installations of several
families on Saturday,
Sept. 21 at the London-
derry South Fire Station.
We would like to thank
the members of the Lon-
donderry Women’s Club.
The club came forward,
for the second year, will-
ing to help our program
in any way they could.
The Club and its mem-
bers provided many vol-
unteers to assist us and
donated coffee/ break-
fast and lunch for all of
the car seat technicians,
so greatly appreciated.
Another word of thanks
to Hannaford’s for pro-
viding the lunches, pro-
vided by the Londonder-
ry Women’s Club at a
discount, all were deli-
cious and the techni-
cians truly appreciated
the wonderful food after
many hours of inspect-
ing car seats. Lastly we
would like to thank the
Community Relations

situation” involves the
unexpected layoff of
Laura Gandia by Town
Manager Malaguti under
a “reorganization plan”
that had not been previ-
ously discussed. At that
time, the council upheld
that per the Town Char-
ter, section 4.8, they do
not interfere with town
administration. Both Mr.
Butler and Mr. Franz
supported this stance,
with Mr. Farrell reiterat-
ing that personnel deci-
sions lie solely with the
Town Manager.

This raises pressing
questions about London-
derry’s leadership. If Mr.
Farrell now expresses
regret for not having time
to address a personnel
matter, how could he do
so while adhering to the
council’s stance? If coun-
cil members like Mr. But-
ler urge action on staffing
issues, why then dismiss
it as outside the council’s
purview, as was the
answer back in January
2023?

Over the last two
years, town employees
have written to the coun-
cil describing a work-
place marred by bullying,
intimidation, and harass-
ment - yet no action has
been taken. Monday’s
disclosure of the coun-
cil’s stance to “just wait
two weeks and it will
blow over” reflects poor
leadership. Ignoring is-
sues has led to valuable
leaders resigning on prin-
ciple, a work culture of
fear, and taxpayers bear-
ing the costs of legal fees
and being serviced by
employees who have lost
all trust and productivity
in leadership.

The council’s unwa- continued on page 7

Endorsement Letters It has been a longstanding policy of Nut-
field Publishing to publish campaign letters in the newspaper and also to allow people the
opportunity to voice their endorsements. As we approach the Nov. 5 General Election, we are
asking that all endorsement be a maximum of 350 words. The request is to allow space for week-
ly news and sports articles. Thank you for your understanding.
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Fire Chief
Continued from page 1
for someone that doesn’t
understand the fire serv-
ice to truly realize how
important these people
behind me are to me and
I’m not going to be the
chief to violate my own
character, and my own
integrity, and my own
principle to come under
budget at the cost of
their health and safety
first and foremost,” But-
ler said. “And any chief
that thinks otherwise
needs to realign his pri-
orities.” 

He added: “So I am
providing you my resig-
nation tonight as chief of
the Londonderry Fire
Department.”

No decision was made
by the Town Council dur-
ing the meeting to accept
the resignation or not. 

During Butler’s
speech, he asked the
rank in file, to maintain
its composure. 

“The community will
rise to the occasion but
it takes this sacrifice to
get there, it will, I know
my hometown you will

get the money you need
to carry out your mis-
sion to be safe so you
can provide  the service
to the people that are
counting on you, and
then give you every tool
you can to get back
home to your loved ones
in one piece,” Butler
said. 

Town Manager, Mike
Malaguti, in a statement
to the Londonderry
Times, wrote “Chad
Franz and I learned of
the Fire Chief’s intention
to resign entirely from
the fire service, ten
hours before last night’s
Town Council meeting.”

“While the details of
that conversation are
private, it is important to
note that we asked the
Chief to reconsider, and
for more time. When he
indicated his mind was
made up, I asked the
Chief to remain a full-
time member of LFD in
some capacity,” Malaguti
wrote. “The Chief shared
his love and support for
us, and we did the same
for him. I made no
attempt to discourage
the Chief from saying his

piece last night in a way
that was true to himself,
as I have always done
with all town employ-
ees.” Malaguti’s res-
ponse, in its entirety, can
be read on page 2. 

In a Facebook post
Tuesday morning,
Christopher A. Schofield,
the President of Local
3160, which represents
the Fire Department’s
rank in file wrote “This
past March, the citizens
of Londonderry over-
whelmingly supported
Warrant Article 15,
which called for the
addition of four firefight-
ers, ensuring that each
shift would be staffed
with 13 personnel. This
decision, made by the
community, prioritized
public safety and provid-
ed our firefighters with
the necessary resources
to protect the town effec-
tively.”

“However, town lead-
ership has chosen not to
follow the wishes of the
community. Instead,
they have unfairly
placed blame on Chief
Bo Butler for circum-
stances outside of his
control,” Schofield
wrote. “The Town Man-
ager has now mandated
that Chief Butler reduce
staff from 13 to 11 mem-
bers per shift, despite
the clear directive from
the voters. They have

also threatened him with
disciplinary action if he
does not comply.”

Schofield  also wrote
about Butler’s character
saying “Chief Butler, a
man of deep principles
and unwavering integri-
ty, refused to compro-
mise the safety of our cit-
izens or go against the
will of the community.
Last night, he made the
difficult decision to
resign from his position.
His resignation is a
tremendous loss for our
department and town,
but it is a testament to
his dedication to doing
what is right for the peo-
ple of Londonderry.”

“This is not the first
time that town leader-
ship has disregarded the
well-being of our citizens
and employees. Last
year, Town Manager
Malaguti and Finance
Director Campo institut-
ed a town wide budget
freeze, which led to a
reduction in services,
including the closure of
the Central Engine Com-
pany,” Schofield   wrote.
“Despite these cuts, the
town ended the fiscal
year with a budget sur-
plus of nearly $600,000,
which will likely be
deposited into the
undesignated fund bal-
ance. This surplus was
achieved at the expense
of the community’s safe-

ty and the well-being of
all town employees.”

Schofield ended his
letter by saying, “We call
on town leadership to
respect the wishes of the
people of Londonderry
and honor the staffing
levels that were ap-
proved by the voters.
Public safety must not be
compromised for finan-
cial maneuvering, and
our firefighters should
not be forced to work
under conditions that
put them and the com-
munity at greater risk.”

“We ask for your con-
tinued support as we
advocate for the safety
and well-being of Lon-
donderry and its first
responders,” Schofield
wrote. 

Battalion Chief, Bruce
Bruce Hallowell, spoke
during the meeting,
telling the emotional
story of almost dying
during a call two years
ago. He said the person
who saved him was But-
ler. 

“We were 30 seconds
in this community away
from a line of duty death.
That’s what we’re talking
about. And the man that
just left here he saved
my life,” he said. 

Hallowell said he also
hoped there would be a
way for him to return. 

“So I ask, I beg, please
restore the ability for
our leader to return to
his post,” he  said. 

Dan Bouchard, a for-
mer Londonderry police
officer, said he saw But-
ler grow up, and said
unlike some past depart-

ment heads, the fire
department supports
Butler. 

“We wanted the 13 on
staff, I’m an elderly per-
son, I have a community
that has a lot of elderly
people, we have a lot of
elderly people in the
community,” Bouchard
said. 

Bouchard also urged
the Town Council to
think about the decision
taking place. 

“I don’t know what
happened here, but it’s
not good to lose Bo But-
ler as the chief, and
please don’t let him walk
away,” Bouchard  said. 

Former Town Coun-
cilor, and the father of
Bo, Jim Butler, spoke
during the meeting, rais-
ing concerns, including a
letter Bo received from
Town Manager, Mike
Malaguti, about a five
day suspension without
pay.

“I saw a letter from
my son, who’s never had
a problem, people have
said he’s done great
things, he’s got great
reviews, I saw a letter
from your Town Manag-
er that said he was going
to get suspended for five
days without pay,” But-
ler said. 

The Londonderry
Times has not received a
copy of the letter men-
tioned. 

“I’ll tell you some-
thing, you have a man-
agement problem here,
look into it,” Butler said. 

Editors Note: A full
rebuttal letter from Malaguti
can be found on page 2.

54 Elwood Rd., Londonderry 
603-434-6017

Family Owned & Operated
Since 1910

15 ACRE 
CORN MAZE 

Open 7 Days a Week from 8 - 6 p.m.
Follow us on Facebook

Now Open!

BYO Flash Lights
Last Entrance at 9 p.m.

Enjoy a Scenic Hayride 
Viewing One of the Highest Points
in Londonderry on the weekends

Friday and Saturday Nights

Fall Decorations & more at the Farmstand

U-PICK 

PUMPKINS
U-PICK APPLES

Apple Cider Donuts, Cider, Honey, Gourds,
Preserves, Cornstalks, Mums, Indian Corn,

Our Own Farm Fresh Eggs & More!
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Teams from Londonder-
ry Fire Rescue and Lon-
donderry Police Depart-
ment, as well as the Bat-
talion 3 crew from Lon-
donderry Fire Rescue.
Your support and assis-
tance went a long way to
make this event a suc-
cess. There were 6 car
seats/cars inspected and
ALL needed some sort of
correction to ensure the
safety of the little ones
traveling in their cars.

We also donated 1 seat
to replace a car seat that
was involved in a crash.
If you were not able to
attend, but would like to
get your car seat instal-
lation inspected, or have
questions on the safety
of your child while trav-
eling, please reach out
to our program, we
would love to assist. You
may contact the pro-
gram via e-mail: cps@l-
ondonderrynhfire.gov or
leave a message on our
information line: 603-
432-1104 ext. 4623. For

additional information
on car seat safety and
information on addition-
al events in the state, or
to become a Child Pas-
senger Safety Techni-
cian, you may visit the
state’s website: www.be-
seatsmartnh.org.

Respectfully,
Vinny Curro 
Londonderry 
Call Lt-Londonderry 
Fire Rescue
Coordinator- 
Londonderry Child 
Passenger Safety 
Program.

◆ ◆

Letters
Continued from page 4

Study
Continued from page 1
ment. However, he was
optimistic those num-
bers would be lower due
to the “internal capture”
of residents staying and
working within the Vil-
lage. 

Londonderry’s Engi-
neering Director, John
Trottier, noted that traf-
fic is always an “interest-
ing subject” with large-
scale projects in town,
and there was an earlier
traffic scoping meeting
to address the issue. 

“This project fits
comfortably in the exist-
ing network and has
room to spare for future
development either off-
site or onsite,” said
Duval.

He did not think traf-
fic mitigation would be

needed, even after look-
ing at ten-year predic-
tions. The proposal did
include adding left-turn
lanes at the intersec-
tions of Technology
Road/Harvey Road and
Kitty Hawk Landing/Gre-
nier Fiel Road. Evan
Drew from Stantec, who
had years of experience
reviewing traffic around
Londonderry, confirmed
much of what was pre-
sented and stated that
studies had also been
done at alternatively
adding turn lanes to the
intersection at Akira
Way/Harvey Road.

“Our suggestion was
to monitor for the future
at Akira,” said Drew.
“Let’s discuss, maybe it
does make sense to put
it at Akira, maybe it
induces demand, there’s
all of these other fac-
tors. With planning and

traffic studies there’s a
lot of assumptions.”

TFMoran did not
want to interfere with an
existing traffic calming
project on Mammoth
Road. Members of the
Planning Board had a
few questions.

“What is the agree-
ment on the need for a
left run lane?” asked Sec-
retary, Lynn Wiles.
“We’re going to leave it
as-is for the foreseeable
future until traffic dic-
tates we do something
different?”

The Town Engineer
and the Golan stated
this was not the case.
They only wanted to
gather more information
to see if a left turn lane
should be added at
Akira Way or Technolo-
gy Road. Currently, stud-
ies favor the latter
option.

Dave and Patrica
Robins of 532 Mammoth
Rd. also sent an email to
the Planning Board say-
ing homeowners in the
area were “seeking a
solution to the growing
speed and traffic issues”
in the area. The couple

worried about some of
the changes the traffic
study would make to
Mammoth and Page
Roads and how adding a
four-way stop would
make noise problems
worse. 

The Londonderry

Planning Board unani-
mously voted to
approve the traffic plan
conditionally. 

The Board is sched-
uled to meet again on
Wednesday, Nov. 6 at 7
p.m. in the Moose Hill
Conference Room.

issues. This committee
would focus specifically
on areas of concern to
take a deep dive into
areas of how to address
them,” Dunn said.

He explained that
they all want local con-
trol and don’t want the
State to take over saying
“We all agree on that.”

“So we don’t want
the State telling us how
to run our town,” Dunn
said.

Dunn explained that

the Committee would al-
low them to learn more
from other towns “on
how they deal with spe-
cific laws or regulations.”

He explained that the
way he envisions it is
that anything that may
need to be changed at
the State level could be
changed or repealed,
then it could be present-
ed to the Committee.

“We may find in the
end that there is no
action needed at the
state level.” Dunn said.

Dunn explained that
they would look at the
different issues as a
county “to figure out
how to solve these prob-
lems together.”

During the Sept. 23
meeting, Planning Board
Chair, Jake Butler, said,
“I think it’s a really good
idea,” in regards to the
Committee saying a lot
of the issues into the
town’s Master Plan
which they are currently
in the process of updat-
ing. He said once they
start getting more feed-
back from the communi-

◆ ◆

County Committee
continued from page 1

ty about what they are
looking for then they
would have a better
sense of what they may
want to have changed.

Town Councilor,
Shawn Faber, said he
thinks that the commit-
tee should also include

other communities part
of the 93 corridor includ-
ing places like Windham,
Pelham, and Hudson.

Dunn said if he is re-
elected in November he
would plan on submit-
ting a bill right away
when he is allowed to in

order to allow them to
have a Committee form-
ed with Rockingham
County representatives
and others.

The next Town Coun-
cil meeting is slated to
take place on Oct. 21
beginning at 7 p.m. 

–– 603-391-4639 –– 

PFOA PROGRAM IS BACK!
Offering Zero Out of Pocket

for Treatment System
Call John at Mainline Plumbing

FINANCING
AVAILABLE

• PLUMBING

• WELL PUMPS

• WATER

TREATMENT
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Lancer Twirlers Entertain Under the Lights Friday Night 

Londonderry High School juniors Gretchen
Murray, above, and Madison St. Gelais “The
Lancer Twirlers” had a chance to display their
abilities at the Alvirne vs. Londonderry football
game on Friday night. Photos by Chris Paul

Kim P. Flattery
Kim P. Flattery, 63, of Derry, NH died Wednes-

day Oct. 2, 2024 in the Elliot Hospital, Manches-
ter, NH. Kim was born in Gloucester, MA on Feb.
16, 1961, a daughter of Frederick and Barbara
(Newman) Flattery. She had resided in Derry for
the past 40 years, formerly living in Londonder-
ry where she was educated.

Kim was a great animal lover and especially
loved butterflies. She had two parakeets which
she loved dearly. Kim loved her family and had a
huge heart.

She is survived by her mother, Barbara (New-
man) Flattery of Londonderry, two brothers,
Craig Flattery and his wife Donna of Londonder-
ry, and Wayne Flattery of Derry, also several
aunts, nieces and nephews.

There are no calling hours. Private graveside
services will be held at Holy Cross Cemetery,
Londonderry. The Peabody Funeral Homes and
Crematorium of Derry and Londonderry is
assisting the family with arrangements. To send
a condolence, please visit www.peabodyfuneral-
home.com.

OBITUARY
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continued on page 12
Lancers junior running back, Adrian Cruz, had a

65-yard touchdown run. Photo by Chris Paul

◆ ◆

LONDONDERRY SPORTS
◆ ◆

derry five plays for the
games first touchdown,
scoring in less than two-
minutes after starting
from the 20-yard line.
Senior quarterback, Sam
Ogden, handed the ball
off to senior running
back, Carson Palma, at
the Broncos 31-yard-line
where he carried it into
the endzone for a 28-
yard touchdown run.

Senior kicker, Blake
Thompson, added the
extra point and was per-
fect in all but one
attempt in the game.

The Broncos first
drive was riddled with
penalties, with an illegal
shift and two false
starts, resulting in a
punt after six plays.  

Londonderry’s fol-
lowing possession, start-
ing at the LHS 36-yard
line, resulted in another
quick touchdown, this
one in just four plays.

Junior running back,
Adrian Cruz, had a 65-
yard run to put the ball
in the endzone at 6:21 in
the first quarter. Ogden
handed off the ball to
Cruz at the Lancer 32-
yard line and took the
13-0 lead.

Thompson’s extra-
point attempt was
blocked by Alvirne’s
Ryan Rocheleau.

Alirne’s second drive
of the evening looked as
though it would be pro-

ductive, with Nao Rao
catching a 35-yard pass
from senior quarter-
back, Charlie Crawford,
but an unsuccessful
fourth-and-13 put the
ball back in the hands of
LHS at the 26-yard line
with 3:36 left in the first. 

Londonderry’s third
touchdown was on a
quarterback keeper by
Ogden at mid-field.
Ogden ran the ball from
the 49-yard-line to pay
dirt with just :17 sec-
onds left in the first.

The Broncos looked
as though they would
bounce back in their
third drive of the game
moving down the field
in 14-plays and driving
43-yards only to have a
fumble at the five-yard-
line spoil their chances.

Rocheleau made a
catch at the 17-yard line,
but had the ball
stripped at the 10-yard-
line by senior Devin
Boles.

Junior J-Veion Teeter
picked it up and ran it to
the AHS 29-yard line,
where it took just three
plays for another seven
points.

Senior quarterback,
Alexander Villa, finished
the short drive with an
eight-yard touchdown
run at 5:36 in the second
for a 27-0 lead.

Another impressive
long lead drive by the

Lancers Saddle Broncos with Lopsided 44-Point Loss
CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

Coming off a disap-
pointing loss on
Mack Plaque week-

end, the Londonderry
High School Football
team responded with a
44-point thrashing of the
Alverine Broncos at
Lancer Park on Friday
night, Oct. 4.

The Lancers never
allowed their opponents
get score in the lopsided
victory and were able to
put points on the board
in every one of their pos-
sessions. 

Londonderry put up
20-points in the first
quarter, another 10 by
halftime, and 14 more
unanswered points in
the second half.

The home team post-
ed nearly 500-yards in
total offense with 450-
yards coming on the
ground and 46 passing
yards.

The Alvirne High
School squad tallied 184-
yards of total offense,
with most of that com-
ing through the air, with
147 passing yards.

Interestingly enough,
both teams’ were fairly
even in time of posses-
sion with LHS finishing
with 24:41 minutes while
AHS had the ball for
23:19 minutes.

It only took London-

visitors did not result in
points on the board for
the Broncos.

An incomplete pass
in the endzone from the
nine-yard-line put AHS at
fourth-and-four where
they failed to convert.

Crawford was sacked
by senior Colin Couture
on fourth down, putting
the Lancers at the 16-
yard-line with :22 sec-
onds left in the half. 

Ogden set up the
final three-points on the
half with a run to the
Broncos 30-yard-line,
with :10 seconds left.

A short pass play to
senior Ethan Wheeler
gave Blake Thompson a
34-yard field goal
attempt to make it 30-0

166 Plaistow Rd., Plaistow, NH
(603) 382-6976

Highland Family Dental is
Pleased to Announce the

Addition of 
Dr. Richard Calvin

WELCOMING NEW PATIENTS
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in the regular season.
The 4-1 win over the

Portsmouth Clippers
and the 3-3 tie at
Hanover High School
put the Lancers at 6-2-3,
putting them in good
shape as they prepare
for the post season.

Londonderry began

the week on Tuesday
afternoon, Oct. 1, head-
ing to the border of Ver-
mont to take on the 6-3
Hanover Bears where
LHS took a two goal lead
early, but then gave up
two to finish the half at
2-2.

The Lancers first
goal came from junior
mid-fielder, Leo Soch-
anek, at 14:00, with the
assist going to senior
forward, Tiago Keyes.

At the 24-minute of
the first, Keyes tallied
an unassisted goal for
the 2-0 lead.

Hanover erased the
lead before the half with
goals at 28:00 and 34:00.

In the second half,
Keyes made it 3-1 at
14th minute, assisted by
junior mid-fielder,
Caden Jordan.

The final goal of the
game came at minute 31
in the second half, by
Hanover, spoiling the
Lancers victory celebra-
tion.

Senior keeper, Noah
Celio, had three saves,
while Hanover made four.

Head coach, Todd
Ellis, commented after
the long road trip, say-

Lancers Boys’ Soccer End Week with a Win and a Tie
CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

The Londonderry
High School Boys’
Soccer team had

another week ending
with a win and a tie, put-
ting them in fourth place
in the Division I stand-
ings with five games left

were able to come away
with a 1-0 victory over
the Clippers.

Senior mid-fielder,
Reagan Anderson, had
the lone goal in the con-
test with senior forward,
Kate Sloper, getting the
assist.

Senior goaltender,
Reagan Delude, had
seven saves in the tight
contest.

The win put London-
derry at 3-6-2 and
Portsmouth went to 4-4-
3 with five games left in
the regular season.

Earlier in the week,
on Tuesday, Oct. 1, at
Hanover High School,
the Lancers fell 2-4 to
the Bears.

Anderson and fresh-
man Jackie Heimsath
had the two goals for
Londonderry. 

Anderson was assist-
ed by senior Jaelynne
Kelly and Heimsath’s
goal was assisted by
Anderson.

Delude had a very
busy day in net, needing
to make 14 saves on the
18 shots at her goal.

On Tuesday, Oct. 8,
the girls went for their
fourth victory against
Manchester Memorial
(2-7-1), in the Queen City.

On Thursday, Oct.
10, they are scheduled
to play the Windham
Jaguars (3-5-4) at home,
starting at 6 p.m.

◆ ◆

Londonderry Girls’ Soccer
Wrangle Third Victory
CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

The Londonderry
High School Girls’
Soccer team had

gone five games without
a win, but by the end of
last week they were able
a one-goal victory on the
seacoast.

The Lady Lancers
started the season at 2-
2-1, with a somewhat
promising start, but
since then, goals got a
bit harder to come by
and they had been win-
less over five games, set-
tling for one tie and four
losses in that stretch.

On Thursday, Oct. 3,
at Portsmouth High
School the LHS girls

ing, “Hanover is a tough
place to travel to play
and we had a lot going
against us during the
game. The team played a
great first 25-minutes,
but then lost focus in the
remaining 15-mins and
let Hanover back in.”

He added, “We need
to play better team
defense especially in the
final third. We owned
the second half for the
most part, and things
beyond our control got
in the way.  We need to
learn from this, and be
better.”  

Ellis was happy with
his senior forward’s per-
formance, saying, “Tiago
had his best game of the
season.”

The Lancers return-
ed to their home turf on
Thursday, Oct. 3, where
they captured a 4-1 win
over the Portsmouth
Clippers (5-4-1).

In the first half, Jor-
dan scored off a corner
kick from senior mid-
fielder Zach Mantegari
at 22:20.

Portsmouth made it
1-1 before the halftime
whistle blew though.

In the second half,
the Lancers took con-
trol, scoring three more
times for the lop-sided
victory

At 50:55 Khoi Totten
scored off a rebound. At
60:00 Zach Mantegari
had an unassisted goal
and at minute 79:00, Will

Gingrow got his first var-
sity goal with a header
off of a Keyes corner
kick.

The LHS offense had
12 shots turned away by
Portsmouth.

Ellis commented, “I
thought we bounced
back well on a short
week after a frustrating
Tuesday Night game.
We really controlled the
game well except for a
lapse in judgement,
when they scored their
goal off of their throw
in.”

The Lancer played
Manchester Memorial
(1-8-1) on Tuesday and
will travel to Windham
on Friday to take on the
5-4-2 Jaguars.

We are a debt relief agency. We help people file for bankruptcy relief under the U.S. bankruptcy code

BANKRUPTCY
GET BILL COLLECTORS OFF YOUR

BACK AUTOMATIC STAY STOPS 
DEBT COLLECTION

START OVER WITH A CLEAN SLATE

4 Birch St. 
Derry, NH

(603) 437-2643

126A Pleasant Valley St.
Suite 11, Methuen, MA

(978) 691-5453

Law Offices of
Andrew D. Myers

www.attorney-myers.com

Lancers senior forward, Tiago Keyes had two
goals and an assist against the tough Hanover

defense last week. Photo by Chris Paul

LONDONDERRY
FLEA MARKET

AVOID RESIDENTIAL TRAFFIC

Free Space & Tables to All
One Weekend a Year 

Rid Yourself of Uneeded 
or Unwanted Items

––––– Since 1991 –––––

Please Call 
883-4196

Operating EVERY Saturday & Sunday
from 8 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Last Weekend is October 19 & 20
(End of the 2024 Season)
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2FREE Junk Car
Removal!

We will pay up to $60000

for some cars and trucks.
Mon. – Fri. • 8 a.m. – 5 p.m. •  55 Hal l  Road Londonderry, NH

All Positions Part Time
Deli, Cashier, Customer Service, Meat Room

$16 to $26 per hour
Depending on experience 

Interested? Call 603-434-1444
Or Come by 27 Buttrick Rd.,

Londonderry

––– NOW HIRING –––

the top of the Central
Division standing, after
seeing Pinkerton drop
their first game of the
season, losing 13-27 to
Salem.

Alvirne High School
dropped to 3-2, where
they fell to fourth in the
Central standings.

Londonderry will
head to Gill Stadium on
Saturday, Oct. 12, to
take on Manchester
Central who’s looking
for their first win of the
season.

at the half.
Londonderry had a

touchdown in each of
the final quarters to fin-
ish at 44-0.

Ogden had a 50-yard
run to the endzone in
the third and senior
Griffin Massahos had a
five-yard run for a
touchdown to finish the
game.

The win put London-
derry at 3-2 and back at

points and there were
139 runners in the race.

Junior Makita Barry
of Bedford High School
was the first place fin-
isher with a time of
17:36.7. She had a 40-
second lead over senior
Haley Kavanagh of Oys-
ter River (18:16.4).
Senior Anna Fon-
dakowski came in at
third with her time of
19:02.8.

The top Lancers run-
ners were: Senior Sayde
White at 27th place with
a time of 20:39.3; Fresh-
man Stella Dutton took
34th with a time of
20:50.9; Freshman Anna
Laufersweiler was 36th,
with a time of 20:54;
Sophomore Gabriella
DeLong came in at 37
(20:58.1); Junior
Drewanna Sherman had
a time of 21:54.2 for
55th; Junior Ella
DiBuono placed 63rd
with a time of 22:13.7;
and sophomore Harper
LaBonte had a time of
22:15.5 and placed 65th.

In the Boys’ Varsity
5K: The team from
Pinkerton Academy took
first with a score of 50;
Nashua South was sec-

ond with 87-points;
Salem High School took
third place with a score
of 143.

The Lancers squad
took sixth-place with
189-points and there
were 167 runners being
recorded.

Concord High School
junior Josiah Conley

Lancers Cross Country Teams Head to Battle of the Border
CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

The Londonderry
High School Cross
Country teams

headed to Hudson on
Saturday afternoon, Oct.
5, where they participat-
ed in the 20th Annual
Battle of the Border
Cross Country races
between teams from
Massachusetts and New
Hampshire.

Alvirne High School
hosted the event and it
will also be the site for
this year’s NHIAA Meet
of Champions. 

Six races were held
throughout the after-
noon, starting with the
Freshman 3,200 Meter
Run for both boys and
girls; the Girls’ and
Boys’ 5K Junior Varity
races; and the 5K Varsity
races.

For the Girls’ Varsity:
Oyster River took first
place with a score of 49-
points; Pinkerton Acade-
my followed closely in
second place with 56-
points; and North
Andover took third with
130-points. The Lancers
girls’ team finished in
fifth-place with 189-

came in with a time of
15:11.9 for first-place. In
second, 20-second
behind Conley was sen-
ior William Simard at
15:31.3. Graham Hein-
rich, of Marshfield
Mass., was third at
15:36. 

The Lancers team’s
top runner was junior
Carson Fitzgerald, fin-
ishing in tenth place
with a time of 16:06.8;
fellow junior, Josh
Twomey finished at
16:20.2 for 16th place;
Junior Jack DiBuono had

a time of 16:59 for 34th
place; Junior Cash Rob-
les placed 58th (17:39);
Sophomore Mason Her-
nandez finished 71st
(17:59.4); Senior Alex
Vaccaro 78th (18:06.8);
and sophomore Joey
Ganey was 103rd
(18:47.3). 

Earlier in the week,
on Tuesday, Oct. 1, the
boys hosted a 5K dual
with Windham where
they were a point shy in
the results. The Jaguars
won 27-28.

Fitzgerald finished

first at 18:23; fourth
went to Twomey at
18:43; DiBuono was 6th
(19:26); Vaccaro took 8th
(19:48); and Robles was
ninth at 19:54.

This was Fitzgerald’s
third win of the season,
also winning the Bobcat
Invitational and the
Mack Plaque race.

Robles has continued
to steadily improve dur-
ing the season, scored
for the first time this
season as the Lancers
fifth runner.

Lancer junior Carson Fitzgerald finished tenth at
Hudson on Saturday. Photos by Chris Paul

Londonderry senior Sayde White was the first
Lancer to finish at the Battle of the Border.

Sam Ogden had a 50-
yard touchdown run.

◆ ◆

Football
continued from page 9
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POLITICAL ADVERTISEMENT

SATANS’ EVIL
EVIL WANTS THE UN-RESTRICTED SLAUGHTER OF 

INNOCENCE IN THE WOMB...

EVIL WANTS VIOLENCE, HATRED, AND SUFFERING 
AND TO PUT AN END TO JUSTICE...

EVIL WANTS TO SPREAD AROUND THE WORLD 
THROUGH UN-SECURED BORDERS...

PAPPAS AND KUSTER VOTED “NO” TO HR 8281...
ARE THEY TRULY WORKING FOR US OR TAKING THE SIDE OF EVIL?

FOR THE LOVE OF GOD, FAMILY AND COUNTRY 
PLEASE...PLEASE...PLEASE...VOTE REPUBLICAN

Paid for by Shine a Light Ministries, P.O. Box 89, Goffstown, N.H., 03045

by Chambers. 
Sophomore goal-

tender, Molly Tharring-
ton, had six saves in the
defeat.

Two days later, at
home against the Tim-
berlane Regional High
School Owls, it took five
periods of play to
decide a winner.

The Owls prevailed
over the Lancers with a
3-2 overtime win. 

Londonderry goals
went to junior Ere
Delorey assisted by sen-
ior Sara Daniels.

Junior Avery Stowell
added an unassisted
goal to put Londonder-
ry ahead 2-1.

Tharrington had five
saves against the War-
riors.

Londonderry was
scheduled to face
Portsmouth (0-11) at
home on Tuesday, Oct.
8, where LHS should be

able to get their fifth
win. The Clippers have
only scored one goal the
entire season.

Field Hockey Squad Look for Fifth Win
CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––———–◆

After winning in a
close decision
with the Salem

Blue Devils two weeks
ago, goals and victories
have been hard to come
by for the Londonderry
High School Field Hock-
ey team.

Last week the
Lancers suffered two
more defeats, to put
their record at 4-7 with
five games left in the reg-
ular season.

On Monday, Sept. 30,
the LHS team finished
the month on the sea-
coast where they battled
the Winnacunnet War-
riors in a 5-2 loss.

Sophomore Gemma
Murray had one of the
two Londonderry goals,
assisted by junior Alison
Chambers.

The second was an
unassisted Lancers goal

They will travel to
the State Capital the fol-
lowing day to play the 9-
3 Crimson Tide.   

Gemma Murray had one of the two Londonderry
goals against the Warriors. Photo by Chris Paul

Dennis Ray Whorley
Dennis Ray Whorley, 79, of Londonderry, NH,

passed away Monday, Sept. 16, 2024, at Catholic
Medical Center in Manchester, NH. He was born
on July 9, 1945, in Bedford, VA, a son of the late
Clarence and Gertrude (Burnette) Whorley. He
had been a resident of Londonderry for the past
two years, formerly living in Chester, NJ. 

Dennis was an integral part of the Chester, NJ
community. He served on the library board for
many years and was a member of the Chester
Optimist Club. Dennis enjoyed playing guitars and
taking beautiful photographs that decorate his
family’s homes. He will be sorely missed by all. 

Dennis is survived by his loving wife of 57
years, Nancy (Strople) Whorley; son, Andy
Whorley; two daughters, Shannon Robinson and
April Robbins; four grandchildren Hailey Rob-
bins, Cameron Robbins, Winfield Robinson, and
Brandon Robbins; and his sister, Carolyn McKee.

Following cremation, the family will hold a
private service at a later date. In lieu of flowers
memorial contributions may be made to the
American Heart Association. The Peabody
Funeral Home & Crematorium is assisting the
family with arrangements. To send a condolence
please visit www.peabodyfuneralhome.com.

OBITUARY
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bers of the public are invit-
ed to attend this compli-
mentary event. The con-
cert will include classic
baroque works by Vivaldi
and Telemann, among oth-
ers, as well as new music
written in this century. A
social hour will follow the
concert, where attendees
can enjoy light refresh-
ments. For more informa-
tion, please visit
https://stpeterslondon-
derry.org/ or https://bran-
denburgandbeyond.com .

Trunk or Treat Time 
Get ready for some

Halloween fun on Thurs-
day, Oct. 24, from 5 - 7
p.m., at One Verani Way,
Londonderry. Bring your
family and friends for a
night of Free admission,
lively music, fun games,
and exciting prizes. Cos-
tumes are highly encour-
aged, so get creative and
come dressed to impress.
Don't forget to bring your
treat bucket to collect all

the goodies. Local Busi-
nesses: If you'd like to
reserve a trunk space,
please email mweigler@-
brokerstitlenh.com.

Oktoberfest 
Join Londonderry Rep-

ublican Committee for
Oktoberfest event at the
American Legion in Lon-
donderry on Oct. 12, from
3 - 5 p.m. Don't miss out on
this fantastic event! Spon-
sorships are available. Pur-
chase tickets at secur-
e.anedot.com/londonder-
ry-republican-committ-
ee/oktoberfest2024

Cookbook Potluck
Come to the Leach

Library on Wednesday,
Oct. 16 at 12:30 p.m. for a
soup and bread themed
potluck. Prepare and share
a recipe from either Easy
Soups from Scratch with
Breads to Match by Ivy
Manning or Soup Swap by
Kathy Gunst. The library
cannot guarantee each

Leaf Relief

Cleaning &
Maintenance

Free Estimates

Commercial/Residential

Soffit/Fascia Repairs
Jim Peck
603-434-5300

www.jimpeckco.com

Go
Seamless

JUNK CARS • SCRAP METAL
“If It’s Metal, We’ll Take It”

For more details call: 
S&S Metals Recycling Inc.

603-537-1000 or       877-537-1007
196 Rockingham Rd., Londonderry, NH

TOLL
FREE

PICK UP SERVICE AVAILABLE

SCOTT LAVOIE CONSTRUCTION LLC
ROOFING • SIDING • MASONRY
ROOF SNOW & ICE REMOVAL

FULLY INSURED
FREE ESTIMATES

1-603-434-8910
1-603-571-8688

ScottLavoieConstructionLLC.com

SCOTT LAVOIE

Accelerated Landscaping LLC
Preston Weaver • 603-339-3762

pweaver8708@gmail.com
Free Estimates - Fully Insured

Mowing, Spring/Fall Clean Ups, Bark
Mulch, Brush Hog Service, Stump

Grinding, Plowing, Skid Steer Service

We Work All Year!
Snow Removal Offered

www.snhqualityroofing.com
603-818-4075

God Bless

Defrancesco’s
Southern New Hampshire

––– QUALITY –––
ROOFING, SIDING & CONTRACTING

Asphalt, Metal & Rubber Roofing 
Siding • Windows • Doors • Additions

Senior
Citizen & 
Veteran

Discount

AROUND TOWNAROUND TOWNAROUND TOWN
Around Town Policy: This section is meant to be used to announce free events to the communities. If
your group is receiving money for what they are publicizing, there will be a charge of $40/week per
paper. All Around Town/Calendar Items will be held to 100 words maximum. All free announcements in
the Around Town/Calendar section can run a maximum of three weeks. Deadline for submissions is
Monday at 5 p.m. Please send items to londonderrytimes@nutpub.net. 

St Jude Craft Fair
St. Jude will hold a

craft fair on Saturday, Nov.
9, from 9 a.m. - 4 p.m. The
fair features beautiful
handmade gifts made by
our crafters, including spe-
cial items for pets, as well
as a cookie walk, bake sale
and White Elephant
rooms. Also, features are
Famous Raffles, with many
items, a stunning hand-
made quilt raffle, a
Thanksgiving basket, a
50/50, gift cards raffles.
Food and beverages,

including lunch will be
available for sale. We will
also have several vendors
participating. All proceeds
will benefit the Parish.

Brandenburg and
Beyond Ensemble

St. Peter's Episcopal
Church in Londonderry is
pleased to host a concert
featuring the re-nown
baroque ensemble Bran-
denburg and Beyond. This
event will occur Sunday,
Oct. 20, at 3 p.m., at St.
Peter's Church, 3 Peabody
Row Londonderry. Mem-

Collins Bros. Painting Co.
Mark & Jack Collins

• Interior & Exterior
• Power Washing
• Light Carpentry

603-886-0668 • 603-507-5936
Fully Insured

dish's ingredients or accu-
rate preparation. Food ser-
ved at this program may
contain or come into con-
tact with common allerg-
ens. Registration opens on
Monday, Sept. 16 and is
limited to 15 participants.
Copies of the books will be
available to check out at
the library's main desk.

Voter Information 
The Supervisors of the

Voter Checklist will meet
to correct the checklist
and register voters at the
Town Clerk's Office on:
Oct. 29, from 6 - 7 p.m. To
register to vote, one must
provide: Proof of London-
derry residency, Proof of
citizenship (passport,
birth certificate, naturaliza-
tion papers), Proof of age,
and Photo ID. Applicants
for registration who pos-
sess proof of identity, age,
citizenship, and domicile
should bring that proof

Trunk or Treat
A Free Event at First

Baptist Church of Hudson
on Thursday, Oct. 31, dur-
ing Trick or Treat 6 - 8 p.m.
Dress up in your favorite
costume, then “trick or
treat” from trunk to trunk
(all decorated in fun
themes-nothing scary to
frighten little ones) in the
church parking lot located
at the corner of Central
Street and Greeley Street.
Free Hot Dogs, Chips, Apple
Cider, Hot Cocoa And Cof-
fee. All ages welcome.

When you’re ready to travel, 
call us at 603-540-1789

sean@attentivetravelagency.com

Chelsey Chelsey 
Holston

REALTOR 
NH 067466,

MA 9526332
Cell: (508)380-6138 

Office: (603)912-5470
Chelseyholston@gmail.com

130 Main St., Ste. 105, Salem, NH 
Each Office Independently Owned and Operated

◆ ◆

SERVICE DIRECTORY
◆ ◆

Got
Stumps?

Free Estimates • Fully Insured

LevelStumps@gmail.com
www.LevelStumps.com

(603)216-7340
603-216-2593

www.ethicalhomepro.com 

Servicing your Heating, Air Conditioning & Water
Heater needs the right way, The Ethical Way

• High Quality Roof-
ing

• Affordable Pricing
• Above & Beyond

Customer Service
978-648-0781

hunter@ridgeroofingcompany.com
Fully Insured • Free Estimates

Continued on page 15
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CLASSIFIED ADS
$100 PER WORD

Ad Will Run in Our Newspaper and Reach 
All Homes in Londonderry!

Deadline for placing ads is MMoonnddaayy aatt 33 pp..mm.. 
for that week’s publication. 
ALL ADS MUST BE PRE-PAID 

$15 MINIMUM CHARGE
Minimum charge does not include bold type.

e-mail text to:
billing@nutpub.net

Call: 
537-2760 

◆ ◆

Classified Advertising 
◆ ◆
READERS ARE CAUTIONED that we occasionally run ads that require an initial investment or money in advance. We urge our
readers to “do their homework” before responding to any ad, check out the advertiser thoroughly and verify their claims to your
total satisfaction. Only then should you proceed at your own risk. We try to screen ads that require you to send money before
receiving a product or service. But these efforts are no substitute for your own investigation, and we don’t endorse or guarantee
any claims made in any of the ads we publish. If you want more information about claims made in ads on subjects such as work
at home opportunities, travel or vacation specials, purchasing land or vehicles from government surplus or below wholesale,
loans or other credit opportunities (including credit repair), or weight loss and other health products and services, we urge you
to contact the Office of Attorney General, Consumer Protection Bureau, 33 Capitol Street, Concord, NH 03301 (603-271-3641) or
the Better Business Bureau at 603-224-1991. Publisher is not responsible for any loss of business if an ad does not run,
and we reserve the right to revoke any ad if deemed necessary. No refunds will be given for prepaid ads.

◆ ◆

National/Regional Listings
Find Ads From Around New England and Across the Country

◆ ◆

Local Classifieds
LOCAL LISTINGS FOR LOCAL READERS

◆ ◆

National/Regional Listings
Find Ads From Around New England and Across the Country

MASONRY
Michael’s Masonry specializing in
repair work, steps, walk-ways,
retaining walls, pointing, stonework.
free estimate 603-421-0686 

AUTOS WANTED
Donate Your Car to Veterans
Today! Help and Support our Vet-
erans. Fast - Free pick up. 100%
tax deductible. Call 1-800-245-
0398.

Cash For Cars! We buy all cars!
Junk, high-end, totaled-it doesn’t
matter! Get free towing and same
day cash! Newer Models too! Call
1-866-258-6720.

AUTO DONATION
Donate Your Car, Truck, Boat, RV
and more to support our veterans!
Schedule a Fast, Free vehicle pick-
up and receive a top tax deduction!
Call Veteran Car Donations at 1-
888-305-7286 today!

FINANCIAL
Wesley Financial Group, LLC Time-

share Cancellation Experts. Over
$50,000,000 in timeshare debt and
fees cancelled in 2019. Get free
informational package and learn
how to get rid of your timeshare!
Free Consultations. Over 450 posi-
tive reviews. Call 877-621-7517.

FOR RENT
One or more weeks at Orange Lake
Country Club Resort in one floor
unit. Enjoy water park, swimming
pools, restaurants, golf and more
on the days you choose not to go
to Disney. Sleeps six, full kitchen,
washer/dryer $2100, includes
much. 978-371-2442 Feb, Mar,
April weeks.

HEALTH & FITNESS
Dental insurance from Physicians
Mutual Insurance Company. Cov-
erage for 400+ procedures. Real
dental insurance - not just a dis-

count plan. Get your free Informa-
tion Kit with details! 1-855-526-
1060 www.dental50plus.com/ads
#6258.

Attention oxygen therapy users!
Discover oxygen therapy that
moves with you with Inogen
Portable Oxygen Concentrators.
Free information kit. 1-866-477-
9045.

HOME SERVICES
Aging Roof? New Homeowner?
Got Storm Damage? You need a
local expert provider that proudly
stands behind their work. Fast, free
estimate. Financing available. Call
1-888-878-9091.

Water damage cleanup: A small
amount of water can cause major
damage to your home. Our trusted
professionals dry out wet areas &

repair to protect your family & your
home value! Call 24/7: 1-888-872-
2809. Have zip code!

Get Dish Satellite TV + Internet!
Free install, Free HD-DVR Upgrade.
80,000 On-Demand Movies, Plus
Limited Time Up To $600 In Gift
Cards. Call Today! 1-833-800-
0411.

Professional lawn service: Fertil-
ization, weed control, seeding, aer-
ation & mosquito control. Call now
for a free quote. Ask about our first
application special! 1-833-606-
6777.

MEDICAL SUPPLIES
Portable Oxygen Concentrator may
be covered by Medicare! Reclaim
independence and mobility with
the compact design and long-last-
ing battery of Inogen One. Free
information kit! Call 888-520-
9687.

MISCELLANEOUS
Prepare for power outages today
with a Generac Home Standby
Generator. Act now to receive a
Free 5-Year warranty with qualify-
ing purchase* Call 1-855-948-
6176 today to schedule a free
quote. It’s not just a generator. It’s
a power move.

Eliminate gutter cleaning forever!
LeafFilter, the most advanced
debris-blocking gutter protection.
Schedule free LeafFilter estimate
today. 20% off Entire Purchase.
10% Senior & Military Discounts.
Call 1-833-610-1936.

Bath & shower updates in as little
as 1 day! Affordable prices - No
payments for 18 months!  Lifetime
warranty & professional installs.
Senior & military discounts avail-
able. 1-877-543-9189.

Become a published author. We
want to read your book! Dorrance

or wants to regain access to their
entire home. Call AmeriGlide
today! 1-833-399-3595.

Home break-ins take less than 60
seconds. Don’t wait! Protect your
family, your home, your assets
now for as little as 70¢/day! 1-844-
591-7951.

MobileHelp America’s premier
mobile medical alert system.
Whether you’re home or away. For
safety & peace of mind. No long
term contracts! Free brochure! Call
1-888-489-3936.

4G LTE Home Internet Now Avail-
able! Get GotW3 with lightning fast
speeds plus take your service with
you when you travel! As low as
$109.99/mo! 1-877-452-1183.

Caring For An Aging Loved One?
Wondering about options like sen-
ior-living communities and in-
home care? Caring.com’s Family
Advisors are here to help take the
guesswork out of senior care for
you and your family. Call for your
Free, no-obligation consultation:1-
844-556-4158.

Eliminate Gutter Cleaning Forever!
LeafFilter, the most advanced
debris-blocking gutter protection.
Schedule a Free LeafFilter estimate
today. 20% off Entire Purchase.
Plus 10% Senior & Military Dis-
counts. Call 1-855-925-2643.

Get Dish Satellite TV + Internet!
Free Install, Free HD-DVR
Upgrade, 80,000 On Demand
Movies, Plus Limited Time Up To
$600 In Gift Cards. Call Today! 1-
877-494-7039.

Get Hughesnet Highspeed Inter-
net! With Speeds Up To 100mbps,
Unlimited Data, Plus Game &
Stream As Much As You Want! Call
Today, $100 Gift Card! 1-877-459-
1615

Safe Step North America’s #1
Walk-In Tub. Comprehensive life-
time warranty. Top-of-the-line
installation and service. Now fea-
turing our Free shower package
and $1600 Off for a limited time!
Call today! Financing available. Call
Safe-Step 1-866-281-8729.

Switch And Save Up To $250/Year
on your talk, text and data. No con-
tract and no hidden fees. Unlimited
talk and text with flexible data
plans. Premium nationwide cover-
age. 100% U.S. based customer
service. Limited time offer: get
50% off on any new account. Use
code GIFT50. For more informa-
tion, call 1-866-926-5071.

Publishing trusted since 1920.
Consultation, production, promo-
tion & distribution. Call for free
author’s guide 1-877-729-4998 or
visit dorranceinfo.com/ads.

Safe Step. North America’s #1
Walk-in tub. Comprehensive life-
time warranty. Top-of-the-line
installation and service. Now fea-
turing our free shower package &
$1600 off - limited time! Financing
available. 1-855-417-1306.

Wesley Financial Group, LLC Time-
share Cancellation ExpertsOver
$50,000,000 in timeshare debt &
fees cancelled in 2019. Get free
info package & learn how to get rid
of your timeshare! Free consulta-
tions. Over 450 positive reviews.
833-308-1971.

DIRECTV Stream - Carries the
most local MLB Games! Choice
Package $89.99/mo for 12 mos
Stream on 20 devices at once. HBO
Max included for 3 mos (w/Choice
Package or higher.) No contract or
hidden fees! Some restrictions
apply. Call IVS 1-866-859-0405.

Replace your roof w/the best look-
ing & longest lasting material steel
from Erie Metal Roofs! 3 styles &
multiple colors available. Guaran-
teed to last a lifetime! Limited Time
Offer up to 50% off install + Addi-
tional 10% off install (military,
health & 1st responders.) 1-833-
370-1234.

Jacuzzi Bath Remodel can install a
new, custom bath or shower in as
little as one day. For a limited time,
waving ALL installation costs!
(Additional terms apply. Subject to
change and vary by dealer. Offer
ends 12/29/24.) Call 1-844-501-
3208.

Don’t let the stairs limit your
mobility! Discover the ideal solu-
tion for anyone who struggles on
the stairs, is concerned about a fall

FIREWOOD

Seasoned firewood, Cut, Split, and
Delivered. $375 a cord. 
Call (603)434-1212.

FREE

Free Yamaha Baby Grand Piano,
Black is great condition 
If interested contact me via email at
terrolson22@outlook.com

Advertise 
with the

Londonderry
Times!

537-2760
ads@nutpub.net 
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Londonderry Police Log
Selections taken from the daily Londonderry Police Logs

Monday - Sept. 30
3:03 a.m. Building on
Loan Street Checked/
Secured during Suspi-
cious Activity. 
7:33 a.m. Criminal
Threatening investigat-
ed on Vista Ridge Drive.
8:44 a.m. Services ren-
dered for Unlawful Activ-
ities at the Kendall Pond
Conservation Area on
South Road.
9:47 a.m. Assist Hudson
Police with an arrest on
Gilcreast Road. Wayne
Cameron, 58, of Nashua,
charged with Receiving
Stolen Property - Over
$1,501.
11:15 a.m. Six officers
investigate a Burglary at
the AMC Classic Lon-
donderry 10 on Orchard
View Drive.
2:59 p.m. Suspicious
Activity investigated on
Charleston Avenue.
3:58 p.m. Motor Vehicle
Stop on Page Road, at
Rockingham Road, leads
to an arrest made by
four officers. Zachary
Frankenberger, 31, of
Manchester, charged on

Bench Warrants.
5:26 p.m. Peace rest-
ored by four officers
during a Disturbance on
Litchfield Road.
8:29 p.m. Disturbance
investigated at the Mac-
gregor Cut Apartments
on Stonehenge Road.

Tuesday - Oct. 1
10:09 a.m. Three offi-
cers investigate a Bur-
glary at the AMC Classic
Londonderry 10, on
Orchard View Drive.
1:21 p.m. Services ren-
dered for a Welfare
Check on Loan Street.
1:43 p.m. Welfare Check
conducted on Charl-
eston Avenue.
2:09 p.m. Warrant
served at the N.H. State
Prison, Concord. Kevin
Lavoie, 58, of Concord,
charged with: Indecent
Exposure/Gross Lewd-
ness; and Disorderly
Conduct.
2:11 p.m. Services ren-
dered for Identity Theft
on Wimbledon Drive.

Wednesday - Oct. 2
12:39 a.m. Services ren-
dered at Continental

Paving, on West Road,
for Suspicious Activity. 
1:05 a.m. Three officers
respond to Suspicious
Activity reported at NRG
Zone Fitness & Yoga on
Nashua Road.
5:56 a.m. Services ren-
dered by three officers
for Suspicious Activity
reported on Loan Street.
7:13 a.m. Suspicious
Activity reported at the
AMC Classic Londonder-
ry 10 on Orchard View
Drive.
7:30 a.m. Welfare Check
investigated on Merlin
Place.
12:02 p.m. Officer(s)
Keep the Peace on High
Range Road.
12:29 p.m. Three offi-
cers Keep the Peace on
High Range Road.
10:32 p.m. Three offi-
cers respond to a Distur-
bance reported on
Hovey Road.
11:46 p.m. Three offi-
cers assist the London-
derry Fire Department
with transportation to a
Hospital from Clark
Road.

Thursday - Oct. 3
12:32 a.m. Services ren-
dered for Suspicious
Activity on Page Road.
1:20 a.m. Juvenile Off-
enses investigated on
Chartwell Court.
11 a.m. Four officers
respond to Suspicious
Activity reported at the
Morrison House Muse-
um on Pillsbury Road. 
1:12 p.m. Services ren-
dered for Larceny/Forg-
ery/Fraud on Yorkshire
Lane.
2:13 p.m. Shooting Com-
plaint reported at Mus-
qaush Conservation
Area from Hickory Hill
Drive.
3:05 p.m. Shoplifting
investigated at Mack’s
Apple on Mammoth
Road.
5:01 p.m. Three officers
respond to a report of a
Missing Person on
Symmes Drive.
8:12 p.m. Juvenile
Offenses investigated on
Vista Ridge Drive.

Friday - Oct. 4
8:38 a.m. Missing Per-

son reported on
Symmes Drive.
9:19 a.m. Welfare Check
conducted on Canter-
bury Lane.
10:35 a.m. Assisted the
Londonderry Fire De-
partment with services
at Northeast Turf & Irri-
gation on Tinker Avenue.
4:02 p.m. Services ren-
dered to Keep the Peace
at NRG Zone Fitness &
Yoga on Nashua Road.
5:24 p.m. Welfare Check
conducted at the N.H.
State Liquor Warehouse
on Rockingham Road.
8:29 p.m. Domestic Dis-
turbance reported on
Fieldstone Drive leads to
an arrest made by four
officers. Carolyn Par-
rington, 45, of London-
derry, charged with:
Domestic Violence (Sim-
ple Assault - Bodily In-
jury); and Criminal Thre-
atening with a Deadly
Weapon.
9:37 p.m. Services ren-
dered by three officers
for a Domestic Distur-
bance on Sparhawk

Drive.
Saturday - Oct. 5

1:37 p.m. Shooting Com-
plaint investigated at the
Powerlines on Wiley Hill
Road. 
1:59 p.m. Three officers
respond to Vista Ridge
Drive to Keep the Peace,
provide transportation
to a hospital. 
7:09 p.m. Services ren-
dered for Suspicious
Activity on Vista Ridge
Drive.
8:14 p.m. Welfare Check
investigat
ed on Pinyon Place.

Sunday - Oct. 6
6:52 p.m. Disturbance
on Ross Drive results in
transportation to a hos-
pital. 
7:39 p.m. Disturbance at
Turf Depot on Nashua
Road results in trans-
portation to a hospital.
7:59 p.m. Suspicious
Activity, Building Check-
ed/Secured on Macin-
tosh Lane.
8:23 p.m. Suspicious
Activity investigated on
King John Drive.

◆ ◆

Around Town
Continued from page 13

when they come to regis-
ter. Qualified applicants
who do not possess proof
or who do not bring proof
with them may register if
they sign an affidavit
attesting to their qualifica-
tions for identity, age,
domicile and citizenship. 

Wiggle Worms 
From now through Oct.

16, toddlers and their care-
givers are invited to the
Leach Library on Tuesday
or Wednesday mornings at
10:30 a.m. for story time
with songs, rhymes,
books, and more. This pro-
gram is designed for ages
2-3, but older children are
welcome to join in. Regis-
tration is required and
begins one week before
each session. 

Be Kind - Do Good
The Sonshine Soup

Kitchen located at 6 Crys-
tal Ave., Derry, is seeking
Volunteers age 18+ for help

preparing and serving
drive-through meals: Mon-
day -Thursday, 3 - 6 p.m.
For more information or if
you have questions call
603.437.2833.

Free PFOA Water Test
By NHDES

You can request a water
sampling here: Southern
NH PFOA Investigation Pri-
vate Well-Testing Request
Form Survey (surveymon-
key.com) Questions con-
tact Amy Rousseau | PFAS
Response Administrator -
MtBE Remediation Bureau

at NH Department of Envi-
ronmental Services Email:
Amy.Rousseau@des.nh.gov,
Phone: 603.271.8801

Child Find
Londonderry School

District Announces Free
community child find pro-
gram for all residents ages
two 1/2 yrs (2.5) through
five yrs., 11 months (5.11)
of age who are suspected
of have developmental
concerns child find will be
held at: Moose Hill School
150 Pillsbury Rd., London-
derry. 




