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On Their Way Londonderry senior defensive specialist Riley
Boles leads the team onto the field at Lancer Park on Saturday afternoon
for their quarterfinals game against Pinkerton Academy. The LHS squad
won that game 25-13 and will host Salem on Salem for a semifinals game.
See the entire story on page 9. Photo by Chris Paul 
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ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

The Londonderry
Conservation Com-
mission held its

regularly scheduled
meeting on Oct. 26.

During the meeting
the Commission had a
design review for a site
plan at 215 and 217
Rockingham Road. Rep-
resenting the owners
was Doug MacGuire.

ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

During the Nov. 1
Londonderry Town
Council meeting

the Council heard from
Josh Bourdon and Jeff
Moulton from the Derry
Net Zero Task Force.

Bourdon said that
they created the task
force with a goal of hav-
ing all of the Town
owned buildings and the
School District buildings
running on renewable
energy by 2025.

Bourdon explained
that they added people
to the task force from
different boards and
departments so that
when decisions are
made there are not any

surprises.
He said that by this

time next year the
municipality should
have met its goal and
then they are going to
work on the school
buildings.

Town Councilor Deb
Paul said that when she
heard about what they
were doing in Derry she
was hopeful they would
be able to come to Lon-
donderry and present to
them.

“When I heard about
this project that you’ve
been doing for a long
time I thought it was
great and to see it be so
successful I couldn’t
wait to invite you in here
because I think that Lon-

donderry can do that,”
Paul said.

It was explained by
Moulton that when they
first started off they col-
lected energy data to
determine what build-
ings were underperform-
ing when it comes to
energy.

He said that over the
years they have been
able to implement differ-

◆ ◆

Derry Energy Group Provides
Information to Town Council

continued on page 3

ALEX MALM
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

At the Nov. 1 Lon-
donderry Town
Council meeting

the Council heard from
Assistant Town Solicitor
Mike Malaguti regarding
a proposed settlement
in the Pennichuck Rate
Case.

It was explained by
Malaguti that about a
year ago the Town was
notified that Pennichuck
which is one of the
Town’s water utility
companies that they
were seeking a 21% total
increase in revenue and
was going to file it with
the Public Utility Com-
mission.

The Town Council
then approved the hir-
ing of an attorney to rep-
resent them in the PUC
case.

After reviewing mate-
rials, going through the
discovery process and
hiring an expert witness
to review materials they
were then offered a settle-
ment offer which would
be a 16.5% increase.

Malaguti said on Oct.
18 the Town Council
along with the different
attorneys involved and
the expert witness all
met during a non-public
meeting and recom-
mended to the Town
Council that they accept
the settlement offer.

He explained that
after the expert witness
reviewed the different
materials they deter-
mined that the increases
are mostly justified
under law. He noted that
as a regulated utility
they have the right to
recover increases from
the ratepayers. If they
were to go to trial
Malaguti said that they
would likely have to pay
more than 16%.

It was also pointed
out by Malaguti that
the Department of Con-
sumer Affairs and the
Department of Energy
have also said that they
are in favor of the settle-

Town Council Approves
Water Rate Settlement

He explained that
currently the one lot
developed has an exist-
ing office building on it.

MacGuire said that
the developed lot is not

Conservation Commission Hears
Mixed Use Development Proposal 

continued on page 2
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in the best of shape and
the parking lot is not
convenient to access
points on Rockingham
Road, and said that the
second lot is currently
vacant. He explained
that the proposal is to
consolidate the two
properties and con-
struct something more
in line with the Perfor-
mance Overlay District
(POD).

He said that they
would like to construct
a new 6,000 Square foot
building that will be
two-stories, with the
first floor commercial
and second floor resi-
dential, which would be
a mixed-use building.
He added that it would
have six residential
units. He said that they
are eliminating all the
curb cuts, where they
technically could have
three, into one, which
will improve circulation
around the building.

MacGuire told the
Commission that the
site is fairly flat with
some wetlands in the
rear of the property to
the south. He said that
the wetland is generat-
ed by existing run-off by
the two properties, not-
ing the parking lot
drains right to the wet-
land. He mentioned that
the land owners have
owned the properties
for quite some time and
have tried to do some
improvements over the

years.
He also said that

there is an existing cul-
vert that was installed
to collect the low point
and bring it all the way
under Rockingham
Road, which is the
drainage outfall for the
wetland area. He
explained that their pro-
posal is to increase the
elevation at the site
approximately four feet
to be able to collect the
drainage in a closed
drainage system. He
added that they would
like to do a wet pond at
the lowest point of the
property, which is adja-
cent to the wetland. He
mentioned that they
believe by improving
the site, they will better
protect the existing wet-
lands by providing
drainage mitigation
allowing it to naturalize.

He added that all the
proposed pavement is
now curbed and collect-
ed to drainage catch
basins that are directed
to the treatment system
prior to discharge to
the wetland. He noted
that they are not pro-
posing any wetland
impacts.

Commission mem-
ber Michael Speltz
asked about the plan
having pavement in the
buffer.

MacGuire told the
Commission that they
are proposing some
parking in the buffer
because they are trying

to work with what is
already on site, as there
is existing parking in
the buffer right now
that is unmitigated. He
added that they are pro-
posing to still have
pavement in the buffer,
but from an erosion
standpoint everything
is collected and direct-
ed to the wet pond.

Commission mem-
ber Deborah Lievens
asked if they would be
applying for a Condi-
tional Use Permit, and
MacGuire said that they
would be.

Speltz explained that
the Commission does
not have the authority
to give them that partic-
ular use of pavement in
the buffer. MacGuire
said that the Commis-
sion has the authority
for access and vehicular
circulation.

Commission mem-
ber Mike Byerly pointed
out that usually the CUP
is requested if there is
no other access to the
property.

MacGuire said that it
just states for access
and circulation rather
than access to the prop-
erty on the conditional
use permit application.
He said that his assump-
tion regarding the con-
ditional use permit re-
quirement, is the goal is
to limit impervious area
that drains directly to
wetlands from the
buffer.

Lievens said that the
buffer loses its signifi-
cance or purpose by
placing pavement there.

Conservation
Continued from page 1

MacGuire stated that
this is not new con-
struction as this is an
existing site that has
pavement within five
feet of the wetland itself
and drains the entire
pavement area directly
to the wetland. He
added that all the
drainage on the site has
played a role in creating
the wetland area.

MacGuire said that
overall he feels that the
plan is an improvement
to the site, even with a
buffer impact of approx-
imately 16,000 square
feet. He said that cur-
rently there is 8,000
square feet of buffer
impact on the site.

Byerly asked if the
existing building would
be renovated. MacGuire
said that it would be a
new building, pulling it
closer to the road and
placing the parking in
front of the building,
which he stated are
some criteria of the per-
formance overlay dis-
trict.

Byerly explained
that this is the opportu-
nity to shrink the build-
ing and parking spots,
so pavement would not
be placed in the buffer.

MacGuire said that
while it is a valid point
he doesn’t think it is
realistic for the devel-
opment based on dis-
cussions he’s had with
the owner.

He said that when
looking at the functions
and values of the adja-
cent wetlands on site,
he didn’t know if hav-
ing a 50-foot buffer is
really worth having, as
the vast majority is
related to the discharge
from the parking lot.

Speltz asked what
the parking require-
ments are for what they
are proposing. Mac-
Guire said that it would
be two spaces per unit
which would equal 12.

Lievens said that she
thought it was too much
to fit on the two proper-
ties. Byerly also echo-
ed Lievens’ concerns.

MacGuire said that
he understood what the
Commission was saying
and said that he doesn’t
like to advocate for a
project that he doesn’t
believe is appropriate.

He said that he
believes the project is
appropriate and noted
that he was unsure of
what else could be done
with the wetland on the
property.

He told the Commis-
sion that he reviewed a
possibility of making
the building a one
story building and
removing the 12 parking
spaces, but noted that
they still would have
impact areas associated
with the building and
impact areas associated
with the buffer.

Lievens asked if
there was documenta-
tion by the wetland sci-
entist that the wetland
was created by outflow.
MacGuire said that he
didn’t have the informa-
tion with him at the
meeting but could get
the information to the
Commission, saying
that he can have the
wetland scientist put
together a packet for
the Board to review.

Speltz asked if the
application could be
tabled until the next
meeting.

GIS Manager Amy

Kizak said that the DRC
comments are due by
Nov. 5 and they will be
back before the Com-
mission for the condi-
tional use permit.

Byerly asked if they
need a variance for the
project to move for-
ward. MacGuire said
that they are going in
front of the Zoning
Board of Adjustment
for the use.

MacGuire said that
his client didn’t want to
lose a month of design
review while waiting for
the ZBA. He pointed out
that residential and
commercial are allowed
uses, but not combined,
which he thinks is a
technicality. 

He said that he is
fine to hold off on com-
ments, as the Commis-
sion needs more infor-
mation.

Kizak said that the
Commission could
make one of their com-
ments that they request
the applicant come
back with more informa-
tion.

The Commission had
a number of comments
for the plan including
recommending not us-
ing the Callery pear tree
or honey locust tree in
their landscaping plan.
To keep snow storage
out of the buffer. Avoid
disturbing the buffer,
noting the silt fence
should be back from the
edge of wetland. Reduc-
ing/eliminating the
pavement in the buffer.
To request the wetland
scientist report. To
request visuals of the
site. Recommend
reduce parking require-
ments (waiver) to elimi-
nate spaces.

Karen A. Archer, Independent Licensed Agent of Londonderry

603-553-9040  
Karen@KarenArcherInsurance.com

Life / Health / Medicare 

Providing Insurance Solutions

Karen Archer Insurance, LLC
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2FREE Junk Car
Removal!

We will pay up to $60000

for some cars and trucks.
Mon. – Sat. • 8 a.m. – 5 p.m. •  55 Hal l  Road Londonderry, NH

ed with bonfires on Nov.
5th. The celebration was
‘exported’ to the
Colonies but ceased in
the USA at the time of
the Revolutionary War.

It is generally marked
in present times by set-
ting off fireworks, light-
ing large bonfires and in
many cases by holding a
procession through the
town or village. When I
was a child most chil-
dren would build a
scarecrow like figure
from old clothes stuffed
with straw and push it
door to door in a wheel-
barrow asking “penny
for the Guy”. The money
collected was spent on
fireworks – small “bang-
ers” cost one penny
each in those days. On
the 5th, the several dif-
ferent “Guys” were
hoisted onto the village
bonfire and the effigies
were burnt.

One of the best

events was at Ottery St.
Mary. As teenagers, I
and my friends would
often go to that one as it
was only ten miles away.
Burning tar barrels were
raced through the main
street. It started in late
afternoon when the
younger children car-
ried smaller burning
barrels (pins or firkins)
and culminated with the
really large ones carried
by the men late in the
evening. A short You-
Tube video may be seen
at www.youtube.com/w-
atch?v=bLS3FwkSYUo.
View the video and you
will understand why our
Police and Fire Depart-
ments might not permit
it in Londonderry. (Par-
ticipants protected them-
selves by draping thick,
wet, potato sacks over
their head and shoul-
ders and wearing thick
wet work gloves.)

In some places the

Why the British Celebrating Guy Fawkes Day on Nov. 5
DAVID J. ELLIS
SUBMISSION————–––––————–◆

Last Friday the Brit-
ish celebrated Guy
Fawkes Day. As it is

a particularly British
thing that I thought I
might explain.

Nov. 5, 1605, was the
date of one of several
insurrections that have
occurred during British
history. That one was
planned by a group of
Catholics, led by Guido
(Guy) Fawkes, who
intended to assassinate
King James I in order to
replace him with a
Catholic. They placed
barrels of gunpowder in
the cellar below the
House of Lords, which
he was due to visit. The
plot was discovered and
foiled. The following
year Parliament passed
the Thanksgiving Act
(not our Thanksgiving)
that allowed the Kings
survival to be celebrat-

original motive was
modified to accommo-
date a local event.
Lewes, where I attended
University, commemo-

rates seventeen Protes-
tant martyrs who were
burnt at the stake in
1555. That parade includ-
ed burning crosses and

chants of “No Popery”. A
short YouTube video may
be seen at www.youtub-
e.com/watch?v=YFW2llT-
ndrQ.

LET OUR FAMILY CARE FOR YOURS

Dr Alyssa Ebright DMD    
Dr Trevor Smart DMD   

Always Accepting New Patients
77 Gilcreast Road, Unit 1004, Londonderry 

603-434-8800 • Londonderrydentist.com
ebrightsmartdental@gmail.com 

ment.
Malaguti said that

while he knows that a 16
percent increase is a
“bitter pill to swallow,”
he thinks that it would
be in their best interest
to accept the settle-
ment.

Town Councilor Deb
Paul said that while she
thinks they should ac-
cept the offer based on
the information present-
ed to them she hopes
that they take more
steps forward to lever-
age themselves with the
company and keep an
eye on what they are
doing.

Town Councilor Tom

Dolan said that he didn’t
understand how the
increase was justifiable.

“I still can’t come to
grips with it being justi-
fied,” he said.

Town Council Chair-
man John Farrell said
that while it’s tough to
take the settlement offer
he said that they would
have to spend thousands
of dollars on attorney
fees and will likely be
unsuccessful if they go to

trial based on the advice
they have received.

He also said that they
need to speak with the
leadership for the com-
pany.

“We need to have
another conversation
with their leadership
team,” Farrell said.

They are going to
invite the company’s
leadership to a future
Council meeting.

The Town Council
begrudgingly voted in
favor of the settlement.

◆ ◆

Settlement
Continued from page 1

ent things like going
from oil to natural gas,
converting to LED lights,
and having a pilot solar
field at their transfer sta-
tion which has led them
to seeing significant sav-
ings for energy.

They also recently
finished a request for
proposals for a new
solar field which will
completely put all the
Town Buildings on re-
newable energy and will
save the Town about
$3.5 million dollars.
They expect to have that
solar field operational
by 2023.

Bourdon said that
they were waiting for
Gov. Chris Sununu to
sign legislation which
will allow them to ex-
pand the size of solar
fields.

“That legislation is
key,” Bourdon said.

Bourdon said that
they also want to help
communities across the
state replicate what they
are doing which is why
they went to the Town
Council meeting saying
that they are willing to
answer any questions
they have about what
they have done or give
them advice if they go
forward with it in Lon-
donderry.

Following the presen-
tation Town Council
Chairman John Farrell
asked the Council if they
thought it was some-
thing they should ex-
plore more.

The other council
members agreed and
Farrell asked Town Ad-
ministrator Kevin Smith,
along with staff to look
into what they can do
for it.

He said that they can
then discuss it again at a
future meeting and in-
vite Bourdon and Moul-
ton to come back.

The next Londonder-
ry Town Council meet-
ing is slated for Nov. 22
at 7 p.m.

◆ ◆

Energy
Continued from page 1

The British celebrate Guy Fawkes Day on Nov. 5 each year. 
Courtesy photo
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Letters
Questions

To the editor,
Finally, Paul Minnillo

has written something
that is true, verifiable
(Eureka). I had written
several letters.  Also
true, many have been
towards refuting your,
well largely rants as a
Biden hater (someone
with BDS). You may ask
all the questions you
like, after all, you are my
pet project.

To answer, yes
extremely proud. Never
in recent memory has a
President had to handle
so many DISASTERS all
at the same time.  Unlike
being handed an econo-
my which was roaring!
These include:

A hostile previous
Regime. An Afghanistan
Disaster, known as the
Doha Agreement, signed
by the Last Criminal
Orange Traitor. A raging
Pandemic, A stalled
economy, raging unem-
ployment, No Vaccina-
tion Plan.  A slow-mov-
ing Coup, based on the
BIG LIE. A hostile GOP
party, AKA the just say
No Crowd. Repairing the
Distrust of our Allies. A
looming financial disas-
ter after the previous
Regime running up of a
Historical 11 trillion in
additional Debt / Deficit.

Only A cult following
Puppet like Paul Minnil-
lo could believe we
were Energy Indepen-
dent one day and Ener-
gy Dependent the next
day.  As if a pipeline
only 8% complete was
the cause?  Most
learned people under-
stand, what we are see-
ing are the aftereffects
of a Global Pandemic.  I
am not sure what they
program you with on
Right wing propaganda
Media these days. How-

Unemployment now at
4.6%! Economy added
531,000 in October!
(More than any single
month under the
Orange Clown). New
Unemployment Claims
at 269,000 (pre-pandem-
ic lows). Other good
news:  ~ 60% Fully Covid
vaccinated and ~ 70%
one dose. Nice job Pres-
ident Biden!

Steve Homsey
Londonderry
–––––––––––––––

Remembering Veterans

To the editor,
On this Veterans Day,

November 11, 2021, we
extend our appreciation
and thoughts to our
active duty military per-
sonnel, and we pay trib-
ute to the many millions
of veterans who have
served our country over
the past 246 years. We
also wish to memorialize
the passing this year of
our brother-in-law, Com-
mander Barry Rowe; and
acknowledge the other
veterans of the Jones
and Moskowitz families
who served during
major wars from the
Civil War to the War On
Terror.

During the Civil War
1st Sargent John B.
Jones (Elizabeth’s grand-
father) and Corporal
William E. Jones (Eliza-
beth’s great uncle) were
in the 5th New York Cav-
alry Regiment from
upstate New York within
the period 1861 to 1865.
They fought in many bat-
tles, including the
Orange Court House,
Brandy Station, The
Wilderness, Spotsylva-
nia Court House, Cold
Harbor and Gettysburg.

Donald’s grandfather,
Pvt. Max Moskowitz,
served in the U.S. Caval-

Londonderry Times welcomes letters of up to 500 words on topics of local interest, and prints as
many letters as possible. Please e-mail your letters to the Londonderry Times at londonderry-

times@nutpub.net. All letters must include the writer’s name, address and phone number for veri-
fication if needed; name and town of residence will be printed. Londonderry Times reserves the
right to reject or edit letters for content and length, and anonymous letters will not be printed.

ever, the pandemic is
still raging around the
Globe, so buckle up.

And Please… on the:
Value of American Lives.
I know that you people
have “No Number”.
Whether it is School
Massacres or People
dying of Covid, it does
not phase people like
you. 

I understand there is
an endless stream of
Brainwashing, Propa-
ganda and Hate from
Right wing Media these
days. From their lips to
your ears, it would
seem. Another Example:
The $450,000 payments
in the other post last
week. Best answer
would be what Presi-
dent Biden told Faux’s
Puppet reporter: Where
do you people come up
with that garbage? What
was meant is this is
another DISASTER
which Biden needs to
handle.  There is a law-
suit from the Parents of
the Children Separated
during the last Criminal
Regime. From Tactics
similar to what Nazi’s
did at the death Camps.
Biden is open to a set-
tlement vs. Hundreds of
individual lawsuits.

So, whether it is the
Horrible Betrayal Deal
Orange Rump Stain did
with the Taliban, or you
are angry or upset
about the settlement
with parents of separat-
ed children; If you voted
for or supported the
Lying, Criminal, Traitor-
ous, Deranged, Lunatic,
Un Patriotic, Un Ameri-
can, Unconstitutional,
Lawless, Authoritarian
Driven Orange Clown.
Take a look in a Mirror,
the person staring back
at you, is the one to
blame!

For those not in the
Paul Minnillo Cult:

Editorial
Every year around this time,

we begin to get letters with
requests for donations for warm
clothes, winter accessories, food,
gift cards, and new toys to help
people who are less fortunate get
through the holidays and colder
months. 

This year may prove to be
even more challenging, with the
list of those in need becoming
more extensive. With the econo-
my as it is and no end in sight, the
lack of items and the increase in
cost of just about everything
along with the high prices of at
the pump, electric, water, gas, oil
and taxes changing. 

We all hear the “Bells” this
time of year, whether it’s a
request for a monetary donation,
a food item, a gift in answer to a
request of an ornament on a Giv-
ing Tree, or a concert admission
benefiting a certain cause, fund
drives are seen everywhere as
the holidays approach. Even
schoolchildren get lessons in
helping others as they collect
change or canned food for their
less fortunate friends. 

There are many different
groups out there that will focus
on nationwide issues related to
the children in all kinds of situa-
tions; veterans and there needs,
the elderly, while others I will

who call angels’ zoom in on those
in their own hometown. The
angels who focus in on communi-
ty where very dime and items col-
lected go to people in our town –
state. 

We are lucky to live in towns
with angels that appear to help-
ing in every facet weather they
are donations or working at a
fundraiser. 

The economy sure is
changeling, but so is the pandem-
ic. We always seem to find a way
to help each other though diffi-
cult times. Like the song states
“Whatever doesn’t kill you makes
you stronger” words to live by.

For those of us fortunate
enough to have jobs or a retire-
ment income that allows us to
pay our bills and give our family
some extras, we invite you to
consider the requests for help
that highlight the coming holiday
season. 

Anything can help; some extra
food, a pair of gloves and
scarves, or a toy for a child who
might not get one. These are all
small sacrifices to make in light of
the help and happiness they will
bring. 

And that’s truly part of the
spirit of the holiday season. It is
truly a gift, having the means to
give.

In the Spirit

continued on page 6
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ed moving the location
to in front of the Moose
Hill Kindergarden in an
area used for pumpkins.
The bench project went
so well that the group
will be able to get two
benches that we will be
placing in the garden in
the spring. 

In May, the GREEN
Team we had its first
plant sale, at the Loins
Hall Pavillion, This was
another effort to raise
money for the Pollinator
Garden. The two fund-
raisers raised enough
money to buy the seeds
for a meadow that was
planted and turned out
to be very abundant this
year. This wild flower
meadow is the start of
our pollinator garden. 

The group is now
accepting reservations
for its next fundraiser, a
“Swag Night” at the Lon-
donderry Lions Hall,
where they are currently
conducting meeting.
The event will take place

on Sunday afternoon,
Dec. 5 from 3:30 to 6
p.m.

At the Swag Night
event families are asked
to donate $20 per family
and the team will supply
all the cuttings and
materials for holiday
swags. They will also
provide instructions on
how to make a swag for
residents front door this
holiday season if need-
ed. The group will be
there to help you put
together arrangements
with local cuttings. 

The Green Team
holds monthly meetings
upstairs at the Lions
Hall at 6:30 p.m. on the
third Thursday of every
month, anyone interest-
ed is welcome to attend.

The Green Team of
Londonderry has a mis-
sion of promoting per-
sonal and environmental
well-being through edu-
cation, advocacy and
experiences involving
the natural world and

Local GREEN Team Continues its Environmental Efforts
CHRIS PAUL
SUBMISSION————–––––————–◆

It has been over a year
since the Londonder-
ry GREEN Team

formed and the group
has pretty busy over
that amount of time.

It started with a holi-
day basket sale in
December of last year,
raising money to help
but seeds for the Com-
munity Butterfly Garden
the hoped to plant.

At the time, Andy
Mack senior had given
his permission to the
group to plant their gar-
den adjacent to the Kent
Allen Forest, across
from the Historical Soci-
ety Museum on Pills-
bury Road.

The group also held a
community plastic bag
collection whish would
allow the group to get a
free TREX(r) bench for
the butterfly garden.

After the sale of
Moose Hill Orchards,
the new owner suggest-

the arts.
They are a group of

residents who want to
promote gardening
awareness in the com-
munity and to build rela-
tionships between fami-
lies, friends and neigh-
bors. Along with pro-
moting education, con-
serving our natural
resources so, we may
become better caretak-
ers of our air, water,
forests, land, wildlife
and there habitats for
the benefit of future gen-
erations.

The Green Team
hopes to: Stimulate the
knowledge and love of
gardening; Promote,
encourage, foster and
cultivate interest in gar-
dening and art; Encour-
age civic beautification;
Assist in projects for the
conservation of natural
resources; Cooperate
with other groups in fur-
thering the interests of
conservation, arts, hor-
ticulture and environ-

ment; Promote exercise
and enjoyment of the
outdoors; Provide relax-
ation and alleviate
stress through personal
and group endeavors;

Connect people in neigh-
borhoods throughout
the town; and Encourage
inter-generational and
inter-cultural interac-
tions and learning.

Members of the GREEN Team recently harvested
seeds from the butterfly garden near Moose Hill

Kindergarten. Photo by Chris Paul
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Michelle Elizabeth Carpentier
Michelle Elizabeth Carpentier,

45, of Londonderry, NH, passed
away Monday Nov. 1, 2021 sur-
rounded by her loving family at
Parkland Medical Center, Derry,
NH. She was born on Dec. 2, 1975

in Woburn, MA, the daughter of Albert and
Catherine R. (Shaw) Carpentier. Michelle
worked as the Office Manager for Case in Point
for over 20 years. She loved taking photos,
especially of nature, up until she was no longer
physically able. She also loved animals and
doted on her two kitties, Bessie and Daisy who
will miss their human mom. Michelle was a life-
long Pearl Jam fan, having travelled across the
country to attend over 30 of their concerts. She
was a loving aunt to her only nephew Dillon.

In addition to her mother Catherine, she is
also survived by her brother, Al Carpentier of
Londonderry; her cherished nephew, Dillon
Carpentier; an aunt, Mary Carpentier of Mesa,
AZ; an uncle, George Shaw of Hudson, MA, as
well as many cousins and extended family.
Michelle will also be sadly missed by her cher-
ished friends and support system, Peter and
Susan Carl, Karen Taylor and Kate Lee.

Calling hours were held on Sunday, Nov. 7,
in the Peabody Funeral Homes and Crematori-
um. A Mass of Christian Burial was celebrated
on Monday Nov. 8 in St. Jude Parish, with burial
following in Pillsbury Cemetery, Hovey Rd.,
Londonderry, NH. Memorial contributions may
be made to Kitty Angels, PO Box 638, Tyngs-
boro, MA 01879 or a favorite animal shelter. To
send a condolence or for more information,
please visit, www.peabodyfuneralhome.com.

OBITUARY

Specializing in Kitchens, Bathrooms
and Home Remodeling Projects

603-432-8599 • applewoodconstruction.net

“Honesty, 
Integrity &
Attention to 

Detail”

ry (Roughriders) in
1898 during the Spanish
American War.

During World War I
Alton Christmas Jones
(Elizabeth’s father) and
William Howard Jones
(uncle) served in the
USMC and saw action at
Belleau Wood, Chateau-
Thierry, Aisne-Marne,
and Meusse-Argonne.
William Howard
received the U.S. Silver
Star and the French
Croix De Guerre medals
for his “action at Blanc
Mont Ridge on October
3, 1918 where he held
off a German attack
using a machine pistol.”

Donald’s father, Sid-
ney Moskowitz, was a
machinist who repaired
ships at the
Charlestown, MA Naval
Shipyard during WWII.
Elizabeth’s cousin, Bar-
ney O’Neil, was a U.S.
Army infantryman who
landed in Normandy in
June 1944. Bob Rosen-
blatt (Donald’s relative)
served in the Army at
the end of WWII.

Barry Rowe (Don-
ald’s brother-in-law)
was a Commander in
the U.S. Navy who
served during the Kore-
an War and the Vietnam
War. 

John Jones and
Edward Jones (Eliza-

beth’s brothers) served
in the late 50s and early
to mid 60s , John U.S.
Army and Edward,
USMC. Donald Mosk-
owitz was an E5 in the
Navy in the 50s and then
was a Vietnam era veter-
an in the 60s serving as
a Navy officer on 13
ships. Robert Nichol
(Elizabeth’s cousin) was
a platoon leader in Viet-
nam from 1969 to 1970.
He was in the 1st
Infantry Division and
the 101st Infantry Divi-
sion. During his Vietnam
service he was awarded
the Silver Star, two
Bronze Stars, and two
Purple Hearts.

Michael Gerard (Don-
ald’s and Elizabeth’s
son-in-law) was an Air-
man First Class, USAF in
the early 80s. Jeffrey
Ammons ( Donald’s
nephew) served as an
Army officer during the
War On Terror.

We must continue to
remember all of our vet-
erans who have served
our country in times of
peace and war. 

Elizabeth (Jones)
Moskowitz

Donald Moskowitz
Londonderry
–––––––––––––

There’s Something Hap-
pening Here

To the editor,
I want to call your

attention to the impact
of the current proposed
redistricting of our Con-
gressional Districts. As
many of you are already
aware, our Congression-
al District is one of the
most heavily contested
in the country. Fre-
quently changing from
one party to the other.
The current proposed
plan would essentially
make our district an
almost automatic
republican district
while the other would
be an almost automatic

Letters
Continued from page 4

democratic one.
This isn’t good for

New Hampshire. It is a
national plague. We
have too many seats in
the Congress that are
more responsive to
their political party
than to the voters. We
see the gridlock in Con-
gress every day. I, for
one, want my represen-
tative to care what I
want and think. I want
them to have to work
for my vote. Please
write or call the gover-
nor and our local state

representatives and tell
them we don’t want
politicized districts.

Jim Green
Londonderry
–––––––––––––––

Thank you to the Lon-
donderry PD

To the editor,
Last weekend, I inad-

vertently left my cell
phone on top of my car,
at night, and it fell off in
the road along 102
between Dunkins near
Crossroads Plaza and
Dominoes when did a
find my iPhone.

I called the LPD and
they sent officer Rafael
Ribeiro to meet me at
the Dominoes parking
lot. I showed him my

cell phone location from
my daughter’s phone
and he walked the road-
side and found it for me.

I then notice my
debit card must have
fallen out in that same
location and so he went
back out again and
found it for me.

I am so grateful for
his support, a special
thanks to him for his
service and kindness. 

Too often I read neg-
ative news about police
officers and it would be
nice to have something
positive.

And again big Thank
You to officer Rafael
Riberio for all his help 

Sarah Lynch
Londonderry, 

Richard J. Theriault, Jr.
Richard J. Theriault, Jr., 59, of

Londonderry, NH, passed away
peacefully Sunday Nov. 7, 2021 at
his home surrounded by his loving
family. He was born in Methuen,
MA on Aug. 31, 1962, a son of the

late Richard J. Theriault, Sr. and Faye (Norris)
Theriault. He had been a resident of London-
derry for the past 31 years, formerly residing in
Lawrence, MA. Richard was a graduate of
Methuen High School, Class of 1980, and then
attended Northern Essex Community College
for business management. He was employed as
a lawn care specialist for Tru Green. Richard
was an avid hiker and was a proud member of
the AMC Four Thousand Footer Club. He loved
being outdoors, enjoyed playing guitar, and
spending time with his family. 

He is survived by his loving wife of 35 years,
Kathleen (Mannuccia) Theriault of Londonder-
ry; two sons, Justin Theriault and his wife Britt
of Newton, NH, and Nicholas Theriault of Pep-
perell, MA; two brothers, Robert Adams and his
wife Linda of Merrimack, NH, and George
Adams and his wife Nancy of Atkinson, NH; his
sister, Brenda Boddy Michaud and her husband
Denny of Methuen, MA; as well as several
nieces and nephews. He was predeceased by
his brother, Joseph Adams. 

Following cremation, a celebration of life
will be held at a later date. Memorial contribu-
tions may be made to the Glioblastoma Founda-
tion, PO Box 62066, Durham, NC 27715, or at
https://glioblastomafoundation.org/get-involve-
d/glioblastoma-donations?gclid=EAIaIQobCh-
MIkNDxz6iJ9AIVi7rVCh24ygV-EAAYASAAEgLB1-
vD_BwE. The Peabody Funeral Homes and Cre-
matorium of Derry and Londonderry are assist-
ing the family with arrangements. For more
information, please visit, www.peabodyfuneral-
home.com

OBITUARY
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Great Rates, Great Coverage
and Local Service! 
t

WHITTEMORE 
INSURANCE

Home • Auto • Business
Part of the Londonderry community since 1929.

–––– 432-2577––––
24 Hour Quotes at www.whittemoreins.com

Hicks Insurance, Inc., dba Whittemore Insurance

1 ROCKINGHAM ROAD
RT. 28, LONDONDERRY, NH 03053

TEL: 603-432-5245 • FAX: 603-432-0191
WWW.BROTHERSAUTOBODYNH.COM

Lifetime warranty on all repairs
We meet by accident - 

crash in for quality repairs
Family owned & operated for 38 years

It’s YOUR car, 
YOUR choice of repair shops.

SPECIALIZING IN COLLISION REPAIR

Wayne A. Hall 
Wayne A. Hall went home to be

with his Jesus on Nov. 6, 2021. It was
unexpected and God only knows
why so soon. He will be greatly
missed by his wife, Kristy L. Hall,
family, and friends. 

A funeral service will be held on Friday, Nov.
12 at 11 a.m., at the Manchester Christian
Church, 56 Old Bedford Rd., Bedford, NH 03110. 

In lieu of flowers, memorial donations may be
made to Harmony Home Ministry, P.O. Box 4094,
Manchester, NH 03108. 

Arrangements are in the care of the Carrier
Family Funeral Home, 38 Range Rd., Windham,
NH 03087. To leave a message of condolence,
please visit www.carrierfuneralhome.com.

OBITUARY

headed by the Caregiver
Action Network (CAN).
NFCM is a time for rais-
ing awareness of care-
giving issues, educating
communities, and in-
creasing support for
family caregivers. 

CAN works to sup-
port caregivers by pro-
viding them with practi-
cal help and information,
helping to reduce both
day-to-day and financial
stress, advancing care-
giver recognition and
appreciation, and build-
ing caregiver confidence
through education. 

According to CAN,
there are more than 90
million Americans who
care for loved ones with
chronic conditions, dis-
abilities, diseases, or
who provide elder care.
All of these selfless indi-
viduals work around the
clock to ensure that their
loved ones are in the best
health possible, often
pouring all they have into
the ones they care for.

This year's NFCM
campaign theme is call-
ed #CaregiverAnd, the
idea behind which is to

encourage family care-
givers to celebrate the
passions and interests
that enrich their lives
outside of caregiving. 

"Far too often your
role as a family caregiv-
er overshadows your
identity and emphasizes
the care you provide for
your loved one." says
CAN's web page further
explaining 2021's theme. 

Though many of
them would likely report
feelings of accomplish-
ment and relief from pro-
viding their loved ones
with care, many care-
givers have found giving
care during the pandem-
ic to have a significant
impact on their physical

November Has Become National Family Caregivers Month
MELISSA BETH RUIZ
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

As the community
continues on into
November, even

throughout nearly two
years of troubles, each
and every person is
bound to find at least a
handful of things to give
thanks for. 

Family can usually
be found fairly high on
the list of things people
are thankful for. For
those with an illness or
disability with family
members who care for
them, it could be said
that they might be twice
as thankful.

Family caregivers per-
form a multitude of tasks
on a daily basis to care
for their loved ones,
often working well into
the night and even being
on call as they sleep. And
yet, despite their selfless-
ness, family caregivers
often go without the
recognition they deserve. 

The month of Nov-
ember is National Family
Caregivers Month (NFCM),
an observance spear-

and mental health. 
In "Family Caregiving

During the COVID-19
Pandemic," an article
published by The Geron-
tologist in April 2021,
data showed that the
challenges of caregiving
have been exacerbated
by the COVID-19 pan-
demic. The article con-
cluded that family care-
givers should receive
increased support as
the pandemic continues. 

Burnout is a great
risk as a family caregiv-
er, which is why spend-
ing time in a hobby or
interest is a crucial part
in being the best care-
giver one can be. 

The American Associ-

ation of Retired Persons
(AARP) states that over
time, caregivers can risk
undergoing wear and
tear causing them to feel
exhausted, listless and
unable to cope. In fact,
burnout can get so seri-
ous, AARP says, that it
could cause caregivers
to make mistakes that
could possibly endanger
a loved one, such as mis-
managing medication.

Furthermore, burn-
out can cause caregivers
to try to manage stress
in unhealthy ways, in-
cluding turning to smok-
ing or abusing alcohol. 

Caring for loved ones
is an important role, but
those who care for oth-

ers need to care for
themselves. As the say-
ing goes, no one can
pour from an empty cup. 

This November, fami-
lies with family care-
givers should take time
to express gratitude for
their loved ones do for
their other loved ones.
Families might even like
to find out how they
might help them to make
sure they take time for
themselves for their men-
tal and physical health. 

For more information
on the Caregiver Action
Network, and for more
caregiving resources in-
cluding help for specific
types of caregivers, visit
caregiveraction.org.

food insecurity in our
town could get assis-
tance.

∫• St. Gianna’s Place.
Donated to support this
organization which pro-
vides housing, counsel-
ing, and training to young
mothers in distress

• Step-Up Parents.
Rotary supports this
organization which in
turn supports families
that need family mem-
bers and friends to ‘step
up’ when parents of chil-
dren cannot support
their families.

• Londonderry Baby
Bibs. Working with Town
Clerk, Sherry Farrell,
Londonderry provided
funding so each new
baby born in London-
derry gets a Londonder-

ry bib.
• Scholarship.  Again

this year Rotary award-
ed a $12,000+ scholar-
ship to a deserving LHS
graduating senior.  Rot-
ary has provided over
$125,000 in scholarships
to LHS graduates over
the past ten (10 years. 

Tickets for the raffle
are $10 each or 3 for $25.
The drawing will be held
on Dec. 15, at 7 p.m., at
our evening meeting at
the Coach Stop restau-
rant, Mammoth Rd.,
Londonderry. Drawing
will be for FOUR prizes.

◆ ◆

Londonderry ‘Rotary Saves Christmas’ 
Londonderry Rot-

ary Club is running
its “Rotary Saves

Christmas” raffle throu-
gh Dec. 15, 2021. All
funds raised through the
raffle will be directed
back into our communi-
ty to support charities,
those in need, scholar-
ships and more. Just in
2020 and 2021 London-
derry Rotary has done
the following in support-
ing the Rotary motto,
“Service Above Self”:

• Sponsored the LHS
Senior Banners on Mam-
moth Road for our 2021
LHS graduates

• Donated to the St.
Jude Food Pantry

• Food Insecurity:
Rotary set aside funding
to insure those facing

Top prize will be $2,000.
There will be a second
prize of $1,000. There
will be two third prizes
of $500 each. To get tick-
ets, text Mike Dolan at
774-245-2279; call Faye
Sell at Martinelli Travel
at 603-434-4989; or visit
Londonderry Rotary Fac-
ebook Page. Please sup-
port Londonderry Rot-
ary, which in turn sup-
ports our community.

Service Above Self
Po Box 451. London-

derry, NH., 03053,
www. londonder r y ro -
tary.com
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dents. Those attaining
membership partake in
rigorous dance training
and are exposed to a
wide range of perform-
ance types including
classical and contempo-
rary music and staging
and theatrical work-
shops. In addition,
NEDE members benefit
from the opportunity to
collaborate with high-
profile dancers from
national and interna-
tional performance
companies.

Company members
have each been cast in
NEDE’s two upcoming
professional perform-
ances of ‘The Nutcrack-
er’, scheduled for Satur-
day, Nov. 27 and Sunday
Nov. 28 at 2 p.m., at the
Windham High School
Theater in Windham,
NH. Rehearsals are cur-
rently underway at
NEDE’s home studio,
Londonderry Dance
Academy.

Join Clara and her
Nutcracker Prince as
they battle the Mouse

Londonderry Dancers Earn Roles in NEDE’s The Nutcracker
Talented young dan-

cers from more
than 12 Southern

New Hampshire and
Massachusetts dance
studios auditioned for
roles in the New England
Dance Ensemble’s per-
forming company on
September 19. 

80 dancers, ages 5-18,
earned membership in
the well-known and
highly regarded non-
profit arts organization,
including 23 Londonder-
ry residents.

In this full-scale pro-
fessional holiday pro-
duction, aspiring dan-
cers will be joined by
guest artists from Phil-
adelphia Ballet including
Sterling Baca, Sydney
Dolan, Pau Pujol, and
Gabby Mesa.

Known for its profes-
sional caliber, NEDE pro-
grams offer growth op-
portunities for the
region’s most dedicated
performing arts stu-

King and embark on a
journey through the
Land of Sweets to meet

the Sugar Plum Fairy.
Tickets may be pur-
chased online at

www.nede.org or by call-
ing 1-800-595-4TIX. Tick-
ets on sale now.

Evelyn Godbout, Gillian Rosen, Elizabeth James, Caitlin Batts, Cassidy Riedel, Abigail Bailey, Ipeksu
Yucel, Zoe Harrigan, Paige Stanley, Thomas Machnik, Bianca Fonseca, Aubrey Patles, Annabelle

Ackerson, Madelyn Murray, Isley Morrison, Belle Acevedo, Aisling Cassidy, Abigail Machnik Eleanor
Bahr, Gemma Silva, Madison Hoffman, Karlie Acevedo, Hazel Bahr. Courtsey Photo
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◆ ◆

LONDONDERRY SPORTS
◆ ◆

Lancer junior Andrew Kullman was wide open
when he caught a ball at midfield and ran for a

61-yard touchdown. Photo by Chris Paul

CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

The Londonderry
High School Foot-
ball team is head-

ed to the NHIAA Division
I Semifinals after a con-
vincing win over their
cross-town rivals Pinker-
ton Academy on Satur-
day afternoon, Nov. 6.

The Lancers scored
in each of the four quar-
ters that afternoon and
finished with a 25-13 vic-
tory.

The LHS squad will
now be faced with de-
feating the only team
they lost to this season.
The Salem High School
Blue Devils won their
quarterfinal match-up
with Bishop Guertin by
scoring a staggering 61-
points, at home, Satur-
day night.

The Lancers won the
game despite being
called for 13 penalties
resulting in a total loss
of 90-yards. 

Londonderry kept
the Astros scoreless in

the first quarter, forcing
a three-and-out in the
first PA drive to start the
game. Pinkerton’s punt
put Londonderry at the
midfield point to start
their day. 

Londonderry’s sec-
ond play of the game
was a 33-yard touch-
down run by junior
Andrew Kullman, but the
play was called back for
a holding penalty. Two
more penalties followed
in the opening drive and
despite the infractions
the Lancers marched
down to the nine-yard
line, where junior quar-
terback Drew Heenan
ran in for the touch-
down. Junior LHS kicker
Dylan Wrisley missed on
the extra point and the
Lancers led 6-0.

Another PA drive was
stopped quickly by the
Londonderry defense,
despite a long kick
return by Pinkerton’s
Jacob Albert.

The Astros fourth
down attempt was foiled

by a Hayden Austen
tackle in the backfield
for a loss, giving LHS the
ball at their own 33-yard-
line.

After another holding
penalty interrupted their
second drive of the
game, Heenan and Kull-
man combined for a
huge passing play. 

With 1:22 left in the
opening quarter, Heenan
completed a 61-yard
unobstructed over-the-
shoulder catch down the
middle of the field to
Kullman for the second
touchdown of the game.
The point after attempt
by Wrisley was good for
the 13-0 lead.

Pinkerton had a good
drive to end the first
quarter and to begin the
second to cut their
deficit to six-points. PA
quarterback Nathan
Campos completed a 13-
yard pass to Logan
Gokey and Picasso Bates
kicked the extra point to
put the game at 13-7.

Pinkerton was able to

Lancer Football Squad Defeats Astros in Quarterfinal

scoring in the first half
with the extra point for a
20-7 Lancer lead despite
nine LHS penalties.

The PA defense tight-

ened up in the second
half and only gave up
five points.

The first was a 23-

keep LHS out of the end
zone in the following
drive, in part by more
penalties against the
Londonderry offense
and also with a foiled
fourth down pass at-
tempt in the enzone.

The Londonderry
defense kept PA to mini-
mal yardage in their next
drive and got the ball
back at their own 35-
yard line with about
three-minutes in the
half.

Sophomore Jake
Schena started that
drive with a 65-yard
touchdown run that was
called back for a block in
the back penalty.

Another pass com-
pletion from Heenan to
Kullman, this time on
third down and ten
resulted in a 65-yard
touchdown at 1:15 in the
second. The score came
from a screen pass at the
Lancer 35-yard line with
Kullman getting about
55-yards after the catch.
Wrisley capped off the continued on page 11

(603) 965-3411 

Not Fast Food...Fresh Food Fast!

ORDER AHEAD & SKIP THE LINE!

CURBSIDE DELIVERY AVAILABLE!
WWW.TROYSFRESHKITCHEN.COM

FULLY OPEN & READY TO SERVE YOU 

25% OFF
FOR ALL

VETERANS
ON NOV. 11

VETERANS DAY SPECIAL

 



◆
PA G E 10 LO N D O N D E R RY TI M E S ◆ NOVEMBER 11, 2021  

320 Sandown Road, Unit 2, East Hampstead
CALL FOR MORE INFORMATION

781-816-3766 OR 603-552-0194

SPECIALIZING IN
Brazilian Jiu Jitsu • Muay Thai

Cardio Kickboxing • MMA

ONE WEEK FREE TRIALONE WEEK FREE TRIAL

Like us on Facebook & follow us on
Instagram for more information

MARTIAL ARTS & FITNESS CENTER

Athletes of the Week
Week of Nov. 1

Nate Pedrick
Junior, Football

Nate has quietly flown
under the radar this season
behind defensive seniors, Riley
Boles and Colby Ramshaw.
Nate has been invaluable to the
success of one the top defens-
es in the state. The middle line-
backer of the defense, tallied
6.5 tackles and a tackle for loss
in the last game. He has led the
team in tackles in 7 of 10 games
this season. 

Mary Croteau 
Sophomore, Golf

Mary had a phenomenal
season in her first year as a
member of the Varsity Golf
team and was instrumental in
the team qualifying for the NH
State Tournament.  Mary played
in the NH State Girl’s Tourna-
ment where she finished in the
top 10 (8th overall), allowing
her to qualify for the New Eng-
land Regionals held at the
Mohegan Sun Resort where she
performed admirably. 

Student Athletes supplied by Athletic Department

CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

The Londonderry
Varsity Cheerlead-
ing squad compet-

ed in the New Hamp-
shire Interscholastic
Athletic Association’s

Division I State Champi-
onship over the week-
end and finished in the
number five spot out of
16 high school teams.  

The Pinkerton Acade-
my Astros Spirit squad
regained their status of

Division I Champions,
taking first after having
to sit out last year’s com-
petition. 

The NHIAA Division I
Fall Spirit State Champi-
onship Tournament was
hosted by Pinkerton
Academy on Sunday
morning, Nov. 7, and the
Astros edged out last
year’s championship
team, Dover High
School, by just 1.7
points.

The PA girls finished
the championship with
105.1 points. Dover fin-
ished second with 103.4
and Concord was third
in the division with
101.3.

The Londonderry
Lancers squad had 94.7
points for fifth and the
Salem High School team
finished with 95.6 points
in fourth place.

Fans from all over the
granite state filled the
stands of the Hackler
Gymnasium with a room
full of energy and excite-
ment cheering on each
three-minute routine
that was performed.

In the last 11 years,
the Pinkerton squad has
won nine fall titles, Lon-
donderry beat them
back in 2017 and PA did-
n’t compete last year

Lancer Cheerleaders Take Fifth Place at State Championship

kin, Madison Gehris,
Isabell Roy and Kennedy
Brown; sophomores Isa-
bella Chick, Brenna Lan-
gley, Angelina Mochrie,
Emily Oullette, Haley
Sibley, Kathleen Grassis

and Madison Wholley;
and freshman Eva Sesin.

The team’s head
coach Chelsea Dennis
was assisted this year
by Nicole Otis and Ste-
fanie Medrek.      

due to COVID-19.
Members of the LHS

team are: Seniors,
Brooke Bodkin, Ava
Campbell and Madison
Oulette; juniors Sarah
Abladian, Makenzie Bod-

12 Parmenter Road, Unit 3C • Londonderry
Gabby@Lekasedgar.com • (603) 434-2889 EXT 105

Personal & Business 
Tax Preparation

SEEKING: Office Admin

Lekas, Edgar & Co.

Responsible for supporting accounting staff with various administrative
tasks that can work independently in a fast-paced work environment. We
are a small firm with flexible schedules and room for growth.

Responsibilities include:
• Completing various administrative tasks
• Responsible for daily communication with clients via email or phone calls
• Scanning and packaging tax returns
• Prepare excel spreadsheets and/or QuickBooks files 
• Assist in Financial Planning document retention and submittal 
• Scheduling appointments for our staff
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CHRIS PAUL
LONDONDERRY TIMES————–––––————–◆

The Londonderry
High School Fresh-
man Football team

had an amazing finish to
their 2021 season. The
young squad was able to
go un-defeated in eight
games over the course

of the season and fin-
ished with a big 36-14
win over Winnacunnet
High School on Thurs-
day, Oct. 28 at Lancer

LHS Freshman Football Squad Finishes Season Undefeated
freshman team from
Pinkerton Academy 14-0.

The team was man-
aged by head coach

Michael Bicchieria and
assistant coaches Ken
Sharkey and Ted Gear. 

Courtesy photos

Park. 
One of the major

highlights this season is
when they shutout the

carried the ball three
times for 24-yards.

With the win, Lon-
donderry will host the
semifinals against Salem
on Saturday afternoon
starting at 1 p.m.

Londonderry lost to

the Blue Devils 35-21 in
Salem on Oct. 22 in part
due to five turnovers
through interceptions
and hope to correct that
and the penalty issues
they had in the quarter-
final win.

◆ ◆

Football
continued from page 9
yard field goal by Wrisly
giving LHS a 23-7 lead in
the third.

The Astros got the
score to within 10-points
to end the third quarter
with a 52-yard touchdown
run for Jacob Albert. 

Londonderry’s only
other points came from
their defense, foiling a
Jacob Albert pass
attempt out of the end-
zone with a Michael
Sampson tackle.

Londonderry had
361-yards of total
offense in the game and
PA was held to just 230,
189 of the those yards
came through the air for
Londonderry. 

Kullman had 126
receiving yards in two
catches to lead the team
and Salcito had one
catch for 52-yards.

Heenan kept the ball
17 times and got 74-
yards on the ground,
Matthew Perron added
35-yards in five attempts
and Trevor Weinnmann

27 Buttrick Rd, Londonderry, NH • Rte. 102
HOURS: Mon. – Fri. 8 A.M. to 6:30 P.M.
Sat. 8 a.m. to 6 p.m. • Sun. 8 a.m. to 4434-1444

Now Taking Orders for 

Fresh TURKEYS!
(All natural, No Preservatives OR Antibiotics.

Gluten Free. All sizes from 10lb. to 30lb. available)

Order Early at 434-1444 
Company Orders Welcomed!

Side Dishes Also Available
to Complete Your Dinner. 

Call for More Information.

–––– NOW HIRING ––––

Sales People • Cashiers
Full/Part Time/Flexible Hours/Mothers Hours/Retires Welcome

To Apply Call 434-1444 or Stop In
GREAT Place to Work, Great Pay

EXPERIENCED
Kitchen Deli Manager $25

Up to
Per
Hour

Lancer junior Nathan Pedrick picked up a short
kick off in the second half of the quarterfinals.

Photo by Chris Paul 

PERSONAL INJURY
You don’t have to go to Boston or Manchester to get the best lawyer

MILLIONS RECOVERED FOR CLIENTS
Auto Accidents, Drunk Driving Victims, Medical & Pharmacy Mistakes, Construction

Accidents, Motorcycle Injuries, Aviation Accidents, Other Accidents and Injuries

4 Birch St. 
Derry, NH

(603) 437-2643

89 Main St. 
North Andover, MA

(978) 691-5453

Law Offices of
Andrew D. Myers

www.attorney-myers.com
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219 Rockingham Rd., Londonderry

www.reallycold.com
603-421-9525

PLUMBING AND WELL PUMP SERVICES CO. LLC

ALL TYPES OF SYSTEMS • FINANCING AVAILABLE

Time to Upgrade Your Heating System 
• FREQUENT BREAK DOWNS?
• MUTLPLE COSTLEY REPAIRS? 
• WATER DDRIPPING/LEAKING? 

CALL JOHN 603-391-4639

When the annual
Macy’s Thanksgiving
Day Parade steps off on
Nov. 25 in New York City,
over 100 jump rope ath-
letes from across the
country will participate
in the pageantry of the
Parade. Featured in the
Parade will be jumpers
representing 25 teams
from 21 states through-
out the nation. 

Included among the
jumpers will be local ath-
letes from Extreme Air of
New Hampshire Katelyn
O’Neill of Londonderry,
Eilis McKenna of New
Market, Malia Everett of
Exeter, and Margaux
Freer of Portsmouth. 

This will be a return
to the traditional Parade
throughout Manhattan,
after last year’s virtual
parade that kept the
Parade record intact
during the pandemic.

Organized by the Heart-
beats Jump Rope Team
in Cleveland, Ohio, the
group will appear under
the acronym J.U.M.P.
(Jumpers United for
Macy’s Parade). Jump
Rope is a competition
sport that has been fea-
tured on television on
NBC’s “America’s Got
Talent,” ESPN Sports,
Fox Sports, and other
programs. 

This will be the fifth
time for this group to
appear in the Macy’s
Thanksgiving Day Par-
ade. It will be the first
time for athletes on the
Extreme Air. 

Jumpers will be per-
forming many tricks and
skills in unison as they
jump their way along the
parade route to the
delight of visitors and
New Yorkers who will
line the streets 20 deep

and fill windows and bal-
conies along the streets
overhead. 

Starting from Central
Park, the athletes will be
jumping the entire 2.8
mile course that winds
through New York City in
front of a huge spectator
crowd and millions of
viewers of the NBC live
telecast of the Parade.
To jump the entire dis-
tance, the athletes have
to be in peak physical
condition. Months of
practice will culminate
with the cadenced steps
that will be seen across
the country live from
New York City. What an
adrenaline rush! 

After arriving at the
fabled Herald Square in
front of the Macy’s Flag-
ship Store, the group will
be featured in a live one-
minute segment broad-
cast on NBC national tel-

Local Athletes Jump in the 2021 Macy’s Thanksgiving Day Parade 

join the ensemble, each
paying their own way to
New York City and train-
ing in Ohio. Included in
the group will be many
athletes who have
earned recognition as
national and internation-
al champions. All of the
athletes have been prac-
ticing for months in their
local community with
their team to learn the
routines, and prepare
and build their

endurance for the
Parade. 

Members of JUMP
are male and female,
ranging from 12 to 26
years old. Jump Rope
routines feature gymnas-
tics and dance moves,
all done while jumping a
rope. Athletes build
great foot skills, tremen-
dous upper body
strength, powerful
endurance and superior
coordination. 

evision with an estimat-
ed 50 million viewers.
This choreographed TV
routine, built around the
112 athletes performing
a complex inter-connect-
ed double-Dutch matrix,
flanked on both sides by
a single-rope routine,
will include national and
world jump rope cham-
pions. 

Athletes were invited
from jump rope teams
across the country to

Granite State athletes Katelyn O’Neill, 15, of Londonderry, Margaux Freer,
15, of Portsmouth, Eilis McKenna, 15,  of New Market, and Malia Everett,
17, of Exeter will be jumping/performing in the Macy’s Parade along side

more than 100 talented jump rope athletes. Courtesy photo
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AROUND TOWNAROUND TOWNAROUND TOWN
Around Town Policy: This section is meant to be used to announce free events to the communities. If
your group is receiving money for what they are publicizing, there will be a charge of $40/week per
paper. All Around Town/Calendar Items will be held to 100 words maximum. All free announcements in
the Around Town/Calendar section can run a maximum of three weeks. Deadline for submissions is
Monday at 5 p.m. Please send items to londonderrytimes@nutpub.net. 

Swag Night
The Green Team is now

accepting reservations for
its next fundraiser, a “Swag
Night” at the Londonderry
Lions Hall. The event will
take place on Sunday after-
noon, Dec. 5 from 3:30 - 6
p.m. At the Swag Night
event families are asked to
donate $20 per family and
the team will supply all the
cuttings and materials for
holiday swags. They will
also provide instructions
on how to make a swag for
residents front door this
holiday season if needed.
The group will be there to
help you put together
arrangements with local
cuttings. 

St. Thomas Toy Sale 
The St. Thomas Used

Toy Sale held at St.
Thomas Church in Derry
has begun gathering gently
used toy donations within
the community. This year’s
sale will be Dec. 4 in the
gym of the Aquinas Center
behind St. Thomas Church
on Crystal Avenue in
Derry.  There will be thou-
sands of items to choose
from. The doors open at 9
a.m., some parents line up
to get great deals while
others come simply to be
able to provide gifts for
their kids on a low income.
The sale concludes by
noon with plenty of toys
leftover. This year those
left behind toys will be
donated to the Manches-

ner on Nov. 14 from 2 - 2:30
p.m. at Church of the Tran-
sfiguration (DECOFT)/ Eli-
jah's Table (EHS); Lunch
on Nov. 20, from noon -
12:30 p.m., at St. Luke's
Church- drive around to
back door; Dinner on Nov.
26 from 5 - 6 p.m., at First
Parish Church- drive up to
side door; Breakfast on
Nov. 28, from 9 - 9:30 a.m.,
at Church of the Transfigu-
ration (DECOFT)/Elijah's
Table (EHS); Lunch on Nov.
28, from 1:30 - 2:30 p.m., at
St. Jude's Parish;  Sonshine
Soup Kitchen will be serv-
ing drive by to go meals on
Mondays, Tuesdays, Wed-
nesdays and Thursdays
from 4:30 - 5 p.m.

Veterans Day Dinner
On Nov. 11, American

Legion Post 27 will hold a
Veterans Day Dinner host-
ed by the Sons of the Amer-
ican Legion ay 5 p.m. Locat-
ed at 6 Sargent Rd in Lon-

ter Housing Authority to
be given to families in
need.  Incredibly, the bene-
fits of the toy sale continue
on.  The money raised by
the sale goes directly to
two nonprofit charities:  St.
Thomas Church Outreach
ministries, including the
food pantry and St. Gian-
na’s Place- a home for
pregnant women in crisis.
Toys can be donated
through Dec. 3.  Drop-off
locations are St. Thomas
Church, 27 Crystal Ave,
Derry, St. Matthew Church
Windham, St. Anne Church
Hampstead, and 5 Isabella
Drive in Londonderry. Toy
sale is cash only.  

Floral Design Workshop
The Londonderry

Women's Club will be hav-
ing a floral design demon-
stration and workshop on
Wednesday, Nov. 17, from
6 - 8 p.m. The presenter,
Sylvia Roberts, is a Co-
President of the Derry Gar-
den Club, has been an MFA
Art in Bloom designer and
has participated in several
Flower Shows including
the Boston Flower Show.
The theme will be “Design-
ing with Greens for the
Holidays”.  Nonmembers
are welcome.  If you are
interested and want more
information, please con-
tact us at info@londonder-
rywomensclub.org

Free Meals
Please join us for free,

family-friendly meals. Din-

donderry (behind the fire
station on Mammoth Rd.) 

Karaoke Night
American Legion Post

27 will hold a Karaoke with
DJ Sharon on Nov. 12, from
7:30 - 11 p.m. Non-mem-
bers interested in joining
Post 27 are welcome to
attend. Located at 6 Sar-
gent Rd in Londonderry
(behind the fire station on
Mammoth Rd.) 

Dinner and a Show
On Nov. 13, American

Legion Post 27 will host a
Comedy show and dinner
to help homeless veterans
at 6 p.m., Located at 6 Sar-
gent Rd in Londonderry
(behind the fire station on
Mammoth Rd.)

Vets Breakfast
The American Legion

Post 27 will host a Veter-
ans Breakfast provided by
the Sons of the American
Legion on Nov. 14, at 10
a.m., Located at 6 Sargent
Rd in Londonderry (be-
hind the fire station on
Mammoth Rd.)

S.A.L. Turkey Shoot 
On Nov. 19, the S.A.L.

Turkey Shoot will be host-
ed by the American Legion
Post 27 at 7 p.m. Come in to
win your Thanksgiving tur-
key or other meats. Located
at 6 Sargent Rd., in London-
derry (behind the fire sta-

tion on Mammoth Rd.)

Need a Tutor? 
Work one-on-one with a

volunteer tutor. Free Tutor-
ing is o ered for a variety of
programs including Adult
Basic Education, Adult High
School, and English as a Sec-
ond Language at Derry Cen-
ter for Adult Studies. Cover a
variety of content areas,
Flexible days and hours, Ses-
sions held via Zoom and/or
in-person. If you are inter-
ested in receiving tutoring
services, please email
kcapistran@sau10.org for
more information. 

LHS Mattress Fundraiser
The Londonderry Music

Mattress Fundraiser is com-
ing Sunday, Nov. 14 from 10
a.m. - 4 p.m. at Londonder-
ry High School. There will
be 25+ styles of beds on
display to try. In addition
to beds, there will also be
premium pillows, luxury
sheets and adjustable power
bases. Every purchase bene-
fits LHS music department.  

Yoga Session for Senior
The Londonderry Sen-

ior Center offers yoga class-
es to the senior communi-
ty. Barbara Scott and Lisa
Kress conduct an eight-
week series of affordably
priced yoga classes. These
classes are designed espe-
cially for seniors to help
increase balance, flexibili- Continued on page 15

ty, and strength, as well as
maintaining well-being. Class-
es take place at the Lon-
donderry Senior Center,
535 Mammoth Rd., Lon-
donderry on Tuesdays
and Thursdays from 9 - 10
a.m. You may sign up for
either the Tuesday or
Thursday class - or both.
Next session begins the
week of Nov. 15. Registra-
tion for new students
begins Nov. 8. Payment is
required at time of regis-
tration. For more details
call the Senior Center at
432-8554.

Share a Story with
Library Friends 

New videos will be
available to watch on
Thursday, Nov. 18 at 10
a.m. Drop by the Leach
Library Facebook page to
share a quick story with
library friends. 

Young Adult Book Talk 
On Monday, Nov. 15, at

10 a.m., a virtual book talk
for teens will be available on
the Leach Library Facebook
page, blog, and YouTube
channel. Miss Megan will
share her young adult short
story recommendations. 

Story Time
On Monday, Nov. 29, at

10 a.m., join Miss Jennifer
for a “Leaves Are Falling”
story time! The video will

280 Derry Road, Chester, NH 03036

Open 7 Days a Week, Now thru Nov.
9 a.m. - 6 p.m.

Farm Stand
NOW OPEN

PICK YOUR
OWN

APPLES

www.HazeltonOrchards.com
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Continued on page 15

Monday - Nov. 1
1:09 a.m. Welfare Check
investigated by three offi-
cers on Whittemore Road.
8:48 a.m. Criminal Mis-
chief investigated at Ex-
ecutive Health Sports Cen-
ter on Highlander Way.
10:31 a.m. Arrest(s)
made for Juvenile Offens-
es on Norwich Place.
10:41 a.m. Assisted the
Londonderry Fire De-
partment with services
on Judy Drive.
11:26 a.m. Suspicious
Activity investigated on
Pine Street.
3:44 p.m. Criminal Thre-
atening investigated on
Mammoth Road.
4:25 p.m. Peace restored
by three officers after a
Disturbance at VIP Dis-
count Auto Center on
Garden Lane.
6:10 p.m. Fish & Game
Violations investigated at
Pinkerton & Pillsbury
Cemetery on Hovey Road.

Tuesday - Nov. 2
3:32 a.m. Assisted the
New Hampshire State
Police with services on

southbound lane of
Route 93.
10:17 a.m. Services ren-
dered for a Drone Flight
at Pinkerton & Pillsbury
Cemetery on Hovey Road. 

Wednesday - Nov. 3
9:17 a.m. Services ren-
dered for Suspicious Act-
ivity on Colonial Drive.
2:34 p.m. Warrant serv-
ed and arrest made on
Tyler Ave at Nashua.
Boreli Gonzalez, 44, of
Haverhill, Mass., Charg-
ed with Conduct After an
Accident.
3:25 p.m. Services ren-
dered for Larceny/Forg-
ery/Fraud at Avis Car
Rental on Airport Road.
8:07 p.m. Suspicious
Activity investigated by
six officers at Macgregor
Cut Apartments on
Stonehenge Road.
10:02 p.m. Eight officers
attempt to serve a war-
rant on Bayberry Lane.
11:27 p.m. Services ren-
dered for Suspicious
Activity at Red Arrow
Diner on Rockingham
Road.

Londonderry Police Log
Selections from the Londonderry Police Logs

Thursday - Nov. 4
12:11 a.m. Warrant serv-
ed and arrest made on
Dove Lane. Oleg Novin-
skiy, 47, of Manchester
charged with Contempt;
and two counts of Bail
Jumping.
8:39 a.m. Services ren-
dered by four officers
for Suspicious Activity
on Hillside Avenue.
9:27 a.m. Services ren-
dered for a Disturbance
at 7-Eleven on Rocking-
ham Road. 
1:36 p.m. Suspicious
Activity investigated on
Commerce Avenue.
4:44 p.m. Medical Emer-
gency at the Manchester
Boston Regional Airport
transported to a hospital.
5:56 p.m. Warrant serv-
ed and arrest made by
16 officers on Bayberry
Lane. Brendon Daley, 38,
of Londonderry was ar-
rested on a Warrant and
charged with two counts
of Resisting Arrest/De-
tention.
10:25 p.m. Suspicious
Activity investigated on

◆ ◆

National/Regional Listings
Find Ads From Around New England and Across the Country

◆ ◆

National/Regional Listings
Find Ads From Around New England and Across the Country

EDUCATION
Train online to do medical
billing! Become a Medical
Office Professional at CTI! Get
trained & certified to work in
months! 888-572-6790. The
Mission, Program Information
and Tuition is located at
CareerTechn ica l . edu/con-
sumer-information. (M-F 8-6
ET)

HEALTH & FITNESS
Viagra and Cialis Users! 50
Generic Pills Special $99.00
Free Shipping! 100% guaran-
teed. 24/7 Call Now! 888-445-
5928 Hablamos Español

Dental insurance - Physicians
Mutual Insurance Company.
Covers 350 procedures. Real

insurance - not a discount
plan. Get your free dental info
kit! 1-888-623-3036 www.den-
tal50plus.com/58 #6258.

Attention oxygen therapy
users! Inogen One G4 is capa-
ble of full 24/7 oxygen delivery.
Only 2.8 pounds. Free info kit.
Call 877-929-9587.

Stroke & Cardiovascular dis-
ease are leading causes of
death according to the AHA.
Screenings can provide peace
of mind or early detection! Call
Life Line Screening to schedule
a screening. Special offer 5
screenings for $149. 1-833-
549-4540.

MISCELLANEOUS
The Generac PWRcell solar

plus battery storage system.
Save money, reduce reliance
on grid, prepare for outages &
power your home. Full installa-
tion services. $0 down financ-
ing option. Request free no
obligation quote. 1-855-270-
3785.

Generac Standby Generators
provide backup power during
power outages, so your home
& family stay safe & comfort-
able. Prepare now. Free 7-yr
extended warranty $695 value!
Request a free quote today!
Call for terms & conditions. 1-
844-334-8353.

Eliminate gutter cleaning for-
ever! LeafFilter, the most
advanced debris-blocking gut-
ter protection. Schedule free

LeafFilter estimate today. 15%
off Entire Purchase. 10%
Senior & Military Discounts.
Call 1-855-995-2490.

Directv Now. No Satellite.
$40/mo 65 Channels. Stream
news, live events, sports & on
demand titles. No
contract/commitment. 1-866-
825-6523.

New authors wanted! Page
Publishing will help self-pub-
lish your book. Free author
submission kit! Limited offer!
866-951-7214.

AT&T Internet. Starting at
$40/month w/12-mo agmt. 1
TB of data/mo. Ask how to
bundle & Save! Geo & svc
restrictions apply. 1-888-796-
8850.

Bath & Shower Updates in as
little as One Day! Affordable
prices - No payments for 18
months!  Lifetime warranty &
professional installs. Senior &
Military Discounts available.
Call: 855-761-1725.

Donate Your Car to Veterans
Today! Help and Support our
Veterans. Fast - Free pick up.
100% tax deductible. Call 1-
800-245-0398.

Update your home with beauti-
ful new blinds & shades. Free
in-home estimates make it
convenient to shop from
home. Professional installa-
tion. Top quality - Made in the
USA. Free consultation: 877-
212-7578. Ask about our spe-
cials!

Long distance moving: Call  for
a free quote from America’s
Most Trusted Interstate
Movers. Let us take the stress
out of moving! Speak to a relo-
cation specialist 888-721-
2194.

HughesNet - Finally, super-fast
internet no matter where you
live. 25 Mbps just $59.99/mo!
Unlimited Data is Here. Stream
Video. Bundle TV & Internet.
Free Installation.  Call 866-
499-0141.

DISH TV $64.99 for 190 chan-
nels + $14.95 high speed inter-
net. Free installation, smart HD
DVR included, free voice
remote. Some restrictions
apply. Promo expires 1/21/22.
1-833-872-2545.

Looking for assisted living,
memory care, or independent
living? A Place for Mom sim-
plifies the process of finding
senior living at no cost to your
family. Call 1-833-386-1995
today!

Stop worrying! SilverBills
eliminates the stress & hassle
of bill pmts. Household bills
guaranteed to be paid on time
as long as appropriate funds
are available. No computer
necessary. Free trial/custom
quote 1-855-703-0555.

WANTED TO BUY
Wants to purchase minerals
and other oil and gas interests.
Send details to P.O. Box 13557
Denver, CO 80201.

◆ ◆

Classified Advertising 
◆ ◆
READERS ARE CAUTIONED that we occasionally run ads that require an initial investment or money in advance. We urge our
readers to “do their homework” before responding to any ad, check out the advertiser thoroughly and verify their claims to your
total satisfaction. Only then should you proceed at your own risk. We try to screen ads that require you to send money before
receiving a product or service. But these efforts are no substitute for your own investigation, and we don’t endorse or guarantee
any claims made in any of the ads we publish. If you want more information about claims made in ads on subjects such as work
at home opportunities, travel or vacation specials, purchasing land or vehicles from government surplus or below wholesale,
loans or other credit opportunities (including credit repair), or weight loss and other health products and services, we urge you
to contact the Office of Attorney General, Consumer Protection Bureau, 33 Capitol Street, Concord, NH 03301 (603-271-3641) or
the Better Business Bureau at 603-224-1991. Publisher is not responsible for any loss of business if an ad does not run,
and we reserve the right to revoke any ad if deemed necessary. No refunds will be given for prepaid ads.

◆ ◆

Local Classifieds
LOCAL LISTINGS FOR LOCAL READERS

CLASSIFIED ADS
$100 PER WORD

Ad will run in Three Newspapers and Reach
Homes in Londonderry, Derry, Chester, 

Hampstead, and Sandown!

Deadline for placing ads is Monday at 3 p.m. 
for that week’s publication. 
ALL ADS MUST BE PRE-PAID 

$15 MINIMUM CHARGE
Minimum charge does not include bold type.

e-mail text to:
classifieds@nutpub.net

Call: 
537-2760 

WANTED
Call 537-2760 to place your Help
Wanted ad for just $1.00 per word!
Reach five towns.

FIREWOOD
Seasoned firewood, Cut, Split, and
Delivered. $325 a cord. Call
(603)434-1212.

MASONRY
Michael's Masonry: Specializing in
repair work: steps, walkways, walls
basements, & stone work. Free esti-
mate call 421-0686 
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Chapparel Drive.

Friday - Nov. 5
8:10 a.m. Larceny/Forg-
ery/Fraud investigated
at Student Transporta-
tion of America Inc. on
Mammoth Road.
10:22 a.m. Criminal
Threatening investigat-
ed on Alexander Road.
10:55 a.m. Services ren-
dered for Suspicious
Activity at ECCO USA on

Delta Drive.
2:03 p.m. Assault inves-
tigated on at the Lon-
donderry Middle School.
4:37 p.m. Identity Theft
investigated on Victoria
Drive.
6:15 p.m. Medical Emer-
gency at Aertec on Com-
mercial Lane transport-
ed to a hospital. 
6:14 p.m. Sudden Death
investigated by six offi-
cers on Timber Street.
9:48 p.m. Services ren-
dered for Disorderly Con-
duct at the Manchester

◆ ◆

Police Log
Continued from page 14

Boston Regional Airport.

Saturday - Nov. 6
1:05 a.m. Three officers
assisted the Londonder-
ry Fire Department with
an investigation on Eglin
Boulevard.
10:14 a.m. Assisted Derry
Police with Services on
White Plains Avenue.
10:21 a.m. Warrant ser-
ved and arrest made on
Main Street in Manches-
ter. Jonathan Moses, 28,
of Manchester charged
with Driving After Revok-

ed/Suspended License.
11:24 a.m. Sudden
Death investigated on
Eglin Boulevard.
11:36 a.m. Services ren-
dered for Criminal Mis-
chief at Starbucks on
Nashua Road.
2:29 p.m. Three officers
assist with the transport of
an Assault victim to a Hos-
pital on Harvey Road.
4:04 p.m. Three officers
assist the Londonderry
Fire Department with an
investigation on Inde-
pendence Drive.

7:03 p.m. Welfare Check
by three officers results
in the transportation to
a hospital from on Field-
stone Drive.
9:57 p.m. Domestic Dis-
turbance investigated by
eight officers on Mam-
moth Road.
10:52 p.m. Peace rest-
ored by four officers
after a Domestic Distur-
bance on Constitution
Drive.

Sunday - Nov. 7
1:32 p.m. Suspicious

Activity investigated at
Mack’s U-Pick on Adams
Road.
3:43 p.m. Domestic Dis-
turbance leads to an
arrest made by three
officers on Rockingham
Road. Sayda Marina Vel-
azquez Urbina, 41, of Lon-
donderry, chargd with
two counts of Domestic
Violence (Simple Assault
- Physical Contact).
4:16 p.m. Burglary
investigated on Mam-
moth Road.

Nov. 18, from 7 - 8:30 p.m.
at 78 Litchfield Rd., Lon-
donderry. Members, friends,
and affiliates meet to col-
laborate and activate efforts
to elect Republicans. Think-
ing about running for of-
fice? Come meet and learn
from those who know what
it takes to be a successful
candidate. Learn what is

happening at the NH State
House. For more specific
meeting information con-
tact, LRC Chair, Liz Thom-
as at eathormas@com-
cast.net. 

Parenting of Teens Class
The Upper Room is

offering a class for parents
and caregivers of Teens.

Around Town
Continued from page 13

Active Parenting of Teens
is a course that covers;
respectful discipline, skills
for clear and honest com-
munication, strategies to
prevent risk behaviors,
and how to be an encour-
aging parent as the frame-
work. This Free course is
being offered through Nov.
30, virtually so that par-

ents can take it when they
are able to at home. To reg-
ister call Michelle Moraros
at 603-437-8477 x122, to get
a link for the class.

Football Meals
At the American Legion

Post 27 a team of people is
cooking, smoking or frying
food each Sunday during

be available to watch on the
Leach Library Facebook
page throughout the fall. 

Republican Meeting
The Londonderry Rep-

ublican Committee (LRC)
will be meeting Thursday,

football season. Members
and guests are welcome to
attend and the cost is $5
per person. Post 27 is locat-
ed at 6 Sargent Rd., London-
derry (behind the fire sta-
tion on Mammoth Road).
For more information see
www.alpost27.com. 

◆ ◆

SERVICE DIRECTORY
◆ ◆

We Work All Year!
Snow Removal Offered

www.snhqualityroofing.com
603-818-4075

God Bless

Defrancesco’s
Southern New Hampshire

––– QUALITY –––
ROOFING, SIDING & CONTRACTING

Asphalt, Metal & Rubber Roofing 
Siding • Windows • Doors • Additions

Senior
Citizen & 
Veteran

Discount

JUNK CARS • SCRAP METAL
“If It’s Metal, We’ll Take It”

For more details call:

S&S Metals Recycling Inc.
603-537-1000 or       877-537-1007
196 Rockingham Rd., Londonderry, NH

TOLL
FREE

PICK UP SERVICE AVAILABLE

FULLY INSURED • FREE ESTIMATES

SPECIALIZING IN SMALL TO MIDSIZE JOBS

David Kwiatkowski 
Home Improvements

603-486-1310

www.dkhomeimprovements.com

HANDYMAN AND 
HOME IMPROVEMENT

DRYWALL • PAINTING • SMALL JOBS
KITCHENS, BATHROOM & BASEMENTS

FREE ESTIMATES 
FULLY INSURED

603-965-5208
jcdugan55@gmail.com

• Interior Painting 
• Toilets & Vanities
• Sheetrock Repair  
• Sinks & Faucets

• Moldings 
• Laminate Flooring
• Deck Repair
• And Much More...

603-216-2593
www.ethicalhomepro.com 

Servicing your Heating, Air Conditioning & Water
Heater needs the right way, The Ethical Way

Experience The Grand Difference

(603) 552-7152
Locally Owned & Operated 

www.NHGrandRoofs.com

Derry
ROOFING

Roofing Installation
& Repair; 

Gutter Work
ALL TYPES OF ROOFING!

Shingle • Solar • Copper • Wooden Shakes 
Rubber Roof • PVC • Tar & Gravel • Snow Removal

603-479-8862
www.DerryRoofingLLC.com

Leaf Relief

Cleaning &
Maintenance

Free Estimates

Commercial/Residential

Soffit/Fascia Repairs
Jim Peck
603-434-5300

www.jimpeckco.com

Go
Seamless

SCOTT LAVOIE CONSTRUCTION LLC
ROOFING • SIDING • MASONRY
ROOF SNOW & ICE REMOVAL

FULLY INSURED
FREE ESTIMATES

1-603-434-8910
1-603-571-8688

ScottLavoieConstructionLLC.com

SCOTT LAVOIE




